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CARZ AUTO SERVICES'PTE ¥R
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L elephiine Fax:
Mike' Mol - TOYOTA WACE Dhate. 1122019
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| Dater Tieme of Accident : W1172019 17:30 L/s=2,660
|Materials Cost/ Spare Parts Cost 4 day,
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Qi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: alex@carzauto.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 7 January, 2020 9:19 AM

To: Qi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: GBH B376 Y AFTER REPAIR PHOTO
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Mr 01 Sun Pin

We are able to accepted your offer . Thanks

All Document who should we send too ?
Please advice

Best Regards

Alex

~—Original Message—

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2020 9:07 AM

To: gle:@caﬂautg.ggm.gg

Subject: RE: GBH 8376 Y AFTER REPAIR PHOTOD
Dear Alex,

Kindly refer the finalize amount $2,650. Repair day 4 days, (L/S, before gst).
If agree please update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Qi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Emall: Sunpin@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5{408933)

——0Original Message-—

From: aiex@cartguto.cgm.;g |maiitn:ate:@gr:ag;g,cgm.;g]

Sent: Monday, 23 December, 2019 1:46 PM
To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc '[gslxn@carzag;o.cum.sg

Subject: GBH 8850 Y AFTER REPAIR PHOTO

Hi Mr Sun Pin
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Typs:

Owrer ID:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Cobour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis New:

Maximum Power Outpuat.
Open Market Value:

Original Regrstration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Pald:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Ellgibility:

PARF Eligibillty Expiry Date:
PAHF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date-

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infarmation contained hereln is correct as at 18 Dec 2019
5, 506k12 = 455,77
Lo §11 X oGz 48 5%]

My = Iﬂiill’tp&]_

PARFICOE Rebate Enquiry

Company
BOSG

GEHBITSY

Mo

18 Dec 2019

TOYOTA
HIACE VAN TURBO SDR MT
Sllver

2018

1KD2826393
ITFHTO2PT00245079
528.134.00

150ct 2018 / 3:)-” 16 hthy / 166k
15 0ct 2018

0

§1,407.00

Na

$0.00

14 Oct 2028

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

527.104.00
$23,908.00
£23908.00

OK

hitips I/ fa_gov sg/tanriiactionienguireRetateBy PublicBeforeDereginput ?FUNC TION_D=FO304006TT

1
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N LKK Aufg Comsultants hence notily
SN CARZ AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD e
L-" —-*":] LEN/ GST 2014094870, ¢, ol NIV
-_ Carz Auto / 61 WOODLANDS IND PARK E9 (E9 PREM mmmm "'579'!? el
—_ Email: alex@carzauto comag  Tel: 65 6493 1924, hp.fﬁi {n‘lﬂ'.l Jﬂ.l- wiout Praudice” basm
Insuranee Company:  FWD Singapore Pte Lid e Loapay
Address: & Temusek Boulevard, #18-01 Sustee Tower Four, Singapore 038986 . '
Telephone: Fax:
Make' Model © TOYOTA HIACE Date: 10/1272019
Chussis No JTFHTOZPTO0245079 Vehicle Nex GBI B37h Y
Drate Time of Accldent : W1172019 1730
Materials Cost/ Spare Parts Cost
TO BE COMPLETED BY SERVICE ADVISOR
! e . : o ! . PARTS , :
ITEMS DESCRIPTION (LIST PARTS) QTY | LISTPRICES [ o oiney| FINALPRICES
) SLIDING DOOR LH s~ P B 161540 2% |8 1.211.55
2 SLIDING DOOR HINGE LH « fur € 1|3 17490 | 2% | S 13118
3 SLIDING DOOR LOCK LH Lt E o040 | 2% |8 IR205
1 REAR FENDER LH . PD K 1.162.6% 2% |3 87199
TOTAL LIST PARTS COST AFTER DISCOUNT| § 2,596.76
Labour Work / Panel Beating Related Works
Job Scope Quomiion
TO REMOVE AND RENEW REAR DAMAGED PARTS:REPLACE REALIGNED ALL AFFECTED PARTS S fgxs  ROOO0
Spray Painting
lob Scope LIoLEtion
TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS s 500 Moo
Labour Works
Joh Scope Qunimiion
TO TUFFCOAT AFFECTED AREA $ Poy 15000
1O REMOVE/ REFIX INTERIOR UPHOLSTERY $ 50 10000
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE SLIDING DOOR MECHANISM 50 | $ E 100.00
OTHER LABOUR COST| § 350,00
- GRAND TOTAL| $ 1,446.76
Repar r‘}u,j - U Juujj [ |
Ul“b F-Hh ﬂ;rl.-!'f
: U ARy A DM i }
CARZ AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD pu J?h v
Person Incharge: Ma Jeslyn Chim
Jish Title: Motor Claim
Mobile: 65 §322 7418 )
Email: jeslynimcareauio. com.sg S""‘"‘ Fin (Llk)
11/ 1/ i

funr‘;n CALLTICT
Tf‘a—f‘ﬂ*hdvﬂjl.dﬁ ¥661 262+

!’Wﬂ!ﬁ Page 1 of 2



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (csaegne 1ssssr1ssm
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
mn-urum 408533
Tel 6256-3561 Fax 8844-8805 Emall sur@lkkauto.com assignmentsi@ikkauto.com

To FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

& Temasek Boulevard 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

#18-01 Suntec Tower 4 Paya Ubl Industnal Park

Singapore 038986 Singapore 408933
Attn.  Lionel Tan Date; 23 Dec 2019

Preliminary Advice

Insured Vehicle No . SLUS814G
TP Vehicla No GBHBATEY Accident Date 28112018
Maks TOYOTA DYNA 160 Assignment Date 13122019
Date of Inspection | 171212019 Est. Duration of Repair 4 days
Inspaction At ‘ Carz Auto Services Pta Lid - Woodlands (HQ)

NO 61, WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK EB, #04-04 E2 PREMIUM SINGAPORE 757047
Singapore 757047

Paint of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicke sustained impact / damages .. N/S. . portion and parts claimed are consistent to the acoident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) £ 4 445.78
Revised Amount 5% 3,383 54
Check ltems (Estimated) 55 0.00
Total 55 3.363.54
Lump Sum Repair 88

Total Loss Considaration

New for Old Value
Pre-Accident Value
COE / PARF Rebate
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

28224

Remarks

( §  The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.
Kindly et us have your autharisation,

{ ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( X ) Other comments Ve have not authonized repairs



i Nivitha gl.l{l{ Auto! (

From: venessa.chan@fwd.com
Sent: Friday, 13 December 2019 9:52 AM
To: ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com’; ‘admin-a@Ikkauto.com’
Ca motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; lionel.tan@fwd.com
Subject: Request Surveyor for pre-repair inspection Our Ref: GBHB376Y Your Ref: 5LU9814G
Attachments; PRI GBHB376Y pdf
10-39am@ 1313w

Nivi
Dear Nivitha, p: Jes fgn
Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for PRS, v N In Il
Please create the case in Merimen. QWL?_ an H“ |2 H
Kindly upload all correspandence emails/documents sent to you into Merimen.
Thiank you.
Best Regards,

\ T
S A | an

Administrative Assistant, Claims

FWD

insurance

FWD Singapore Pte. Lid,

6 Temasek Boulevard. #18-01 Suntec Tower Four. Singapore 038986
E venessa.chania fwd.com

W www fwd.com.sp

A Sl i
m Enjoy cashiessmadical outpalient dalm il o

ol ] Smgagore panel cluncs and waridwite ST ETQEny e
: sasistance with FWD Fryer mobils sige ] ‘e 4

From: jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg [mailto:jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2019 4:17 PM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Ce: alex@carzauto.com.sg

Subject: Request Surveyor for pre-repair inspection Our Ref: GBH8376Y Your Ref: SLU9814G
Hi Sir

Good Afternoon

Please arrange surveyor for pre-repair inspection.
Please conduct the survey at 61 Woodland Industrial Park E9 #04-04 (Premium 9) Singapore 757047,

Thank You.



With Regards,
Jeslyn Chua
~ HP: 8322 7418

CARZ AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

LA Bl b |m“mnmnm—nmum
mm:ﬂu-x |“mmtnuwﬁr‘~rm—1¢um

AL S P e WY M, Sl el |y A SR R e e e U
L s L L T e ——" n-uw-H-I-nuﬂ-quHw-wruﬂn‘-n.ﬂh-

Carz Auto

SIEVICES

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Lionel Tan Tian Pei - SGUser <lionel. tan@fwd.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 9:47 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 1201900037225 *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19022010/Qpa3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SLU 9814G(FWD) AND GBH 8376Y ON 28/11/2019]

Gd morning
You may proceed DS

Regards,
Lionel

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 3:50 PM

To: Lionel Tan Tian Pel - 5GUser <lionel.tan@fwd.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 1201900037225 *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19022010/Qpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LU 9814G(FWD)
AND GBH B376Y ON 23/11/2019]

Hi Lionel,
We refer to our below email.
Kindly assist to upload a copy of insured video in Merimen for our viewing and advise if we may proceed D5.

Thank you.

“Wishing you & Hapyy and Prosperous New Year”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)



From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 2:03 PM

To: llonel.tan@fwd.com
Cc: Admin A < in-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 1201900037225 *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19022010/Qpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 9814G(FWD)
AND GBH 8376Y ON 28/11/2019]

Hi Lionel,

We refer to our below email,

Kindly assist to upload a copy of insured video in Merimen for our viewing and advise if we may proceed D5.

Thank you.

“Wishing you & Hippy and Prosperous New Year

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: fi7g2-3197 | email: chewht@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 27 December 2019 7:52 AM

To: lionel.tan@fwd.com
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Your Ref: 1201900037225 *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19022010/0pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 9814G(FWD)

AND GBH 8376Y ON 28/11/2019)

Your Ref: 1201900037225
Our Ref: CC4/FWD19022010/Qpa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 9814G(FWD) AND GBH 8376Y ON 28/11/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Third party reported that our insured driver dashed out from parking lot and collided with third party vehicle.

Our insured reported that she was adjusting her cat into the lot. When she parked inside the lot, third party came
from her right and hit onto her car front left portion.



Kindly assist to upload a copy of insured video in Merimen for our viewing and advise if we may proceed D5.

Thank you.

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Higyy New Year 20207

Best REE'I'II‘I]S-
Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of
the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the
sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy
or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been
scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



2192020 Merimen a-Claims

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL

;Nn. On  Audit Remarks By
12019 MO Claimants Name: -> - fa e
16:41
13 Dec Cim Veh [A] HOW
2 2019  Model (204479) TOYOTA DYNA 150 3.0 D (M), MET KWAN
16:41 Changed
13 Dec 2 ;
No: GBHEI76Y, Acct Date: 2019/11/28. Claim Type: TR Insurer: FWD Singapore Ple. Lid. (HQ). Wor [A] HOW
3 ';'2,13: ““mﬁmm:nnmmmmm~mmmmm MEI KWAN
13 Dec ,4 co LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ):; R Reglon: FWD - Ext Auto Ad) Assignment. Suggested Ad). : RT Ap [A] HOW
4 ig}:l Assigned  praisal Fie Lid, MEL KWAN
£ 2019 Rpt Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:20159/12/34 MET KWAN
16:41 Changed
b 2019 Mandate  Approved:0,00,Reinsp:Ad) decides, MEL KWAN
16:41 Set
13 Dec
7 2015  Label Added (20005):Direct Sattiement . B! M
16:43
13 Dec Ad) HOW
B 2019 Adjuster [None] == O SUN PIN J:} KWAN
16:'43 Assigned
13 Dec Cim
G 201% Registration ol Mo -=PNPY2018-00016544 - E:'I":ﬂl
1604  Modified
13 Dec Clm (1] Venessa
10 2019 Registration Pol No:PNPVZ018-00016544->PNPV-2018-00016544. Chan
18:04 Modified
11 2019 Advice  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/12/24 it Nl
16:06 Submitted
14 Feb [A] JOANNE
Adj Rpt
12 2020 LEE KHANG
14:2¢ Initisted MIN
14 Feb [A] JOANNE
13 2020 :I:‘m?'l‘:d Claim Conclusion: => 3. LEE KHANG
14:28 MIN
14 2020 Cim oM 0/15 Lt ANG
14 2020 JP] Reg. Date: -> 2018/10/15.
i4:286 Modified MIN
14 Feb [A] JOANNE
152000 e LEE KHANG
14:26 MIN
19 Feb Adj Cur.Req:3342,95LIABILITY: 100%* QUANTUM! (a) CORw/GST: $2,835.50 + (bJLOR: §500.00 (Sdays x  [A] CHEW
16 2020 Mandate  $100) + (c) DISBURSEMENT: $7.45 Total: a+bec = $3,342.95 *VEH MODEL. Toyota Hiace Turbo (2982¢ HSLAD
16:51 Request  c). FOR YOUR APPROVAL/INSTRUCTION. TONG |
Date From 4| > pateTo 4|F®] audit Type | None v 6o
P_crnrrv |
[No record
| Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History _ |
‘ Bill Raf he Bl Dat B e Aer Type r A Mame i -B::r:‘:j Rl 1 Ral 2 Armepurt
FWD WD
13 Dec 2019 TP Case
2376802 frescfye Motor Pte. | Singapore Pte. | GBHB3ITEY L] Yk KX MK
| 18:04:19 (Tnsurer) e, (Ha) La, (HQ)
| LEK Auto LEK Auto
amusats | e | ity ”"T Motor Consultants ‘ Consultants | GBHB376Y | SLUSB14G 11.77
i Pre Ltd Pie Ltd (HQ)
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22412020 Merimen e-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail is associated with ;

*GBHB376Y (1201900037225)
[SLU9814G]

TF
MOMENTS LOFT LOGISTICS FTELTD
Nov 28 2019 5;00PM
|Li Yan]
Carz Aulo Services Ple Lid - Woodlands

From FWD Singapore Pte, Ltd. (HQ) (FWD_SG), sent on 19/02/2020 18:37 PM.

To LEK_HO
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$3342.95) - GBHB3I76Y - Claim Handler: Lionel Tan

Approved:3342.95,

hitps mmm.mmmmimmmwmmnsvﬂmlmmﬂm_mmmnumﬁ? 63356 TACFTOKEN=Te14l42d723a2168-808... 1N



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: alex@carzauto.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 24 February 2020 12:13 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: Request Offer for Vehicle Number: GBHB376Y // DOA: 28/11/2019 //LKK REF:
CC4/FWD19022010/Qpa3

HI Ms Hsiao Tong

We are able to accepted your offer @ $3340/- All In
Please kindly submit to your insurer . Thanks

Best Regards

Alex

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 12:05 PM

To: jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg

Cc: alex@carzauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: Request Offer for Vehicle Number: GBH8376Y // DOA: 28/11/2019 //LKK REF: CC4/FWD19022010/Qpa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $3,340,00{all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materlally affect/influence on the issues
of liabllity/damages, either party ks not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Indostrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg <jeslyn zauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 24 February 2020 11:54 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht(® |kkauto.com>

Ce: alex@carzauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: Request Offer for Vehicle Number: GBHB376Y // DOA: 28/11/2015 //LKK REF: CC4/FWD19022010/Qpa3

Hi Ms Hsiao Tong
Good Aftermoon

Any updated news?
Please let us know as soon as possible.

Thank You.

With Regards,
Jeslyn Chua
HP: 8322 7418

ARZ AUT ERVICES PTE LTD

Rk OTRCE & SLET LD ) W Bl U SR BT e & ST P A T LR B T G ) T
e 0 e R b R B e T L i T AT ] T
AT 0 dhe BT ae & S R T O PR W T AU 8 T
LEED Y RS A LT e L T i L
SERAVICESR T — (L Tt B Nl A ST TRR L
AR i 23
L B F ] - BT e el O el e

From: jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg [mailto:jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 14 February 2020 11:52 AM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: ‘alex@carzauto.com.sg’ <alex@carzauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Request Offer for Vehicle Number: GBHB376Y // DOA: 28/11/2019 //LKK REF: CC4/FWD19022010/Qpa3

Hi Ms Hsiao Tong
Noted.

Thank You.

With Regards,



Jeslyn Chua
HP: 8322 7418

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
Sent: Friday, 14 February 2020 11:48 AM

To: jeslyn{@carzauto.com.sg

Cc: alex@carzauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: Request Offer for Vehicle Number: GBH8376Y // DOA: 28/11/2019 //LKK REF: CC4/FWD19022010/Qpa3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your email.

We will expedite the matter and send you the offer.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liabllity/damages, either party s not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: jeslyn@carzauto.com.sg <jeslyn@car .COMm.sg>
Sent: Friday, 14 February 2020 9:21 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: alex@carzauto.com.sg

Subject: Request Offer for Vehicle Number: GBHB376Y




Hi Ms Hsiao Tong

Good Moming

Please chase insurance settle this with us as soon as possible or you may give us the officer in-charge
contact number or email so that we can contact the officer.

Thank You.

With Regard
Ms Jeslyn Chua
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiemeant

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Hqtdi&q B Submitted meﬂ Mj F_ﬂ Aldj Submittsd Ing Auyth'ed Status
Dec Pending for Survey
. 02 Dec 2019 - doicod $$2,650.00  |5$2,650.00 shisieregy
n it Reg e Act) Fipt I Edit Estmates | Visw Bpt J c 1= I

Main

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by ndjuster] |

Insured; |Li Yan, ID: SE9BIIGOF

g;‘lllﬂl-: MOMENTS LOFT LOGISTICS PTE LTD, Co Reg. No.: 2018258056
vehice Reg [28/11/2015 17:00 - :58
No.: GBHBI76Y Date of Lo%3: |11y Months and 13 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r}]
PHPY- 1 Com 1]
Claim Type: |TP / 1201900037225 Py Pl mm:::mﬂ[_ A2/
Vehicle Reg.
Ho SLUSR14G Polcy Mo | s104649000-01
{Insured): !
Exress:

feoairer. | CATE Auto Services Pte Ltd - Woodlands (MQ) NO 61, WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E9, #04-04 £ PREMIUM SINGAPORE
Pairer 757047, 757047 Woodlands - Tel:

Handing | coun Singapore Pre. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5700 ... [Handled by Lione! Tan]

Ingurer:

E:::f“ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by OF SUN PIN] .. [Final Rpt due 24/12/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case mai |

» FWD_SG (19/02/2020): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$3342.95) - GBHEITEY - Clalm Handler: Lionel Tan

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Sesrch Tasks | Create New Task | Compiete |

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On DoneT
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ds... 5/3/2020



Menmen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*GBHE376Y {1201900037215)

[SLU9814G]
TP

MOMENTS LOFT LOGISTICS PTE LTD

Nov 28 2019 5:00PM
[Li Yan]

Carz Auto Services Pte Ltd - Woodlands

\ipioad Docoments | Upiasd Protes |  composs wew Lener | View [View r Browsar| < ]
Letters/Correspandences liperpage Iv] B
Ne [Finalized On LMK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumtbnall | Print

(1 |(oran) Third Party Express Settiement - Paymant Breakdown Edit
Assessment Reports [1perp ~]| &
fio | Fnalzed On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
I [29/12/19 16:06 | Adjuster Immediate Advice @ | tosa e
Photos/Images Doerpee o]
N | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmail | Print
I #121907:51 | Ddemeter Reading 0| wurs | A
2 |27/12/1907:51 | Chassis Number O wur | B
1 |21712/1907:51 | General View @ | weawc | F
4 |2/12/1907:51 | General View @ | Loed ¥
5 |Z713/1907;51 | Genersl View A/ wuiws | A
6 |27/12/1907:51 | General View 0! wears | A
727112015 07:51 | Genersl View 0| waws | A
B |27/12/1907:50 | General View O | wwwe | B
8 |27121807:51 | Genaeral View €| oadrs | &
10 [IF121907:51 | Genersl View 0 icedwc | A
11 |29 07:51 | Genersl View 0 aws | B
12 |27/12/1507:51 | General View A wars | &
13 |77/12/1907:51 | General View Q| weaws | A
14 |27/12)19 07:51 General View ) | loadiec | &
15 | #@ans 075 Ganeral View 0| ladwc |
16 |77/12/1507:51 | General View Q| weirc | B
17 | 37/12/19 0751 General View 0 | Load #G E
18 | 27/12/19 07:51 General View i wag s | B
19 |7/12/1907:51 | General View 0| wadwc | B
20 |39/12/1907:51 | Ganersl View Q| o | B
21 |(27/12/1907:51 | Genersl View 0| wars | A
22 [(217/12/1907:51 | General View 0| wmews | A
23 |2712/1907:51 | General View @ | wews | A
‘24 |22/12/19 02:51 General View i wad e | B
25 37112190751 | Ganeral View © | eawc | B
26 |19/02/20 15:35 Roinupection Photo 0| weews | A
27 |19/02/20 16:35 | Reinspection Photo O | ocirs | A
28 [19/02/20 16:35 Reinspection Photo 0| weews | A

(28 |19/02/20 18138 Relnspection Photo D | leadic | A

19/02/20 15:35 Relnspection Phato ! Load 3G | B
memnhﬂnn 1 per “ﬁ [+

(hc_| Relabal/Rearder LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (MQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 [13/12/1916:43 | EMAIL - FWD TO 01 DD 13.12.19 © | oacros
2 13/12/19 16:43 | NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP [« B
3 |26/12/19 09:42 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
4 |14/p2/20 1438 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POE
5 14/02/20 14:38 LTA SEARCH Load POF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 5/3/2020
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Letters/Correspondences [Tperpoge [~]| &
Mo | Finakized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd (HG) ! Thumbnall | Print
£ |14/02/2014:38 |LOD Load POF
7 |05/M3/2010:05 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
B 05/0%,/20 10:05 Release Voucher Load POF
9 |08/0%/20 10:05 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF
M | Finslired Cn FWO Singapore Pte. Lid. (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 [13/12/19 18:02 | PRI - CARZ AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD Load POF

2 [13/12/1916:02 | SLUSB14G OI GIA Laad POF

3 |13/12/19 18.0¢ | GBHB376Y TP GIA Lond FOF

4 129/01/20 1412 |Letter of Demand from Third Party Load FDF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST meset | Save | oo |
| There are no document checidists configured

Our - Auto 1

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
MribE . BEmArES B°F PTIVESE UNiESl yus Wi § B UENRS pArties

https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 5/3/2020



Preview

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR

Page | of 1

TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| vehicle No: SLU9814G (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA HIACE 3.0 D
GBHB376Y (TP veh) TURBO 5 DR (M)
| Date of Accident: |28/11/2018

Global Sum Suﬁtﬂn‘wnl| ! I [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate - 4,758.03
Final Repair Cost s 3,340.00
Loss of Use o days at 50.00 per day
Rental (If any) s 5 days
LTA /| GIA Search Fee 5
Others: . 9§
' 8§
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sumj) $ 3,340.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)
A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agraed Liability 100 (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability:

(%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

Assessed Liability (*): {%6)
* Assessed Lishility fo be filled anly far chain callisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

11 |Carz Auto Services Pta Lid -5 3,340.00
2) -5
) %
05 Mar
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2020
LKK Auto Consiltants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Autheorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill {if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_do... 5/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 1seso71ssr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-35681 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkaulo.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/FWD18022010/QPA302

Date: 05/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer; FWD Singapore Ple. Lid. Policy No: PNPV-2018-00016544
Claimant .
Vehicle No : GBHBATEY Insured Vehicle No : SLUS814G
Date of Loss 281172019 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 1201800037225
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GBHB3TEY
Make & Model, TOYOTA HIACE, 3.0 D TURBO 5 DR (M) Engine No: 1KD2826383
Reg. Date: 15/10/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: JTFHTO2PT00245079
Colour: Silver Odometer: 75224 km
Engine Capacity: 2982 cc
Market Valua/New Car N/A
Price
Sum Insured (55): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition;
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185 R15
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 5 mm Rear Left Side Bridgestona 5 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone 5 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 5 mm
The above values represant ffm remamung e reeds depth
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 2,596.76 2,083.54 51322 18.76
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.850.00 1.240.00 610.00 3z a7
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 4 446.76 3,323.54 1,123.22 25.26
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 2,650.00
(S%5) 4 446,76 2,650.00 1,796.76 40.41
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 3127 185.50 125.77 4041
Nett Amount (SS) 4,758.03 2,835.50 1.9822.53 40.41
+ Car Rental (5.0 x $5100.00/day) (5§) 500.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 7.45
Nett Liability (S5) 3,342.95
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 3,340.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 13122019
Date Inspected 1711212019 Inspected Al Carz Auto Services Pte Lid -
Woodlands (HQ)

NO 61, WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL
PARK ES, #04-04 ES FREMIUM

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 5/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

SINGAPORE 757047
Singapore TS7047
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: Ol SUN PIN Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: Thia reparf rapresents our findings af the fime and pisce of ingpection sited hormn. Such nspechion has deen carmed ouf 1o the best of our
inowledge and ability but any other Nabitfy under any otfrer circumsfances is hermby axpresaly axcluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 5/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference
Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronisad: 04 Mar 2020)
|Parts: 213 TOYOTA HIAGE 3.0 D TURBO 5 DR (M) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

\Labour:  Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)
|Print Code: (Unsubmitted. no print-code for GBHB3TEY)

[Validity: These estimales are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltemsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Oty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *SLIDING DOOR LH Dented 1,61540FL *1.61540FL
2 1 *SLIDING DOOR HINGE LH Serviceable 174.90FL *-FL
3 1 *SLIDING DOOR LOCK LH Serviceable 509.40FL *-FL
4 1 *REAR FENDER LH Dented 1,16265FL *1,162.65FL

F=Franchisa part L=ListhemDisc

Sub Total (S5) 3,462.35 2,778.05

- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S%5) 865,58 B94.51

Total Parts (S§) 2,596.76 2,083.54

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 5/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thers are no new miscellansous tems selecied.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE AND RENEW REAR DAMAGED PARTS MNew B0O.00 800.00

REPLACE REALIGNED ALL AFECTED PARTS

2 TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS Mew 700.00 500.00

3 TOTUFFCOAT AFFECTED AREA Mew 150.00 40.00

4 TO REMOVE/REFIX IHTER];I'H UPHOLSTERY New 100.00 50.00

§ TOREMOVE AND REPLACE SLIDING DOOR MECHANISM  New 100.00 50.00
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 1,850.00 1,240.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 5/3/2020



