Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 29 April 2020 5:09 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: GBH1712G - FINALISE & BEFORE PAINT
Hi Shiau chan

confirm.

thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com
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MOTOR & PANELSE

-Please note that all offer/acceptance is made without prejudice.-

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, April 29, 2020 3:49 PM

To: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH1712G - FINALISE & BEFORE PAINT

Dear Sharon,
Can confirm?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 April 2020 2:50 PM

To: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH1712G - FINALISE & BEFORE PAINT




Dear Sharon,
Please refer to the attached.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 April 2020 2:45 PM

To: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH1712G - FINALISE & BEFORE PAINT

Dear Sharon,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer final fig $2,174.00 before excess $450.00 & GST and 5 repair days.
Kindly check and confirm.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 April 2020 2:26 PM

To: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH1712G - FINALISE & BEFORE PAINT

Dear Sharon,
Please ignore previously email.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 April 2020 1:57 PM

To: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH1712G - FINALISE & BEFORE PAINT

Dear Sharon,
Kindly put up the supplementary of FRONT CORNER PANEL $38/- in Merimen System.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Sharon Sng [mailto:sharon@sngahtee.com]

Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 10:30 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: GBH1712G - FINALISE & BEFORE PAINT

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com
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MOTOR & PANELSE

-Please note that all offer/acceptance is made without prejudice.-



