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Policy No.
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Excess:
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repair at the time of inspection.
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ’ Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 December 2019 3:47 PM

To: assignments

Cc: claims-singapore

Subject: [VCO13265] PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION NOTIFICATION - Yr ref: YM 9959K // Our ref:

L.19.1494.It.¢j

,u-ggaw@ IS’JJ’"q

Our ref: VC013265 P ’ft)f\“_Lj
Hi all
Kindly survey the third party claim.

regards

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225

Website LinkedIn Twitter
S QBE

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 12 December 2019 3:41 PM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qgbe.com>

Cc: claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com>

Subject: Re: [VC013265] PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION NOTIFICATION - Yr ref: YM 9959K // Our ref: L.19.1494.It.cj

Dear Sirs

Our client is agreeable to the following surveyor as the SJE: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please arrange for your surveyor to survey our client's vehicle at the following address:

HUAT AUTOMOBILE AIR CON SERVICE
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1

#01-404
Singapore 417921

Tel: Tomy Tan 9137 8893



Please instruct your surveyor to conduct the pre-repair survey immediately and complete the pre-repair
survey within 2 working days of his appointment.

L

Kindly let us have the pre-repair and/or post repair survey report upon completion of the survey.

As solicitors on record, our client shall look to you for payment of our legal costs plus disbursements should
you reach a direct settlement with our client's repairer.

Regards

[rene

Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax: 6532 2007

On Thursday, 12 December 2019, 2:59:15 pm SGT, Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@agbe.com> wrote:

Our ref : VC013265
Dear Lena
We refer to the above captioned matter.

We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle. We propose to use one of the
motor surveyors named in the attached list:

COMPANY

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte

Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priority Services

Infiniti Appraisal Service

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree 1o the appointment of any of these motor
SUrveyors.

regards

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583



+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225
Website LinkedIn Twitter

. OQBE

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 12 December 2019 10:36 AM

To: claims-singapore <claims-singapore@abe.com>; Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>
Subject: Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION NOTIFICATION - Yr ref: YM 9959K // Our ref: L.19.1494 It

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 2244P AND YM 9959K ON 04.12.19
AT/ALONG CARPARK ENTRANCE OF 1 YISHUN STREET 23

NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

We act for Chuan Heng Lee Electrial Company, whose vehicle registration number GBG 2244P was
damaged in the above accident.

A copy of the Singapore Accident Statement filed is enclosed.

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you would
like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle.

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the
vehicle without further reference to you.

Regards,



Lena

Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax: 6532 2007

—--—-———-——IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email
is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

------------------ IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any
disclosure or copying of this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in
error, please promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy
any hard copies produced.



‘w;.‘nanm: Progressive Car Care Ple Lid - HQ
ENTF. W DATE & TIME: 04/12/2019 20:30
SUBMITTED BY: Ng Pei Wen

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NO,TICE

1. Please report corrEclly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form mus! be compleled by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information brovided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to
repudiate pa'icy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is nol an admission of palicy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and thal copies of this report will, for a fee, be made avallable upon application by interested parties

7. By the lodgement of this report to the Insurers, you hereby consenl to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 04/12/2019 20:30

Date Of Accident 04/12/2019 20:15

Exact Location Of Accident 1YISHUN STREET 23 SINGAPORE 768441
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number GBG2244P

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner CHUAN HENG LEE ELECTRICAL COMPANY
Co Reg No 26824700E

Email Address C.H.L.ELECTRICAL.CO@GMAIL.COM
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-98191314

Alternative Phone No OFFICE-98191314

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer MAXUS

Model G10-1.9 (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? NO

If No. Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy NO

Policy Number 1900101388

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver GOH MOH KHOON

NRIC No S0103052C

Date Of Birth 17/11/1953

Occupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 29/06/1993

Driving Experience 26 YEARS AND 5 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-98191314
Fax Number

Cantart Nuimhar



BLK 274 YISHUN STREET 22 #05-156
SINGAPORE

Postcode 760274
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own =
Vehicle =

Address

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY
Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehide§ (including own vehicle) 2
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown person(s)

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. NO
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO THE ATTACH STATEMENT RECORDED BY PEI WEN - PROGRESSIVE CAR CARE PTE LTD TEL 6741 5336
Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Remarks/ Reasons: VIDEO WITH OWNER
Was there any audio recorded? NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number YM9959K

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Name of Driver

NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

KMo MW Dannammne laabidimea MPadooae)
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Sketch Plan

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Hmcmlmmmnedamnnhemdennos.pfmup-mmmum
2. This Form must be compieted b

3. Irfarmation providad Mhuwmw Any witful misresresantation o1 withhoiding of material
fects may 3llow insurance companies to sepudiste palicy fapiiny.

4, The issue and seceplance of this Funmn by insurance companties 3 nat an sémislon of policy labisty on the partof the inursnce
s &1 L

6. Thereport wi¥ be farwarded by the insurers of the GiA Recards Mansgement Coxtre stablishac by the Seneral Insurance
Agsociation of Sirgapere {GIA] for archiving and thut copies of this report will for 3 fea be made avalable usen application Hy
interested parties.

7. By the lodgment of this repor 1o the Insuress, you hereby cONSENT 10 WE srChiving of this (400 af the centre 2nd 1o (oples of
the report being made svailabile sforescid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Adt {PDPA)
1 understand, acknowledge, spree and consent that

(3} Myirsursr, my workshop snd the Genersl imurance Assacistion of Sirgapors {"GIAY) may/ars permitted 1 collect, use,
d stiose and/or procass my persora! data/persanal irfonratan set our in this |form| ana any other pagsonal mfoemation
providet by me o1 possessed by iy lrnurer (collectivaly (he "Personal information™) and disclose and transler such
Persanal information to all insurerfs) who have iraurad vehicte{s) involved in this accident {all insurer{s) who have Insursd
vehicle{s] fnvalved i this sczident shall be coRectavety (efsrred 1o 45 the “Insuress”™), e tosurers’ lwyersflow Mems, e
Monztary Authority of Sligapore sod By eelevant gevemment mgency/suthorlty (such as the palice), for the putposafs!
el

(i} processing, hendilng and/or dealing with my datis inciuging the settlement of the dains and any necesiary
‘mveitigations relating 1o tha clalms.

] Investigating the sctdent andfer my cains;
(i} carryng out and/or deating with mry Isstrustions or respending to any enguiros by me;

(iw} administering my clsims {irc/uting the mailing of :nrrespandanca, statements, invaices, reaors of notires Lo me,
whics coutd invoive disclosure of cortain personst data sbout ine to bring sbout dafivery of the sane 25 wall 22 on Lne
extemal cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

{« complying with appicable bw in adminkitering, processing, handfing and/or dealing with my caims.(oollectivaly the

() aff isureris) who have nsured vehicle(s) mvolved in tais accicent and the insurers’ lawyars/ lew firms, may/ars prrmittes
to callect, use, discloze and/for process my Pessoral Iaformation o ane or mors of tha above Bumposss: and

(] my Personal Infonmation may/can be disclasad by any of the Insurers andfer GIA 1o their third parly servics providas o
agerns{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outslde of Singapore. for nne or more of the above Purposas

(6} ey Persunal Information wil slso be wollected and ued to comple dalms history for th purpese of S detection,
westigabion and managemsant in present and all fubuge claims,

(el  the infoimation o collccted under (d) above may be sres | disclosed

(i} toallinsurers and/or any cther third sarties that assist bn evaluating, investigating, controding or mecaging fraud,
regutors, law enforcement 30d governmant agendies as reasonabily required [ar the purposes stated, or

{7} for comlying with reculrements under any reguiaticns, ws or coust orders,
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12/26/2019

> Back to OneMotoring

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Business
700E

GBG2244p

No

26 Dec 2019

MAXUS

G10 VAN 6AT

Grey

2017
19D4N1RYH124K087
LSKG4GL1XHA044488
$20,744.00

30 Jun 2017

30Jun 2017

0

$1,038.00

No

$0.00

29 Jun 2027

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$36,879.00

$27,689.00

$27,689.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Dec 2019

https:/ivrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT

11



GBG 2244P

1PC
1PC
1PC
1PC
1PC
1PC
1SET
1PC
1PC
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HUAT AUTOMOBILE AIR CON SERVICE

BLK 3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-404 (408701) L & 3900
TEL : 67461868 FAX : 67462065 5/’(;/ |/| .

MEM
FRONT BUMPER »[e $909.00 <
FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GARNISH DS $235.00 _—
FRONT BUMPER SIDE GARNISH LH e $68.00 _—
FRONT BUMPER LOWER CENTRE GRILLE A1 $165.00 X
FRONT BUMPER SPONGE A1 $98.00 )/
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT /7 $617.00
FRONT BUMPER CLIPS AL 36000 .~
FRONT HEADLAMP LH Cna $1,652.00
FRONT GRILLE /92 C At $685.0

$4,489.00

TO CHECK WIRING $50.00 20
TO REFILL AIR CON GAS A1 $12000 X
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING A $50.00 X
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS $600.00 '350
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING $680.00 7

TOTAL $5,989.00
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pairer of the followir

l

| 41802
' “Td

ition(s) s a '

meniary itemis) must be resur Ian: ) I 2'2

ot 1o final 2pproval from insu

Acknowledged by Repairer 2 .L'Ll '

signature;



y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

H; ;; — 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Ref : CS/QBE19021960/Uyd3e2
R APorE e ™ owe oo [
Code: QBE
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YM 9959K Veh. Inspected GBG 2244P
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC013265 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JENNY TOH Assign Date 12/12/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAXUS G10 (A) c.c 1850
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. LSKG4GL1XHA044488 Colour GREY
Odometer 53054 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/70 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre [215/70 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[215/70 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[215/70 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  04/12/2018 Inspection Date 13/12/2019
Survey held at HUAT AUTO-BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1# 01-404
Repairer =
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




| 7d 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBG 2244P
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (g” ($j)
IREPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER (N) DENTED / 909.00 909.00
DEFORMED
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GARNISH (N) DISTORTED 235.00 235.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE GARNISH LH (N) DEFORMED 68.00 68.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER CENTRE GRILLE (N) NOT NECESSARY 165.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE (N) NOT NECESSARY 98.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (N) TO REPAIR SEE 617.00
LABOUR
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (N) NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|FRONT HEADLAMP LH (N) CRACKED 1,652.00 1,652.00
1|FRONT GRILLE (N) CRACKED 685.00 685.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -360.90
4,489.00 3,248.10
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 50.00 20.00
TO REFILL AIR CON GAS. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 .
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING. NOT NECESSARY 50.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS. 600.00 380.00
INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT BUMPER
REINFORCEMENT.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 680.00 380.00
1,500.00 780.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,989.00 4,028.10
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,200.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/QBE19021960/Uyd3e2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




