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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 December 2020 4:32 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Yvonne Ng

Subject: Re: LOD/Invoice for SLB4487A

Attachments: SLB4487A DV.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam 
Attached signed DV for your further action 
Thanks & Best Regards 

S.T.Sim 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 
#04-35/36 Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 
H/P: 65- 69559351 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the  
Internet.

 
 
 

 

On Wed, Dec 30, 2020 at 4:28 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

Thank you for acceptance. 

Please duly sign the Release Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action. 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 30 December 2020 4:16 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: LOD/Invoice for SLB4487A 

  

Dear Sir/Madam 

Without Prejudice 

We agreed to your proposed settlement of $3,886.50 dated on 30/12/2020 

Please let us have your DV the soonest 

Thanks & Best Regards 

S.T.Sim 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 

#04-35/36 Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 

H/P: 65- 69559351 

 

  

  

  

On Wed, Dec 30, 2020 at 3:22 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: SLB 4487A 

LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19021916/Qrb3                                                                Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDU 40B AND SLB 4487AON 11/12/2019 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement as follows: - 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 3,584.50  

2. Loss of Rental (5 days x $60.00)  $ 300.00  

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee  $ 2.00  

Total  $ 3,886.5  

Please confirm acceptance. 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Siak Tong Sim [mailto:siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 5 June 2020 2:12 PM 

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 

Cc: Yvonne Ng 

Subject: Re: LOD/Invoice for SLB4487A 

  

Dear sir 

Attached LOD/Invoice for SLB4487A for your approval and early settlement 

Thanks & Best Regards 

S.T.Sim 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 
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60 Jalan Lam Huat 

#04-35/36 Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 

H/P: 65-97422188 

 

  


