LOT - C L ity NORMAL J URGEN

Fleferencn Ha s X2 NALOO\ 35‘(65 A ,.,.( Snlm o, ' IN OPG:vesi e DOA;

e e g < g e

Erom (1 raon) ﬂéﬁ C\oions MEE? of A R[‘f'.
Datafline * gy egmrions I8 . - PR 4

e i 5 bt e e e e

, .
ToPE MCar /M Cyele [ Bus AV an f Lorry 4 Taxl{ Prime Mover / Truel ! Tralleror .

Uohicle o © Saw) 3938 S/ AL 3A/m )26 =, § ,

Make & Model: K | , NEW CAR PRICE:

Reglstaton Date: ,Qﬁ:_ii{\?&f}aqsa‘ .M\/:.‘Bso\(-cesa ()uole D‘,f e b

COE E3

iy Dater - o3 Jowuewy 202% . [‘:13:5’,__. . Dale Novembee 20v%

LEA Total Rebate Amount; (PARF) +(CQE) = . S\ViE

"(".;:llff.r',}}w{i:(r(.'ll1 for LTA Hobato! . Calculation [ur Valuation: . R
(8} COEFPedad_ -« XA4R2=___ MU} Avarago AV’ = &
1‘.\."17 /‘l N o . Piliisn ey
e " ol - = Mths  JGaletlation for Ropossossod vahlelo:
( e L IR Mths  |High delnand vehlelo:  Yas /No | - § N
(1) Balance Monh ) e © Uparallel import vehilcle:, Yés /No | - § =
Mora thap 10yré,01d: Yas / No - 5 I
BRI ) MR T o T
T . - T Fﬂ-.\f--l'orvlfi;'HI osshhdod-vetilpjo—: ©: = §
(a) : . et i
_ {Endine Capacity! High/low | = %
W -(b) = M2T L Sewy s C|Eurgpe £ Asta Gar . P
Reglster-telore/Alter MAT 2002 . Car Condillon: Gucdll"’uln’l’ﬂm‘muml - -5 Lo
{v) PARF = (OtY) ___ vz K = INd, of tmnsrer' o » 5 .
LTA Tolal Rebatn Amounts (d)4-{o) \ Other! doduction - 3
Salvage Value (LTA Rebate - $50); Forocad Halos Value dorlvod B W e e
M o e e O 2 ; ' ; 4 Z =
Date /Tme | Action / Instruetfon ———— |Additional Information; .
Saw AAE - | pe3/P 10000 (A1adza TER-giecBon) | . ' e R i L e
3 t s v
T ) PP GG M el o
sy o b b N s R ! Ko A i
\.. A — . r—— i - ] [ e——— s




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 10:55 am

To: Loo, Tong Shing

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Laili, Shahzlan; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: Request for Market Value SJW793E: Our Ref: 87729028125G ; Your Ref: To be
Advised

Dear Tong Shing,

The market value for STW 793E is $ 80K (est) as at November 2017.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 9:39 am

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Laili, Shahzlan <Shahzlan.Laili@aig.com>; Loo, Tong Shing
<TongShing.Loo@aig.com>

Subject: FW: Request for Market Value SJW793E: Our Ref: 8772902812SG ; Your Ref: To be Advised

Dear Survey Dept
Please follow up on the below email request.
Any problem, let me know.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: AIGSS Claims Recovery <GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 9:25 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>
1
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Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 9:39 am

To: SUR

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Laili, Shahzlan; Loo, Tong Shing

Subject: FW: Request for Market Value SJW793E: Our Ref: 87729028125G ; Your Ref: To be
Advised

Attachments: SJW793E - COE.PDF

Dear Survey Dept
Please follow up on the below email request.
Any problem, let me know.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: AIGSS Claims Recovery <GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 9:25 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: AIGSS Claims Recovery <GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com>; Laili, Shahzlan <Shahzlan.Laili@aig.com>
Subject: Request for Market Value SJW793E: Our Ref: 8772902812SG ; Your Ref: To be Advised

Hi Celine/Bryan

Reference to above, grateful if you can assist us to provide the Market Value of this vehicle at the Date of Accident
(24/11/2017).

Please find attached details for your reference.

(We have already settled the OD claim and are seeking recovery for our losses and the other insurers are now
requesting for additional independent valuation).

Do appreciate your kind assistance, thank you.

Sincerely,

Tong Shing

LOO TONG SHING

AIG

Recovery Representative - Claims Recovery

Tel 8001206556 Ext 1012212

GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com | www.aig.com




11/29/2017 PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

-

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type

Singapore NRIC

Owner ID 9485E

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No. SIW793E

Vehicle to be Exported Yes

Intended De-registration Date 29 Nov 2017
Vehicle Make MERCEDES BENZ
Vehicle Model CLS350

Primary Colour Black
Manufacturing Year 2006

Engine No. 27296430331964
Chassis No. WDD2193562A072517
Maximum Power Output 200.0 kW (268 bhp)
QOpen Market Value $76,655.00
Original Registration Date 03 Jan 2007

First Registration Date 03 Jan 2007
Transfer Count 1

Actual ARF Paid $84,321.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -

PARF Rebate Amount $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date 02 Jan 2027

COE Category E - Open Category
COE Period(Years) 10

PQP Paid $52,660.00

COE Rebate Amount $47,889.00

Total Rebate Amount $47,889.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 29 Nov 2017

OK

MV- 69K - Chove

https:/#/vrl.lta.gov.sg/italvri/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereginput?FUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT
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