AUBURN AUTO PTE LTD

176 Sin Ming Drive #04-18 Sin Ming Autocare, Singapore 575721
Tel : +65 9787 5558
Email: auburnauto.claim@gmail.com

Vehicle No: SGK5473U
Model: Mitsubishi Grandis

QTY Description Repairer's Estimate
Spare Parts - List Items
1 Rear Reverse Camera X M s 180.00
1 Rear R/H Head light X VAl $ 880.00
1 Rear Bumper (uf $ 1,500.00 8 qS /
1 Rear Bumper Side Retamers Y- NN s 170.00
1 Bumper Sensor X M $ 120.00
1 Rear Bumper Reflectors i ”f $ 380.00 9 ’0 /
1 Rear Bumper Top Step Garnish X /Al S 150.00
1 Rear End Panel X NAl $ 480.00
| Rear End Panel Inner Gamish X NA 120.00
1 Rear Boot Garnish X MNAI $ 100.00
1 Hydraulic Hinge X NA! $ 200.00
2 Rubber Moulding X AN $ 40.00
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S 4,320.00
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c/f: 8 $ 4,320.00

Special Nett Items AMT S§
Back bumper clip ~ /4 $ 150.00 J 0
Rear Reverse Sensor (1 set) )( NN S 620.00
$ 770.00
e .
Labour Charges \& 0 /
Remove and refit rear tailgate $ 300.00 )(
Remove and refit rear bumper $ 300.00 jM
Remove, refit and replaced damage lamps ~ $ 150.00 ﬁ ] 7
and check up rear electrical wiring
Remove and refit inner garnishes trim to $ 200.00 X
assist repair
Remove and refit rear reverse sensor $ 240.00 }0
To apply undercoating on replaced panel ~ § 120.00 {g
To Respray Painting. $ 1000.00 £40
) 2,310.00 8 -
Gee /
GRAND TOTAL $ 7,400.00
')
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Survey: 1st / 2nd / 3rd (delete accordingly)

Surveyor Detalls: LKK Auto Consultants hence
(Name) 57% (L% mRWWMM following: nolly
o I e
(Email) * Parts prices are subject 1o con's ~ation
* Third party survey is on & “Witho..: Prejudice” basis
(Signature) / * No illegal modification(s) is allow. 4
ki Item(s) musi be resurveyed ang
(Date/Time) p /. -
Signature:
Y, "] / Date:

i pl
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Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Sam Ng <samuel.auburnauto@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 02, 2020 8:59 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SGK5473U Finalize

Hi Steve,

Kindly revert. Accepted

With regards

Sam

Auburn auto Pte Ltd
+65 9787 5558

On Thu, 2 Apr 2020 at 8:49 AM, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@]kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sam,

Kindly refer our finalize $1300 (L/S, before GST). 2 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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