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Consullanis
i W B Pre Ltd Company Repistration Mo 1596071988

STUBRTAVE 1, #02-25 PAY A UBLINDUSTRIAL PARE, SINGAPDHE 8333 TEL © (D651 AAERAER] FAN @ (65] 62304315

Yourref: D19007788MFSH

Our ref: CS/FCII9021803/Avd3 Date : 17/3/2020

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirMadam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SKOQ 3238]

We thank you for your instruction on 10/12/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
LIA2/2019  at the premises of M/s MCS GARAGE
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 556,949.00
Revised Estimate Amount : §5500.00
"Check” Items Amount : 88

Market Value ;5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value + 3%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the

; rear
ofs portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours taithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



. T

. i 1 M5 First Capital Insurance Limited comeg mo 1050001050 CET Reg ho M HILETE-9
MS Firgtca p Ital E Raffles Quay 821-00 Singapore 048580
Tel (B8 6222 2311 Fax [55)E222 3547

Chaims & Motor Undenwiiting Capt 36 Rotinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 06BATT
Tel; (65) G507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3649
wwees msfirsteapital com.tg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 09-12-2019 Our Ref No. D180077BBMFSH
Accident Date 07-12-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHT537E Third Party Vehicle, SKQ3258)
Survey Location 10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2 #03-25 FIRST EAST CENTRE

Contact Person. MR KENDRICK

Contact No. 92700917/ 92700917 Fax No. 0

Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

Rppaiin LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor

Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. A

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop MCS GARAGE Attention. NIL
Cec : TP Solicitor VISION LAWY LLC TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge JOANMNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer genarated letter, no signature required,




‘Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

————————————————————————————— e —

From: Veron Chen (LKKAUt0)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 11:44 AM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims’

Cc: 'Joanne Yong'; SUR

Subject: RE; SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007788MFSH/1-5KQ 3258/
Attachments: SKQ 3258) PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam.

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKQ 3258]
Date of survey: 11/12/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 4:15 PM

To: "CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007788MFSH/1-5KQ 3258)

Dear SirMadam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKQ 3258J on 11/12/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 11:26 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007788MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



‘Thank you for the assignment.

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 &

Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [ma'iItu:cwsmotor::Iaima{amsfirstcanital.com.5g]
Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 4:56 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D15007788MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: © WWW.AVE.Com



‘Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 419 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc ‘Joanne Yong'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007788MFSH/1-5KQ 3258)
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKQ 3258 on 11/12/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <cadmin-d@lkkauto.com>

sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 11:26 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong' -:Joannevnng@msfirstcapitalmm.sg:; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007788M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 &

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@@lkkauto.com | fax; b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CW5 Mator Claims [milm:cwsm::-tmrclaims@msﬁrstcapital.c::-m.sg}
Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 4:56 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@mesfirstcapital.com.sg=; Joanne Yong




q.inannevung@msﬁrstcapital.cnm.s.p;:-
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - DlQUDT?ESMFSHI 1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
A - WWW L aVE.COIM




[C] audi A3 Cabriclet 1.BA TFSI5-  §69,300 $6,970 fyr 18-Jan-2010 1,798 oc - Sparts
tronic {New 10-yr COE)

Lugky Win Freowned Cars! Extremely Well Kept Unk. Most Wear And Tear Parts Replaced, New ABS Pump Replaced. In House Loan With
Immediate Aporoval, No Guarantor Meeded, Beautiful Uni. Call Us Mow For A Non Obligation Test Drive Anytime Anywhere! Quality Cars...

[] Audi A3 Cabriolet 1.8A TFS1S-  $68,800 $6,870 fyr 01-Apr-2010 1,798 ox . Sports
tronic (Mew 10-yr COE}

Full Loan Awvailable AL $1k Pius, We Can Helg To Conver To 210 Usage If Meeded, In House Loan Or Bank Loan Available! Fast, Easy And
Flexihie Loan Approvall We Are sgCarMart Premivm Deales! Buy With Configence! Viawing And Test Drive Available Daily Including Wee...

88 Motor Traceng

yepidt s AN<Niir=20119 sgs TG Ak A0, 3010 aud] a3, Aut A3, augad, Au AJ, -3, Lsed dod

[] Audi A3 Cabriolet 1.8 TFSI 5- 570,888 47,080 fyr 31-May-2010 1,788 cc 93,000 km Sparts
tronic {New 10-yr COE)

[mmaculate Condition Black Audi A3 Cabriclet For Sake! Spesty Red Spats To Contrast With, Low Mileage Clocked, Soft Tep In Good
Conditian And Perfect Working Order, Top Up/Down At Even 30Kmy/hrl Well Maintained Ard Timely Sendced With Available Recards, Wel...

Bawarian Margues Pte Lid

That's a fine looking car interior

Customise your ride. Replace yaur beather seats, door panels, stesring wheels and mare with quality trims of your choice. List of the best workshops
available. Esch with merchant infeemation, ranking and reviews to help you make thi best decision,

Find out maore!

D Audi A3 Sportback 1.8A TFSI 530,388 $12,000 fyr 16-Mar-2011 1,798 oc 113,052 ken Hatchback

53 Look, A3 Prica! Nicely Done Up With 53 Grille, RS3 Brakea Kit & Sports Rim, Regularly Serdced With All Wear And Tear Parts
Replaced receipts Kept)- Pristing Interior ‘Wil Taken Care mwmwm.mﬂlwmmmmwt,mwm

MY Aute

D Audi A3 Sportback 1.8A TFSI $31,800 $11,990 fyr 2B-Apr-2011 1,758 o 121,000 km Hatchback

Special Black Edition A3 For Sale, Competithely Priced, Mint Conction All Round, Wear Ard Tear Done Up With Many MNew Parts, Super
Fussy Ex Car Loving Owner_ Original Roof Rack Anc S-Line Alcantara Seats, Smocth And Comfortable Drive With Powaer And Style To Ma,

D Audi A3 Sportback 1.8A TFSI $33,500 $13,230 fyr 28-Apr-2011 1,798 cc 73,000 km Hatchback

Sporty Black Audl A3 1,8 Ftsi, Very Low Lisage, Mew Car Condition, Dwner Upgrading, No Repair, Super Well Care By Fussy Cwner,

[} Audi A3 Sportback 1,84 TFSI $37,800 $14,500 fyr 19-Jun-2011 1,798 € 137,000 km Hatchbiack

One Crwner Only, Just Service Last Manth And Servced AL Enfinaive, Very Well Maintain Uinit, Very Fun Pocket Rocket That 1s Suited For
Your Family And Speed| Consignment Unit, Loan And [nsurance Can Be Arranged, Trade In Welcome, Viewing wia Appointment Cnbyl Ca...

Prem Roy Motaring

[] Audi A3 Cabriclet 1.8A TFSI §- 542,800 $13,660 /yr 12-Jul-2011 1,798 cc - Sports
tromic

Mind Blowing Condition? No Repairs Needed For This Unit, Good For Short Term Drive. In-Build BOSE Ertartalnment Sound System! Wear
& Tears Al Done Up By Previous Careful Owner. Flexdble Financing Packages Auailable Here., Call Our Friandly Sales Cansultant Now Far...

L 1 S L Al A 0L & §, il A Wil a3, Ao &

[] Audi A3 Sportback 1.4A TFS1 532,800 $10,700 fyr 12-5ep-2011 1,390 et 98,000 km Hatchback

§32800{22/11/19) Priced To Salll Megatranic Changed 1 Year Ago, Stage 1 Tuned For Srreat Use, Front 2 Tyres 3 Months Old Eagle F1,
water Pump Changed 3 Months Ago, Battery Changed 1 Manth Aga. Taken Care Of By Careful Cwner, Regularky Serviced At Reputable.,

D Audi A3 Sportback 1.4A TF51 550,888 410,810 fyr 28-Mow-2013 1,395 o 68,000 km Hatchiback
S-tronic Ambition

One Caseful Owner! Low Miksage Done! Full Agant Service And Maintained. Car Sill Tn Original Paintwark And Condition. Car Mastly Parked
Unher Shelter! Almast Shownoom Originad Condition! Guararteed Accident Free! High Paper Wakues. Call Now For Viewing,

D Audi A3 Sportback 1.4 TFSI 551,900 310,850 fyr 24-0ec-2013 1,395 oc 50,987 km Hatchback

Available

Availabla

Avallable

Available

Avallable

Available

Lot cuith]

Avallable

I:(-mll! ]

Available

:

Available

Available

Available



S-tronic Ambition
1 Owner, Low Mileage, Fully Maintained By PA, 3 Digit Nao. Plate. Only High Specs A3 In The Market With Low Depre! 6 Months Warranty,

[mmaculate Condimon, Guaranteed Mo Repalrs Needed. Workshop Inspection Weicome, View To Believe! Guaranteed No Disappaintmen., LR

D Audi A3 Sedan 1.4A TFSI 5- %55,800 $10,630 fyr 25-Jun-2014 1,345 cc 112,000 km Lusury Available
tronic Ambiente

1 Ownes, Agent Linit, Excellent Condition, Accident Free, See To Bebeve, Road Tax Till 6/2020, Easy Bank/In House Loan Available, §

Flexitia Loan, L rrewu ko |

EI Audi A3 Sedan 1.4A TF5I 5- $61,000 $10,660 fyr 25-Mow-2014 1,395 cc 70,000 km Lusury Available

tronic Ambiente

1 Owwner, Extremnaly Will Maintained. Full Agent Serviced With Records. Excelient Interior And Exterior Condition. View To Believe, Trade-
In fnd Full Loan Available. Hurry Contact Us For More [nformation,

Car Emipire Automobiles Phe Lid

Save this search criterla, o get email alerts whenever a match is found,
R - | vooe < Bl e < ] oo~ Bl s oo« Bl e coo - Bl voor ~ B v o RS - B

For ald advertisements, view Expired ads «Hack (1234 ) Neut » 20 T results/page
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC

Owner 1D 512G

Vehicle Mo SKQ3258)

Vehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended Deregistration Date: 11 Dec 2017

Wehicle Make: AUDI

Wehicle Model: A3ZSE 1.4 TFSIIAMBIENTE]
Primary Colour: White

Manufacturing Year: 2013

Engine MNo.: CHS047348

Chassis Mo WALIZZZEVKEADBS434
Maximum Pawer Output: 90.0 kW (120 bhp)
Open Market Value: $26,143.00

Criginal Registration Date: 17 Dec 2013

First Registration Date: 17 Dec 2013

Transfer Count: 3

Actual ARF Paid: $13,601.00

PARF Eligibility: s

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 14 Dec 2023

PARF Rebate Amount: £9,520.00

COE Expiry Date: 16 Dec 2023

COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Peripd(Years): 10

QP Paid: $73,140.00

COE Rebate Amount: $29.362.00

Total Rebate Amount; $38.882.00

The information contained hergin iscorrect asat 11 Dec 2019






’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e By &1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

)
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18021803/Avd3n2
A G USESINGAPORE 068877 Dites “RNB-020 Nmmwm m"
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 7537E Veh. Inspected SKQ 3258J
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. D19007788MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 1071212018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model AUDI A3 SB c.c 1395
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. WALUZZZBVXEADBEA34 Colour WHITE
Odometer 89532 Stearing IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Madification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3: Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 GOODYEAR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE 0I5 BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  07/12/2019 Inspection Date 11/12/2019
Survey held at MCS GARAGE
10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2
#03-25 FIRST EAST CENTRE
SINGAPORE 417868
Sa. Remarks.
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; B256 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No 19-9607198-R Page No.1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKQ 3258J
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::“"“W““{;}} Our *{‘;l]“'“"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR FENDER RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,013.50 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,485.90 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER WNOT NECESSARY 1,381.60 -
1|REAR SPORT WHEEL RH MNOT HNECESSARY 1,150.50 -
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -251.58 -
4 779.92 -
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR TYRE RH (SHM) NOT NECESSARY 450.00
450,00 -
LABOUR
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT MECESSARY 120.00 d
TO RESPRAY PAINTING AND ETC. 800.00 400.00
PAMEL BEATING,REMOVE AND REPLACING ABOVE 800.00 100.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OOF REAR FENDER
RH AND REAR DOOR RH.
1,720.00 50000
GRAND TOTAL 6,949.92 500.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 500.00|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119021803/Avd3n2

‘g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DMSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:-
Ko liability of rosponsibility whatsosver, in conts

This Report is made sololy for the use and benelit of the Client namad cn tha frant pags of this Report.

wholly or in part. Any third party scting or reghying en this



