Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 13 December 2019 4:26 pm

To: Hwang, Shiang Yi

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1905749/SYH - TP CLAIMS - GBA3685A AGAINST GBJ3379L DOA 09/12/2019

AT PANDAN FLYOVER EXIT 11 TWDS CLEMENTI AVE 6

Dear Shiang Yi,
According to our surveyor, We provide at the time of accident as follows:-

MV - $ 18,000.00 (estimated)
LTA - $ 11,482.00
NETT =$ 6,518.00 (estimated)

The repairer had confirmed that they are willing to repair on a lump sum $ 6,000.00.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hwang, Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang @sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 13 December 2019 9:50 am

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>

Cec: assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: CMTD1905749/SYH - TP CLAIMS - GBA3685A AGAINST GBJ3379L DOA 09/12/2019 AT
PANDAN FLYOVER EXIT 11 TWDS CLEMENTI AVE 6

Dear Shirley,
Please advise market value for this vehicle and confirm whether economical to repair.
Best Regards

Hwang Shiang Yi
Claims Division



