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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 December 2019 11:38 AM

To: Claims Dept; SUR

Cc: nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg; boojohnny@gmail.com; ‘'Allan’
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C -DOA: 8/12/19

Dear Tony,

Repair limit $120,000/-

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 13 December 2019 11:11 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg; boojohnny@gmail.com; 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; 'Allan’
<allan.wu@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C -DOA: 8/12/19

Dear Veron,
Kindly advise limit repair of this vehicle.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699
p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
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The all-new Audi Q8 :

welcome to the 8 Dimeéension.

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 12 December 2019 4:22 PM
To: Claims; SUR

Cc: (nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg); (boojohnny@gmail.com)
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C -DOA: 8/12/19

Dear TRoy,
As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SFA 8798C (Excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

NOTE: Insurer's Remarks

Labour no.14 to be removed as labour no. 2 had already awarded. Should vehicle body structural
measurement is not within specification measurement, it must be supported with chassis alignment
report to prove before awarding labour no. 14. Re-inspection require for checked / hidden and
supplementary parts and labour. Before paint photos require for Side Panel Frame RH, Front / Rear
RH Door.

AIG OIC- Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 4:53 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C -DOA: 8/12/19

Dear Veron,
Herein attached the DL and certificate of insurance for your information.
Thanks

Best Regards,
TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg no 190902271w)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

“It comes in blue.” ==

The new Audi A7 Sportback, Do you really need a reason?

[ |
| Find out more
|

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person, Thank you.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 10:39 AM

To: Claims; SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C -DOA: 8/12/19

Dear George,

CI and driving licensed?

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 3:58 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C

Dear all,

Please assist to register own policy claims for the above mentioned vehicle.
Attached is the GIA report for your reference.

Kindly arrange the survey on tomorrow @ 2pm onwards.
Do take note vehicle is at our premises.

Address : 24 Benoi Sector, Singapore 629857

Thank you.

Best Regards,

George Wong

Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

p. +65 6366 2323, option 1

e. Claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 68362223

WELCOME TO THE
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

!L FIND QUT MORE

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system,
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

f

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 December 2019 4:22 PM

To: Claims; SUR

Cc: (nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg); (boojohnny@gmail.com)
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C -DOA: 8/12/19
Attachments: MARK_EST.pdf

Dear TRoy,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SFA 8798C (Excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

NOTE: Insurer's Remarks

Labour no.14 to be removed as labour no. 2 had already awarded. Should vehicle body structural
measurement is not within specification measurement, it must be supported with chassis alignment
report to prove before awarding labour no. 14. Re-inspection require for checked / hidden and
supplementary parts and labour. Before paint photos require for Side Panel Frame RH, Front / Rear
RH Door.

AIG OIC- Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 4:53 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C -DOA: 8/12/19

Dear Veron,
Herein attached the DL and certificate of insurance for your information.

Thanks



Best Regards,
TRoy Goh
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg no 199802271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

“Tt comes |n blue.

The new Audi A7 Sportback, Do you really need :

Find out mare

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 10:39 AM

To: Claims; SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C -DOA: 8/12/19

Dear George,

CI and driving licensed?

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 3:58 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C

Dear all,
Please assist to register own policy claims for the above mentioned vehicle.

Attached is the GIA report for your reference.



Kindly arrange the survey on tomorrow @ 2pm onwards.
Do take note vehicle is at our premises.

Address : 24 Benoi Sector, Singapore 629857

Thank you.

Best Regards,
George Wong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

p. +65 6366 2323, option 1

e. Claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 68362223

WELCOME TO THE
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

| FIND OUT MORE

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you



12/12/2019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SFAB798C (4102225970SG)
oD
Dec 8 2019 12:10PM
[HITACHI CAPITAL ASIA PACIFIC PTE. LTD.]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

i Replyj Reply All I Mark as Unread l Print gessage-l Delete Mie;sage]' Foﬁvard I_ i . .

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 12/12/2019 15:32 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$52395.00) - SFA8798C - Claim Handler: Mithoo Singh, Aashweenjeet Kaur

Approved:52395.00:COR as per New for Old Value repair limit, Labour no.14 to be removed as labour no. 2 had already awarded. Should vehicle body
structural measurement is not within specification measurement, it must be supported with chassis alig

_DOCUMENTS SUMMARY o ) = ] _‘
There are no documents,

hﬂps:ﬂsingapore.merimen.oomlclalmslindex.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&ﬂmeaclion=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1598242&1Domainld=11&i0bjld=12... 12




12/11/2019 Rich Text Editor, SVCDOClItrcontent

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coresno:1gssorissr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ilkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
AIG Building
78 Shenton Way #08-16
Singapore 079120

Attn:

From

Date:

: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

11 Dec 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SFA8798C
Make : AUDI A4

Assignment Date  : 11/12/2019
Date of Inspection : 10/12/2019

Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD
55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

(UBI)

Accident Date : 08/12/2019
Policy No. - 1700006240-02
Excess : $$0.00

Est. Duration of Repair  : 20.00

The vehicle sustained impact / damages o/s body and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revised Amount

Check Items (Estimated)
Total

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value

Pre-Accident Value

COE / PARF Rebate

Salvage Value

Margin for Repair (New For Old Value)
Margin for Repair (Pre-Accident Value)

Remarks

:S$ 75,354.00
:S% 29,755.00
:S$ 22,640.00
:S$ 52,395.00
:S$

:S$ 183,000.00
:S$ 100,000.00

:S$ 59,748.00
:S$

:S§ 123,252.00
:S% 40,252.00

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.

Kindly let us have your authorisation.

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

(X))

Other comments :Kindly advice on offer repair cost to repairer.

Margin for repair (New for Old Value) is $123,252.00

Margin for repair (Pre-Accident Value) is $40,252.00

https:ﬂsingapore.merimn.comlclaimsﬁndex.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseacticn=dsp_rpts&rptmode=2&caseid=894936&extid=325457&adjcur...

12



Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 9 December, 2019 3:58 PM

To: 'SUR'; 'assignments’

Cc: 'Claims'’

Subject: OD CLAIMS FOR SFA 8798 C
Attachments: SFA 8798 C - 08122019 GIA REPORT.PDF
Dear all,

Please assist to register own policy claims for the above mentioned vehicle.
Attached is the GIA report for your reference.

Kindly arrange the survey on tomorrow @ 2pm onwards.

Do take note vehicle is at our premises.

Address : 24 Benoi Sector, Singapore 629857

Thank you.

Best Regards,
George Wong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

p. +65 6366 2323, option 1

e. Claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 68362223

| | L sek
WELCOME TO THE G ——
8TH DIMENSION.

-'[rlE ALL-NEW 'AUDI Q8.

=t ,TQ&‘*; I'f ,J

HIN.01881

IFIND.OQUT MORE

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Company
399N

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

SFA8798C

No

11 Dec 2019

AUDI

A4 1.4TFSISTRONIC
Grey

2017

CVNO033131
WAUZZZF47HA129710
110.0 kW (147 bhp)
$32,079.00
30 May 2017
30 May 2017
0
$26,911.00

L

PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 29 May 2027
PARF Rebate Amount: $20,183.00
COE Expiry Date: 29 May 2027
COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $53,001.00
COE Rebate Amount: $39,565.00
Total Rebate Amount: $59,748.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 11 Dec 2019
OK (60, oUV



12/11/2019 Used Audi A4 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

SCCARMART.COM Login | signup (G
New Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum 'Resources

== BIDDED CARPLATE NUMBERS FOR SALE

[SGC88aaM | Find and buy your favourite car plate number here!

Post an Advertisement i e Republic | CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just P \\cl| Maintained And Serviced At Auto | MERCEDES BENZ
$58 until itus SOLD! TRy L;‘:':ﬂ"" | Reputable Workshop. '..* - =

% ' ; StarAd SKAY,
e o
O ways of selling | |
:
12 vehicles |» Search P Aavenced search | 5 [ Search |

[rose——~ B~ B oo~ B : BR[O

Search Selection Audi A4 Any Any 2017 Any Any Any Available
¥ [] Audi A4 1.4A TFSI S-tronic $97,800 $11,310 /yr 26-May-2017 1,395 cc 35,491 km Luxury Available
Comes With Agent Warranty Till May 2020. Suave And Sophisticated Latest Generation A4 Sedan Powered By A Responsive 1.4
Turbocharged Engine Providing You With A Powerful Daily Drive, Yet Returning Good Fuel Efficiency! Spacious Cabin For Small Families!... [ PRemium D

Select By Performance Premium Selection

D Audi A4 1.4A TFSI S-tronic $102,800 $11,910 fyr 29-May-2017 1,395 cc 42,700 km Luxury Available

Fully Serviced And Maintained By Premium Automobiles, 5 Years Warranty Till May 2022, Good Condition, High Paper Value, Bank Interest
Rate 2.28%, Call/SMS For Viewing.

Republic Auto

[_| Audi A4 1,4A TFSI S-tronic ~ $100,000  $11,730 /yr 28-Apr-2017 1,395 cc 59,000 km luury  Available

1 Careful Owner. Upgraded 17 Inch Rims With New 1 Month Old Continental Tyres. Chrome Front Grills. Front & Rear Car Cam. Audi
Agent Warranty Until 2022 (Unlimited Mileage)Good Condition! Fully Serviced By Agent Since Day One! High Loan And Trade In Availabl... [ Presaur i |

Prem Roy Motoring

E Audi A4 1.4A TFSI S-tronic $106,999 $11,740 yr 14-Nov-2017 1,395 cc 47,000 km Luxury Available

Sporty Grey Exterior! Audi Agent Warranty Until 13 Nov 2022 With Unlimited Mileage! Good Condition! Audi Certified Multi Point Agent
Inspection Process! Fully Serviced By Agent Since Day One! High Loan And Trade In Available! Bank Interest Rate 2.28%! Please Contac...

[ PREMIUM AD )
Premium Automobiles

Tong Lee Wee Auto Acc Pte Ltd - Accessories Retail
A wide variety of car accessories for most car makes are available!

More info about this shop

[T Audi A4 1.4A TFSI S-tronic $106,999 $11,850 Jyr 05-Sep-2017 1,395 cc 44,000 km Luxury Available
Newly Arrivall Hot Deal! Low Mileage, Audi Agent Warranty Until 2022 (Unlimited Mileage)Good Condition! Audi Certified Multipoint Check,
Virtual Cockpit, Navi,! High Loan And Trade In Available! Bank Interest Rate 2.28%! Agent Service, Fuel Efficiency With A Dynamic Drivi... [~Fremur a0 |
Premium Automobiles
- C Audi A4 1.4A TFSI S-tronic $103,999 $12,270 fyr 28-Apr-2017 1,395 cc 26,000 km Luxury Available
Newly Arrivall Hot Deall Low Mileage, Audi Agent Warranty Until 2022 (Unlimited Mileage)Good Condition! Audi Certified Multipoint Agent
Inspection Process! Fully Serviced By Agent Since Day One! High Loan And Trade In Available! Bank Interest Rate 2.28%! Agent Service... [~ Freinum 10 |

Premium Automobiles

O li A4 1.4A TFSI S-tronic $97,500 $11,390 /yr 27-Apr-2017 1,395 cc 60,000 km Luxury Available

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=2017&MOD=Audi A48RPG=20&VEH=08AVL=2 12



12/11/2019 2016 Audi A4 Avant Car Information Singapore - sgCarMart

scCARMART.COM Login | Sign up

m Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles

PECIALISTS IN LUXURY AND PERFORMANCE CARS

‘\

S
1 RUTD cu\

» SEARG'I Audi A4 Available Year ¥ § Vehicle Type M EEERN IR O Past Models @ Current Models J O [Searr_hi

Home + New Cars + Past Ca Audi Past Cars - Audi A4 Ava
Resources Past Car : o :
E Models no longer being sold by local distributors. Model Uﬂa“"ab.h since Aug qug
Car Buying -~

. v Audn A4 Avant

a‘ Car Selling ~

Car Ownership «

Pricing Photos Research Reviews Specs Features Similar Accessories  Promo

Car Aftermarket «

Details

On The Move ~ Distributor Premium Automabiles

Hotline 68362223

e o @ o

Lifestyle «
Builtin Germany (launched 2016)

Predecessor  Audi A4 Avant (2013-2016)
Featured Merchants

Pricelist 15-Nov Pricelist || Select Another Date ¥ |

DICKXSCN AUTO SOLUTION

& St of (e h a5 o L]

USER RATINGS: Wrlr Wl (2 reviews) [ » View All Avallable Audi Madels  » View Al Past Audi Models

RENT TO OWN A |
BRAND NEW | &

T4 Aply

Submodel Last Recorded Price Fuel Economy Power  Transmission Detailed Info
1,4 TFSI S-tronic (A) $183,700 (Oct 2017) 4 17.9km/L 1506hp 7-speed (A) S-tronic Specs | Features
2,0 TFSI S tronic (A) $199,751 (Aug 2019) 18.5km/L 188bhp 7-speed (A) S tronic Specs | Features
2,0 TFSI qu S tronic Design (A) $264,850 (Aug 2019) 15.4km/L 252bhp 7-speed (A) S tronic Specs | Features

The Audi A4: Sportier and
more cutting edge

+ View All 12 Audi A4 Avant Photos

CONSUMER REVIEWS

AudFlaumchos T bast- The Audi A4 is spacious and a great perf... & & &% I love the estate I get for the money I... Wi~
selling A4 i The A4 is more spacious than a BMW 3 series and the S-suspension is Unlike its competitors the BMW 3 Series Touring and Mercedes C-
unreached--it drives like a go-cart. The S-line sport seats are perfect Class Estate, the A4 Avant offers slightly more boot, I can take my
and the car's performance great, even with smaller engines. labrador out and not have to invest in a chunky SUV. Also a lot of m...
ead More = Read More «
Submit a review

Audi organises fuel saving
challenge

Items for Audi
6000K Super Bright HID Foot Pedals y ABT Style Spoiler
nversion Kit -
’ Complete Bodykit (With Rohana (RF02) Matt Black 20"
Carbon Fibre Bannet) Rims

tyres + View All 501 Suitable items for Audi

TSW Bathurst Rotary Forged
20" Rim (With Michelin Pilot
ner Sport Tyre)

https://www.sgcarmart.com/new_cars/newcars_overview.php?CarCode=11910 1/2



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

Make/Model : AUDI A4 1.4 TFSI S tronic
Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1,395.00 CC Sum Insured : Market Value Firs't Year of Registration : 2017
Driver Restriction : NA Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COE/PARF : Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive* :

You have 1o pay an additional sum of $3,000 as "Young andlor Inexperienced Driver Excess” ("YIDR") if You are or Your Autharised Driver (named or unnamed) is under the age of 23 and/or has less
than 2 years' driving expenence.

Age Condition : All Age Condition

Limitation as to use®

Use for the carriage of passengers or goods in connection with the Policyholder's business.

Use for social, domestic, pleasure purp and busi purp of any persan to wham the Vehicie is hired. This Policy does not cover

1) use for driving tuition, driving test, racing, pace-making, reliability trial or speed-tesling;
znmmmnwummnwhg(wmmmwmmdmmum-mmnmlywmmnnm;
J)mlormummotpmnmnluhhummhymmmmmmml\hhi:hilh'nd;md

4) use for any purpose in connection with Motor Trade.

Loss of Use 1500cc - 1600cc Optional

* Limitati dered | live by B of the Molor Vehicies (Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap. 189) and Section 95 of the Road Transporl Acl, 1987 (Malaysia), are not 1o be

included under these hudrnol
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EXCESS

Section 1
Fire - $0 Own Damage - $600 Thefi - $0 Flood Cover - $0

Saction 2
Property Damage - $0

Windscreen : $100

Named Driver and Excess (where appiicable)
Chue Gek Leng - $600 (Own Damage)
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APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS RELATED REPAIRS)
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Approved Reporting C. / AIG Authorised Repail (For daims relaled repairs)
Any accident repairs Io the Vehicle can be camied out at the repairer of Your choice (uniess specifically excluded by Us)
For Approved Reporting Centres/AlG Authorised Repairers, please cantact our 24-hour sccident emergency hotline at +65 6338 6200. Alternatively, you may refer 10 AIG websile www.aig.com.sg or AIG

SG Mobile App. Simply search and download “AIG SG” from iTunes or Google Play.
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IMPORTANT NOTES






