Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: William GO Shaw Chan <william.go@shingda.com>
Sent: Monday, 5 July 2021 9:25 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: Derek CHOW Zhi Da; TIA Ming Ee; SUR

Subject: RE: XD 2918)J

Dear Veron,

We have no choice but to accept.
Please send us DV.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely,

William GO Shaw Chan
Motor Claims Executive
SHINGDA Leasing

M +65 9679 7561 | T +65 6368 8936 (Ext.266) | F +65 6366 1470 | E william.go@shingda.com | W shingdagroup.com
SHINGDA Building, 10 Kranji Crescent, Singapore 728660
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 28 June, 2021 10:08 AM

To: William GO Shaw Chan <william.go@shingda.com>; Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Derek CHOW Zhi Da <derek.chow@shingda.com>; TIA Ming Ee <mingee.tia@shingda.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: XD 2918

- External Email - Please be cautious when clicking on any links or attachments

Dear William,

Any updates?

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 10:36 AM

To: William GO Shaw Chan <william.go@shingda.com>; Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Derek CHOW Zhi Da <derek.chow@shingda.com>; TIA Ming Ee <mingee.tia@shingda.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: XD 2918

Dear William,
As spoken this morning.
Re-finalize amount $37,621.65 as the below items have to take out:

1)TMA ALUMINIUM PANEL (BIG)-$550/-
2)TMA ALUMINIUM PANEL (SMALL)-$400-

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: William GO Shaw Chan [mailto:william.go@shingda.com]

Sent: Monday, 26 April 2021 10:55 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; Derek CHOW Zhi Da <derek.chow@shingda.com>; TIA Ming
Ee <mingee.tia@shingda.com>

Subject: RE: XD 2918J

Dear Sun Pin,
We agreed to accept your offer of $38,571.65 (before GST) and repair day 12 working days.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely,

William GO Shaw Chan
Motor Claims Executive
SHINGDA Leasing

M +65 9679 7561 | T +65 6368 8936 (Ext.266) | F +65 6366 1470 | E william.go@shingda.com | W shingdagroup.com
SHINGDA Building, 10 Kranji Crescent, Singapore 728660
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From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) [mailto:sunpin@I|kkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 23 April, 2021 9:35 AM

To: William GO Shaw Chan <william.go@shingda.com>
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: XD 2918

- External Email - Please be cautious when clicking on any links or attachments
Hi William,

Any update for this case ?

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 5 April, 2021 6:07 PM
To: William GO Shaw Chan

Subject: XD 2918]

Hi William,
Kindly refer the finalize amount $38,571.65. Repair day 12 days. (P/P, before gst).

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




