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S1UBLAVE |, #01-25 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL 1 (065) 82560561 FAX 1 (065) 62864318

Your Ref: CMTD1905704/THE

Our Ref: CS/SMOI19021726/Ktd3

The Motor Claims Department

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE P

Dear Sirs/Mdm

Date: 12/12/2019

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SJH 8101D .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above-mentioned vehicle
on _10/12/2019 at the premises of M/s ____Guan Motor __and have the following to

report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check™ Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Ner Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the o/s rear portion.

Repair days: 4

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 1,58 PM

To: Willow Tuang: ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com’; ‘assignments@Ikkauto.com'’

Cc: Choo, Thelma; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD1905704/THE - PRI(LKK)/ ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH8101D & GZ7871L ON
5.12.2019 AT BLK 631 ANG MO KIO AVE 4 CARPARK

Attachments: PRS SIH8101D.pdf

Our Reference : CMTD1905704/THE
Your Reference: SJHB101D

Without Prejudice
Date: 10.12.2019 OUR Email: molorsurvey @ sompa.com.sg

Attention:
CKTEO & CO

Dear Willow,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJHB101D & GZ7871L ON 05.12.2019

We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Kenneth Kong of LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the email below and make the arrangement to survey for SIH8101D on a without prejudice basis and
revert with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Thelma.

Our office will be closed on Christmas, New Year's Eve and New Year Day. Business will resume on 26" December 2019
and 2™ January 2020 respectively
We wish you a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year!

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D 6329 5170 | T 6461 6555 | F 6221 3147

For motaor claims survey request, please email to ry SOmpo.com.



' SOMPO A cent of Ti
@ entury of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Ratfles Place #05-01/08 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

® App Store
Download now @ PP
‘For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | < For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Privite Motar Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended far the personi{s) or company named and may contain confidential
andfor legally prvileged information Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this infarmation may be unlawful and is prohibiled
I you are not the intended recipient. please deléte this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposas
stated in aur Privacy Policy, This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws. our third party service providers and agents {acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Willow Tuang <swtuang@gmail.com=

Sent: Tuesday, December 10, 2019 12:43 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Fwd: SOMPO REF:CMTD1905704/RE: [SJH8101D] ACCIDENT INVOLVING S/HB101D & GZ7871L ON
5.12.2019 AT BLK 631 ANG MO KIO AVE 4 CARPARK

-=-meeum- Forwarded message --—-—--

From: Willow Tuang <wiuang@gmail.com>

Date: Mon. Dec 9, 2019 at 1:13 PM

Subject: Re: SOMPO REF:CMTD1905704/RE: [SJH8101D] ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH8101D &
GZ7871L ON 5.12.2019 AT BLK 631 ANG MO KIO AVE 4 CARPARK

To: Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>

Dear Sirr'Mdm

We refer to your email of 6th December 2019,

We are agreeable of appointing KENNETH KONG (LKK AUTO) as a Single Joint Expert.

Our client’s vehicle is available for pre-repair survey at:

Venue | : | Guan Motor Works




176 Sin Ming Drive #02-03
Sin Ming AutoCare

Singapore 575721

Tel: 6453 6111 (AH HENG)

Regards
Tuang Willow
CKTEO & CO

Tel: 65354788

Fax: 65354245

On Fri, Dec 6, 2019 at 3:38 PM Henry, Irene James <irene.henrvi@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Qur Reference : CMTD1905704/THE

Your Reference: SIH 8101D

Without Prejudice

Date: 06.12.2019

Attention:

CKTEO & CO



ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH 8101D & GZ 7871L ON 05.12.2019

Dear Sirs,

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 06.12.2019.

Please be informed that Thelma Choo the handler of this case who can be contacted at 6322 4681/

;helma.:hon@snmgu.mm.sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer's vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop, We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey
Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
¢ | LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffery Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Besi Reqgards



Irene Henry
Iljl.aln'la Division

D 6322 4618 | T: 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

SOMPO
e A Century of Trust

INSU CE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower. Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo.com sq | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

® App Store

Download now (@ or

‘Far Travel, Persanal Accigen! & Home Insurance | # Far Trawel Perspnal Accident, Homa & Private Motor Insursnce

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or comparny named and may contain confidential
andlor legally privileged information Unauthorised disclasure. copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please delate this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect. use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credil bureau, parties 1o wham
disclosure is permitted/required by laws. our third party service prowiders and agents (acting on our behall). Pleasa click hara for
our Privacy Policy

From: Willow Tuang <wtuan mail.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 December, 2019 2:51 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey @sompo.com.sg>

Subject: [SJHB101D] ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIH8101D & GZ7871L ON 5.12.2019 AT BLK 631 ANG MO KIO AVE 4
CARPARK

Dear Sir,

Enclosed Is a copy each of the following:

a  Notification of Accident & Pre-Repair Inspection;
b. GIA Report of our Client; and

c.  LTA resull

Regards



Tuang Willow

CKTEO&CO
Tel: 65354788
Fax: 65354245



Denise Taz (LI(HAutn!

From; Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 December 2019 5:15 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto), 'Teo, Grace’; assignments

Cc: ‘Choo, Thelma'; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; 'Henry, Irene James’; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1905704,/THE - PRI(LKK)/ ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJHB101D & GZ7871L
ON 5.12.2019 AT BLK 631 ANG MO KIO AVE 4 CARPARK

Attachments: PRELI ADVISED OF SJH B101D.pdf

Dear Sir'Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIH 8101D
Number of days (estimated) : 4 days

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handles
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; deplsetav@|kkauto.com | fas: 5256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, BD2-25 | 5{a08933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 2:36 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Choo, Thelma' <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry,
Irene James' <irene henry@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1905704/THE - PRI{LKK)/ ACCIDENT INVOLVING S/H8101D & GZ7871L ON 5.12.2019 AT BLK 631
ANG MO KIO AVE 4 CARPARK

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020 A’

Best Regards

GNIVITHA

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | emall: pssignments@kkauto.com | fax: 6256-47315
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mallto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 1:58 PM
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1. (. the uwner of Vehicle No. S JH g0l Dmtmd 10 make a 3" party claim
ERRINSL your insured.

2 My Vehicle is now at the workshop Guan Motor Works Tel : 6453 6111 and

-

[y yvailable for your inspection pefore repairs are carried out.

3 Please scknowledge receipl of this Notification by reiwn fax 10 6453 8292
and reply within 2 days whether you wish 10 inspeci the vehicle or waive inspection.
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©RJE Y B
GUAN MOTOR WORKS

[ [TENTITIING Hl'l_.pr b TR TR

F46 Sin Ming Drrive #02-0% Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721 Tel 5453 6111 Fae G455 H292 11/P 9742 KO0

REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR SJH8101D
No Qty
List Items
1 1 Rear bumper $ Ar 45160 —
2 1 Rear bumper RH reflector S™ 2 9290 —
3 1 Rear bumper LH inner side bracket S M 56304
4 1 Rear bumper RH side retainer S P47 B5.60 —
5 1 Rear bumper RH corner retainer S &y 4300 —
6 1 set Rear bumper clips s = 3000 —
7 1 RHtaillamp panel S /T 12850 X
8 1 RH taillamp § 1 32760 —
9 1 Rear end panel $ T 57500 X
5 1,790.50
Less 25% S 447.63
Total : 5 1.342.88
Special Nett ltems ¢
10 1 set Reverse sensors s ™ 25000 X
11 1 set Rear end panel sealant S ™ 50.00X
Total: & 300.00
Labour
1 Labour Charges for remove/refit, cutting/welding and S 800.00 {‘-ﬁ'f 5 ﬁog?l
replacement of damages.
To putty and sgray Spray Paintings charges. 800.00 (ﬁ#

5
To check wirings and lightings. S 40.00 Ze¢
To remove, refit reverses sensors. 5 80.00 s=¢
To remove, refit rear upholstery and attachments. 5 120.00 {#-('
S X
>

L= LV i TR Y

To supply and apply anti rust treatment A=v 80.00
1,520.00

Total ;

Total Parts and Labour: § 3,562.88

AG7 A, %r

Cllns & P00/
ﬂfvru-; /fé/- /galvf

4"’{" 77



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl indusirial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B258 4315
Heg No: 1838071968R GST Reg, No 18-B807198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Das Experts En Automobile §

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Rel CS/SMD19021726/Kid3n2
Ao " TN
#05-01/06 Date: 26-12-2019
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAFPORE 048623
Coda: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM . ]
Insured Veh. GZ 7T8T1L Veh. Inspected SJH 8101D
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1905704/THE Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEO Assign Date 1011272018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA VIOS E (M) c.C 1497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. MROS3HYBI05078361 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer 286608 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
Genaral GooD
3. ; Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyra |185/55 R15 MICHELIN 5mm
L/H Front Tyre |[185/55 R15 MICHELIN Smm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/55R15 MICHELIN 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/55 R15 MICHELIN T mm
3 Description of Damages.
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5 L J General Information o . =
Accident Date  05/1212019 |Inspection Date 10/12/2019
Survey held at GUAN MOTOR WORKS
176 SIN MING DRIVE
#02-03
SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE 575721
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS. .
5b. ~ EstmaleDaysofRepar |

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE ND. SJH B101D

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 6258 4315
Reg. No: 18960710BR 35T Reg. Mo, 19-B607188-R

1 B L P A= . e | W e
Qty ~ Description of Parts |  Condition
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER BENT 45160 451.60
1|REAR BUMPER RH REFLECTOR MTG CRACKED 82 90 9290
1|REAR BUMPER LH INNER SIDE BRACKET TO REPAIR SEE 56.30 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER RH SIDE RETAINER DISTORTED B5.60 85.60
1|REAR BUMPER RH CORNER RETAINER DISTORTED 43.00 43.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|RH TAILLAMP PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 128,50 .
LABOUR
1|RH TAILLAMP cuT 327,60 327.60
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 575.00 A
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 447,62 25768
134288 773.02
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REVERSE SENSORS (SN) SERVICEABLE 250,00 .
1|SET REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 E
300,00 1
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES FOR 800,00 540.00
REMOVE/REFIT,CUTTING/WELDING AND REPLACEMENT
OF DAMAGES INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
BUMPER LH INNER SIDE BRACKET RH TAILLAMP PANEL
AND REAR END PANEL
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING CHARGES. 800.00 600.00
TO CHECK WIRINGS AND LIGHTINGS. 40,00 20.00
TO REMOVE,REFIT REVERSES SENSORS. 80.00 50.00
TO REMOVE,REFIT REAR UPHOLSTERY AND 120.00 60.00
ATTACHMENTS
TO SUPPLY AND APPLY ANTI RUST TREATMENT, NOT NECESSARY 80,00 -
1,820.00 1,270.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,562.88 2.043.02

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18021726/Ktd3n2
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KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TIO THERD FPARTIES - This Report is made sabsly lor the s snd berafil of ihe Cliant named an tha iram page of this Repor.

Esport i whols o in part, doss $0 8t hes or fer e k.



