Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: 14 October 2020 10:50 AM

To: jasonlow2003@yahoo.com.sg

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN 1869B & SGH 2063E ON 02/12/2019

HOCK CHUAN HENG CAR RENTAL & TRADING PTE LTD
POLICY HOLDER

Dear Mr. Jason,

We refer to the above matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer,
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We would like to request for a copy of your hirer’s rental agreement because we noted that she is not holding a
Singapore driving license.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: 17 September 2020 3:45 PM

To: jasonlow2003@yahoo.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN 1869B & SGH 2063E ON 02/12/2019

HOCK CHUAN HENG CAR RENTAL & TRADING PTE LTD
POLICY HOLDER

Dear Mr. Jason,

We refer to the above matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer,
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We would like to request for a copy of your hirer’s rental agreement because we noted that she is not holding a
Singapore driving license.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




