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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: 30 September 2020 10:09 AM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: Accident on 30/11/2019 involving SHF 475L & XE 1978L (China Taiping's insured)   

Our Ref: TAX/11/19/2144/lg 

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Khanchna, 
 
GIA had deliberated and decided that the settlement should be 50/50%.  
 
In view of it, we will accept your offer of $1,580.00. Please let us have your DV. Thanks.  
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd   

 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 10 June 2020 6:03 PM 
To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: LAST ATTEMPT Re: Accident on 30/11/2019 involving SHF 475L & XE 1978L (China Taiping's insured) Our 
Ref: TAX/11/19/2144/lg  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Lee Gek, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Your hirer did not stop to check even though our Insured vehicle was stationary and encroached into his path. 
  
As such, we opine that both parties should exercise caution. 

We maintain our proposal for settlement on 50% basis for a global sum of $1,580.00(all in). 

Please confirm acceptance. 

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 


