8/5/2020 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook
Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 2837 X & SLX 7773 M ON 25 NOVEMBER 2019 - CALL
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Thu 2/1/2020 2:06 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

[ﬂJ 3 attachments (2 MB)
SLE2837X_estimate_finalisation.pdf; SLE2837X_invoice.pdf; SLE2837X_report.pdf;

Your Ref:
Our Ref : SLE 2837 X

2 January 2020

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department
Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 2837 X & SLX 7773 M ON 25 NOVEMBER 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SLE 2837 X, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert. We are pleased to
inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SLE
2837 X & SLX 7773 M on 25 November 2019. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the
amount as stated below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) :$ 2,100.00

Loss of Use (repair days as proposed by SJE) 1 $ 420.00 ($140/day X 3 days)
Loss of Use (for PRI from 04/12/2019 to 05/12/2019) : $ 140.00 ($140/day X 1 day)
Total: : $2,660.00

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the
next 7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if
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required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SLE 2837 X and the Singapore Accident Statement of
SLE 2837 X for your easy reference.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 15t June 2019, we have shifted to and are now
operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.
Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

6745 3811
6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 4, 2019 2:36 PM

To: VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar <shekhar.batham@axa.com.sg>

Cc: AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>; customer.service@axa.com.sg
<customer.service@axa.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 2837 X & SLX 7773 M ON 25 NOVEMBER 2019 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Your Ref:
Our Ref: SLE 2837 X

4 Dec 2019

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

Attn: Claims Department Via Email

Dear Sir/Mdm,
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 2837 X & SLX 7773 M ON 25 NOVEMBER 2019 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Thank you so much for your reply dated 4 December 2019. We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable
to your selection of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the Single Joint Expert.

In compliance with the New State Courts Practice Directions, we shall await your kind office to instruct LKK Auto
Consultants Pte Ltd (as the Single Joint Expert) to attend to the pre-repair survey of our client's damaged
vehicle at our premise at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808.

We seek your assistance in arranging for the pre-repair survey by 6 December 2019 (Friday), 1500H so that
we can commence repair on our client's damaged vehicle as soon as possible and expedite the return of the
vehicle to our client.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

**Kindly be informed that with effect from 15t June 2019, our new mailing address is:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

From: VISHNU BATHAM Shekhar <shekhar.batham@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, December 4, 2019 1:36 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Subject: Acknowledgement Your ref : SLE2837X Our ref : SOM0285FMC/LK

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir,

We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to
conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a Single Joint Expert.

List of our motor surveyors:
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Infiniti Appraisal Services
Priority Services Pte Ltd
AXA in house surveyor

NlwINn|=
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Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the
cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate
quotation in order for our surveyor to complete the pre repair survey.

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of one cause
of action, save as to costs and expenses.

Regards,
Shekhar Batham

AXA Singapore
BUSINESS
;.28 SERVICES

m&ﬁﬁﬁing s 5er§|¢es

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, December 04, 2019 12:51 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>; customer.service@axa.com.sg
Subject: [EXTERNAL] NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 2837 X & SLX 7773 M ON 25 NOVEMBER
2019

Your Ref:
Our Ref: SLE 2837 X

4 Dec 2019

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

Attn: Claims Department Via Email

Dear Sir/Mdm,

NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 2837 X & SLX 7773 M ON 25 NOVEMBER 2019

We are instructed to notify you of a road traffic accident on 25 November 2019 at about 1020H at TPE
towards SLE involving our client's vehicle registration number SLE 2837 X and vehicle registration number SLX

7773 M driven by your insured at the material time.
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As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice and your proposed list

of 10 recommended motor surveyors for our appointment.

Kindly note that if we do not hear from you by 6 December 2019 (Friday), 1300H, we will be forwarding our
proposed list of 10 motor surveyors for your appointment, in accordance to the new regulations.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

6745 3811
6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named
addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the
content of this message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender
immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do
not necessarily represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any other entity of the AXA Group,
unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD
Speciatise in salen of new & reconditioned bikes
i oo i

MS CARZ LEASING PTE LTD INVOICE NO: 2017/C207
201401066R
DATE: 02/01/2020

VEHICLE NO: SLE 2837 X

MAKE : HONDA ENGINE NO : L15B4034120

MODEL : VEZEL 1.5X CVT CHASSISNO :RUI11114114
ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Total lump sum repair including supply of parts and labour

- Adjusted total lump sum repair costs S$2,100.00

Total amount payable S$2,100.00

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd



