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NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD

Hlk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24 #02-01 AME AutoPoint Singapore 568047
Tel 5655 5847 Fax: #481 5727 c-mul : ngemictommportpleld @gmel.com
Reg No: 201812604

05/122019

AXA Ins Singapore Pte Ltd

Attn: Motor Claims Dept .

Dear Sir,

RE: ACCIDENT ON 28/11/2019 @14:10HRS
INVOLVING VEH NO.: SJUT931IM & SGS5470K

CLAIMS AGAINST SGS5470K
CLAIM REF: SO9MO028LGMC/LK

LKK Auto Consullants hence notify
the Repairer of e following:
* To msurvey betorecafier 1wy g
» To depiay daraged part's| Surng resurney
= Ports prices are 30tsed] 1 confermation
* Thisd party survey i3 0n 8 “Wilhout Prejudics” bess
* N iegal madilication]s] iy slkoend
* Supplernentary demis] muat ba resurveped gnd
8 subyect 1o S appeovad from insurancy Compeny

Acknowieged by Fecace:
Sgrense.
Date:

We submit herewith our direct claim estimate quotation as follow -

Replacement parts. Ty Vios

| Rear Bumper r $ 38532
! Rear Bumper Retainer! /l/!\". $ 5084
1 Rear Fender RH "‘I"‘f"”' $§ 9353%
| Rear Rim RH- Repair . L,ﬁf,,j.( $ 20000 [oo
! Rear Door RH- Repntr § 78962
1 Rear Door Protector RH s 814 Colsay)
$ 245330
Less25% §$ 61333
§ 1,83997
6  Clips,Fender Lining @$4.00 X S.Nett n $ 2400
| RemrTyeRH ¢ S.Nett 6 M $ 15000
To remove all damaged parts with all necessary component/attachment s 80000 s
straighten chassis member,cut & weid panel repair/reshape dented body panel,
replace damaged parts,refit into position
Spray Painting $ 80000 épﬁ
Check wiring/proper function on lights and etc $ 5000 N
§ 366397
Anycﬂherpmtsndﬁnhmmm:mntrmmﬂwﬂlumaddmmnldmpd Hf:'ﬂ
Pimemmmhhﬁwl}mﬂMﬁHTmmfmm )
Yours faithfully. 7;0@19 I
NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD P/
EVELYN NG

e K

(ﬂ\ﬁ#

g et co-



!

. Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Crner 10 Type Company
Owner 1D 700D
e e TN
Vehicle Mo SIUTRIIM
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Imended Deregistration Date 05 Dec 201¢
Wehicle Make TOYOTA
Vehcle Model: VIOSEAUTO
Primary Colour Blue
Manufacturing Yesr 200%
Engine No. INZXY84523
Chassis Mo MROSIHY?3051344467
Maximum Power Output B80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Opean Morket Value: £12.717.00
Crriginal Registration Date 29 Dec 2009
First Registration Date: 29 Dec 2009
Transfer Count i
Actual ARF Paid $12717.00
e e
PARF Eligibility Yers
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date 2B Dec 2019
PARF Rebate Amournt £6,358.00
e e e e e e
COE Expiry Date 2B Dec 2019
COE Category: A - Car [1600ce & below)
COE Period(Years) 10
GQP Paid 21850200
COE Rebate Amount: £114.00
Total Rebate Amount £6,472.00

The information contained herem is correct as at 05 Dec 2019

OK



12/572019 Claim Portal

LKIK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Pl

<« Service Request Details Somgvr- G,
Claim ? Gﬂ"llﬁ »?
S9MO28LG T Wavam 5 1219
Reference
Nune’ v ."1
Loss Date €.V
November 28, 2019
Report Date
Dec 5, 2019 9:31:00 AM

Request Date
December 5, 2019

Due Date
December 12, 2019

Vendor Mame
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TF)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

SEMvices

Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

MNext Step
Agree to perform service

Dol Wit oot Windd

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SIU7931M

hMps.iivp smarciaims axs.com. sg/olaim-portalhtmifindex-vendor-service-raguests himi'service-requestsMsernviceRegquesiNumber=150278 117



12/5/2019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TR} = Men

MOOE
VIOS E AUTOD

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

CHEE LEE CHIANG
BA CHEMPAKA AVENLUE, 349421, Singapare

Claim Handler

KHONG Lynn
68804892
lynn khong@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Messages Invoices History Dacuments Asspssment Matrics Motes

hnps:fivp ;mndﬂmnmmwmmmmmnmmwmmmwuw:mhwmmmnn

n



Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: ngs motorsport <ngsmaotorsportpteltd@gmall.com>

Sent: Thursday, 5 December, 2019 10:27 AM

To: KADRI Mateen

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Your Ref : SJU7931M Qur Ref : SSMO28LGMC/LK
Hi,

Appoint LKK Auto, pls note car in already.

Evelyn Ng
DID HP 9695 5547

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2a
#02-01 AMK AutoPoint
Singapore 568047

On Thu, Dec 5, 2019 at 9:47 AM KADRI Mateen <mateen.kadri@axa.com.sg> wrote:

“WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir,

we want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer's vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor warkshop. We propose to use ane of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to

conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a Single Joint Expert.

List of our motor surveyors:
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Infiniti Appraisal Services
Priority Services Pte Ltd
AXA in house surveyor

ot =of |5 o

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost
of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate
quotation in order for our surveyor to complete the pre repair survey.



If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of one cause
of action, save as to costs and expenses.

Regards,

Mateen Kadri

) BUSINESS
.34 SERVICES

redefining / services

From: ngs motorsport [mailto:ngsmotorsportpteltd @gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, December 04, 2019 4:35 PM

To: 5G AXA Insurance 5M AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey(@axa.com.sg>
Subject: [EXTERNAL) Notification Of Accident For Our Veh SJU7931M

Dear Sir/Madam,

RE: Accident on 28/11/2019 @14:10hrs
Along Junction Of Desker Rd & Kg Kapor Rd
Involving SJU7931M & SGS5470K

Claims Againts Veh SGS5470K [AXA)

Vehicle SJU7931M (In workshop)

Kindly be informed that an accident involving my/our vehicle no. SJU7931M and vehicle(s) no. SG55470K had taken
place at/along Junction Of Desker Rd & Kg Kapor Rd on date 28/11/2019 at time 14:10 hours.



Please let us/me know within 2 working days from the date of this notice if you wish to carry out or waive a pre-
repair inspection.

If I/we did not hear from you within 2 working days, |/we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further notice
and I/we shall claim for the additional loss of use arising from the giving of this notification to you.

Kindly let us have your claims reference, officer in charge of this case and please let us have your clients advice on
guantum and liability.

Warmest Regards,

Evelyn Ng
DID HP 9695 5547

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2a
#02-01 AMK AutoPoint
Singapare 568047

~-—-Disclaimer---—-

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any
other antity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



Consuftaniy
s s = Eve Lpek Company Hogwiration No. 195607 1888

F’ l'fl' r‘{’ Auiln

FLUTUAYE G 2 2E PAYA LR INDOSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 405933 TEL @ (0651 62563861 FAX {(065) 62564115

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 17/01/2020
Survey Details:

Date of loss 28-Nov-19

Date of appointment 5-Dec-19

Date of survey 5-Dec-19

Location of survey MNGS TRADING

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number SJU 7931M
Make and Model TOYOTAVIOSE A
Date of registration 29/12/2009
Excess

Market Value 528,000
Parf Rebate 56,472
Mett Loss 521,528

Repair details:
Initial Estimate B 3,663.97 |

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 150.00
Check items (estimata) S E
Labour 5 1,000.00
Total 5 1,150.00
Lump Sum(if applicable) s =

|Number of days for repair 3




- r alistm
__Il F: _iJ -_’:::ruun:lﬂll

B o = Pie Lin Company Reglatration No. 1998071358

UMD AYE B, 0l 25 FAY AU NI STRIAL PAKK. SINGAPORE J08935 TEL @ 000 n2563801 FAN 1 1065) 62584015

Remarks:

03 RECOMMENDED REPAIR DAYS + 1PRS = 4DAYS

Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Proposed repair cost s 1,150.00
Loss of use 5 240,00 |adays x S60
Loss of rental 5 -
Loss of income 5 R
LTA search fees S 7.45
Others 5 -
Propased Total 5 1,397.45




172020 Clmim Portal

« <MANDATE IA> - S9M02 CCIDENT INVOLVI
SGS 5470K (Ol) & SJU 9 P) ON 28 /11/2019
Type
© Question
Message

LIABILITY: 100% BOLA 54a - INFORMED Ol ABOUT TP CLAIM AND NCD ISSUE. AGREED TO SETTLE AT
BEST. WE SEEK YOUR MANDATE AT $1397.45 (CLAIMING LOU). MANDATE |A HAS BEEN UPLOADED
IN SMARTCLAIM. KINDLY LET US HAVE YOUR APPROVAL/INSTRUCTION. THANKS - CCL 17/01/2020

hittps./ivp.smartciaims. axa.com.sglclaim-portalhimlindex-vendor-senvice-requests himi#service-raquesisivisw-message/?serviceRequestNumbe ... 111



Misasrs

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD

BIK 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A #02-01 AMK AutoPoint Singapore 568047

HP : 9695 5547 Fax: 6481 5772 e-mail: ngsmotorsportptelidiad gmall.com

Reg No. 201812604N

AXA Insurance Singapore Pie Lid
143 Cecil Street

#01-01 GB Building

Singapore 069542

Ann: Motor Claim Dept

Bill No.: IV20180445

Date : 26/122019

Oty Description Unit Price | Amount
Your Rel: S9MO028LGMC/LK
Accident On Junction Of Desker Rd & Kg Kapor Rd
Involving SJU793 1M & SGS5470K
Claims Against SGSS470K
Lump Sum Repair $  1,150.00
Survey By: Guo Qiang (LKK)
Grand Total | § 1,150.00

Goods sold are not refundable

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD

—

E&OE




GAARICY

MARKETING

VEH LEASE AGREEME
Agreement Date: _|& oct J4[q

Referrer Name Caree ool

NRIC :
Car plate no.:
Company  Maric Marketing Pte Ltd
Having its registered office at:
9 Tagore Lane #03-04, Singapore 787472
(hereinafter known as "The Owner”) Iy %
Rental Beginson: __ 11 pnv 216 tvu
Time Out & Sign (L. YT o
Office No: 6452 4300
Office hour : 10 am =7 pm
Date & Time In; 4 Yec 2o
signed by Staff: _[455 PN ‘w \%ﬁ
Hirer's Name: __£8latiaamm l6 2 pamasemy ic:__ S 503433

Address: Bl 37 TEloe tawaal  Crereenb fre-§ ol 0d00as)

(herenafier known as “the Hirar

harely agress that the Ownaer shall kst and the Hirer shall take the vehicle described below or a replacement vehicle
provided by the Owner (hereinaltet known as "theVehicle®) upon the terms and conditions hereinafter appearing.

= ol 9 “ 1:

1.DESCRIPTION OF VEHICLE i heha et e pagpnt
L Make & Model :_ Tmpta Uek 2- L paccd |28
b, Registration No - Sy AU ~ A
e Milenge : 2 = 4435
a4 Contoct No : Gk £330 o ..___:-’-9
¢ Bank Account 1S
{ FEmail : el e ot =AZ00 s [H;

5 dbyr
2. RENTAL PERIOD: aidnth = X275 ~

3. DEPOSIT AMOUNT: 4 30

1. FIRST WEEK RENTAL STARTS ON AMOUNT
e
S.RENTALFEE SS 0 pefudsr

4. Rental Fes includes the following iems:

oM - Deturn -

i Unbimited mileage:
i, Service and maintenance,
i, Road Tax and Radio License:
iv. Mowr Insurance Covernge (Excess upplicuble);
v. 24-hours breakdown and emergency service (in Singapore only); and  _———

; \A

1 .
Hirer's Initial Diuner’sﬁ'ﬂtial




17312020 Claim Portal

Re:<MANDATE IA 028LG [ACCIDEN owmc
“  SGS 5470K (ﬁ & SJU 31M'tT|J)0N2 8/11/2019}

Type
© Question

Message
Dear CCL. proceed. However, to offer at 3days first. Thanks

hittps.divp. smariclaims. axs com sg/claim-poralihimifindex-vendor-service-requests. himiifsarvice-requestsview-message TserviceRegquesiNumbe 11



Cecilia Chuna (LKK Auto)

From: ngs motorsport <ngsmotorsportpteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2020 3:33 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: LOD For Our Insured Veh SJUT931M

Attachments: Authorise To Act.pdf; IV20180445 pdf; SGS5470K LTA Search.pdf;, SJUTS31M Driver

Contract.pdf; SJU7931M SAS Report.pdf

Dear Sir,
RE: VEH INVOLVING SJU7931M/SGS5470K ON 28/11/2019
We understand that you are the insurer of _SGS5470K_ vehicle.

1/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle STUT931M have been completed repairs to my/our satisfaction by
M/s NGS Motorsport Pte Ltd . I/We therefore propose to claim from you as follow:-

a) Cost of Repair $1150.00
b) LOU 4days @$60.00 $ 240.00 (Include Sunday)
¢) LTA Search § 745

£1397.45

A copy each ol the following supporting documents is attached

a)  Authorise to act

b) Cert of insurance

¢)  Ouwr bill M/S NGS MotorSport Pte Lid
d) LTA Search

¢) SJUT931M SAS Report

1Y Driver Contract

Your early reply to the above claims would therefore be much appreciated.

Your faithfully,

Evelyn Ng
DID HP 9695 5547

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2a
#02-01 AMK AutoPaoint
Singapora 568047



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 19980T128R GST Reg. No. 19-8807198-R

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CCA4/ASM18021512/Gga3q2

Rkt N

irs :- THIRD PAF

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01 _ —
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811 - llll[“l"lmlll
ATTN-LYNN Code: ASM

‘U’nh Inspected

Insured Veh. SGS 5470 SJU Ta31M
Policy No. GA330525M Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. S9M028LG Excess ($) 0.00

Assign From

Make & Model TOYOTAVIOS c.c 1497

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. MRO53HYS305134467 Colour BLUE
Odometer 261475 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

28112018
Survey held at NGS MOTORSPORT FTELTD
BLK 10 AMK IND PK 2A #02-01 SINGAPORE 588047

Accident Date

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

Davs of




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Al M. 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
’J‘_. TEL 8256 3581 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg No: 189607198R GST Reg No. 18-9607198-R Page No 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJU T931M

1|REAR BUMPER (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 385.32 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER RETAINER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 59.64 -
1|REAR FENDER RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 935.38 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 789.63 -
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -542 54 -
1.627.63 -
1|REAR RIM RH (SN)(CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 200.00 100.00
1|REAR DOOR PROTECTOR RH (SN){CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 83.14 50.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -70.79 -
212.35 150.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
G|CLIPS FENDER LINER [@%$4.00 (SN){CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 24.00
1|REAR TYRE RH (SN){CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 150.00
174.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE ALL DAMAGED PARTS WITH ALL B0O0.00 400.00
NECESSARY COMPONENT/ATTACHMENT STRAIGHTEN
CHASSIS MEMBER ,CUT & WELD
PANEL ,REPAIR /RESHAPE DENTED BODY
PANEL.REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS ,REFIT INTO
POSITION.
SPRAY PAINTING. 800.00 600.00
CHECK WIRING /PROPER FUNCTION ON LIGHTS AND NOT NECESSARY 50.00
ETC.
1,650.00 1,000.00
3,663.98 1,150.00

AMENDED COST OF REPAIRS

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19021512/Gga3q2



Page No.2 of 2
Report Ref No. CC4/A5M19021512/Gga3q2

I

XING GUO QIANG HO LEONG CHUAN

M.MATAI AMSAE-A Automotive Assossor
Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart s mads solsly for the dse and benef of the Client named an the iront page of this Repon.
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