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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 9:14 AM
To: A T
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: cc4/aig19021504/kkb3

TrackingTracking: Recipient Delivery

A T

Admin A

Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 23/1/2020 9:14 AM

olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 23/1/2020 9:14 AM

Dear Mr. Tan, 

 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN8240E & SMC4625B ON 26/11/2019  ALONG TAMAN WARNA ROAD  

We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below. 
 
Please be informed that AIG has rejected the Third party claim in view of the Traffic Police Investigation Outcome. 
 
We are sorry to inform you that we cannot reveal the Third party’s name and IC number as we are bound by the Private 
Data Protection Act 2012. 
 
Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: A T <prospects47@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 4:15 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: cc4/aig19021504/kkb3 
 
Dear Khanchna 
 
I refer to your letter cc4/aig19021504/kkb3. 
 
Please kindly share the details of the other driver  (Name/IC) of SMC4625B  , who has launched the 3rd party 
claim against me. 
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Per the attached TP investigation,  the law has clearly stated that the fault lies with the other 
driver who is fully at fault and fully liable. Furthermore, the Law and Police found that the 
other driver is guilty of causing hurt to me in the process. 
 
AIG and LKK should be 100% fully confident of recovering in FULL – be it repairs or total loss – 
from the other driver of SMC4625B/her insurance NTUC.  AIG should also be 100% confident 
of defending the 3rd party claim against me and as i said, not pay a single cent to them. 
Instead we will claim 100% against them for damages to my car and loss of use.  
 
As mentioned,  kindly share the details of the other driver  (Name/IC) of SMC4625B  , who has launched the 
3rd party claim against me.  
 
 
Thank you 
 
Mr.Tan  

 
 


