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Yvonne Wnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Operation / Candy Ong <operation@tlauto.comsg>

Sent: Friday, January 10, 2020 4:22 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: Before paint photos, supplier's invoice and finalised for SMM3537L
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Noted with thanks

Best Regards,
Candy Ong
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd

——-Qriginal Message——-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, January 10, 2020 3:55 PM

To: Operation / Candy Ong <operation@tlauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Before paint photos, supplier's invoice and finalised for
SMM3537L

Hi Candy,

Finalised amount confirmed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51, Paya
Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933) Save the Earth. Print
only when necessary.

——Original Message—

From: Operation / Candy Ong [mailto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]

Sent; Wednesday, 18 December, 2019 3:45 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Before paint photos, supplier's invoice and finalised for SMMI537L

Dear Rasul,

Please find attached before paint photos, supplier's invoice for your
attention and finalization



Kindly revert.

Best Regards,
Candy Ong
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd



Yvonne Wunﬂ SLKK Auto!

From: Yvonne Wong (LEK Auto)

Sent: Friday, December 06, 2019 4:30 PM
To: 'Operation / Yu Ching’

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SMM9537L- UL & IF

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMM9537L (excess $1,200/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to
arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yypnnewongi@ [kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Operation / Yu Ching [mallto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, December 06, 2019 12:19 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SMM8537L - UL 8 IF

Dear Yvonne,
Attached undertaking letter and interview form for your kind attention.

Thanks & regards,
Yu Ching




View Received Message

Thes madl 15 essociated with :

*SMMB537L (BO013BES1T75G)
co
Mow 27 2018 9:004AM
[DAIMER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE FTE TD]
Tong Luck Auto Pie LI

megly | Reply All | Mark as Unresd | P""?”"_"’E | _Delers Message | Forware. —_ n

From AIG Asin Pacific Insyance Pte, Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on 06/12/2019 14:53 PM.
To LK _HD
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandr#® Approved (553835.80) - SMMB537L - Claim Handler: Gan, Hunchung

Approved: 3835 80,

| ———————SS

pocu _uinﬁ?ﬁ_—w“’ Y
There are no SocuEnts.




View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

“SMM9537L (BD013BB9175G)
oD
Mov 27 2019 9:00AM
[DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE LTD]
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd

[“Reply | Reply Al || Mark as Unread | _Print Message | Delote Message | Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent an 06/12/2019 12:48 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject SMM9S37L / OD / 27/11/2019 / Coverage & Excass update

Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Pleasa note that policy Is in force and excess amount is $1200,00

Thank you
Gan, Hunchung

' DOCUMENTS SUMMARY -
There are no documants,




o - -
Your password will expire in 7 days. Click here to changg it,
- Estimated cost of repair for repairing of vehicle no.: SMM9537L - OD Claim

From. AIG SGP, Claims-Survey

To: Admin A, assignments

Cc Fong, Andy-SY, Fan, Winnle-L\W
Sent:  12/5/2018 11:50:36 AM

Attachments: T8 SMM35371—Estimate.ndf

Hi LKK,
Kindly assist to survey.

Thanks & regards
lennifer Chan

From: Operation / Candy Ong [mallto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 5 December, 2019 11:29 AM

To: Fan, Winnie-L\W

Ce: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Estimated cost of repair for repairing of vehicle no.: SMM9537L -- OD Claim
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Winnie,

Please find attached documents for your information and necessary action

The vehicle is now garage at our workshop

Kindly arrange your surveyor to inspect the vehicle at an earlier date

Thanks & regards,
Candy Ong

|

]

Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive

#07-01/06 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6250 0088 Fax: 6250 5545
Emall: operation@tlauto.com.sg



Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co req e 1sseor1eer)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tal: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@lkkauto com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insuranca Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

AlG Building 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408833
Attn: Date: 06 Dec 2019

Preliminary Advice

Vahicle No : SMMS537L Accident Date 27112018
Make : MERCEDES-BENZ E300 Policy No. : 999995730
Assignment Date : 06/12/2019 Excess : 550.00
Date of Inspection  : 05/12/2019 Est. Duration of Repair :4.00
Inspection Al TONG LUCK AUTO PTELTD (HQ)

160 SIN MING DRIVE, #07-01 SIN MING AUTQCITY
SINGAPORE 575722

Paint of Impact | General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained Impact / damages ofs front portion and parts claimed are consistent lo the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 507560
Ravised Amount S5 3,706.00
Check llems (Estimated) 58 129.80
Total 8% 3,835.80
Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 55
Pre-Accident Value 55 282.000.00
COE / PARF Rebate 5% B88,448.00
Salvage Value 5%
Margin for Repair 55 183,552.00

Remarks

{ X | The vehicla is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage, Kindly let us
have your authorisation.

{ } The vehicle s uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite lendar for tha wreck.

{ } Other commants :



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |0 Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Detalls

ehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehiche Make:

Yehicke Moded:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Na.:

Chassls Mo

Mandmiuem Power Output:
DOpen Market Value:

Original Reglstration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actusl ARF Pald:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Elighbility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Perlad(Years):

0P Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein s correct as at 06 Dec 2019

Company
T78E

SMMBSITL

Yes

06 Dec 2019
MERCEDES BENZ
E300 AVG [R18 LED)
Silver

2019
264%2080003558
WDD2130832A4676357
190.0 kw (254 bihp)
$43.257.00

22 il 2019

22 hil 201%

1]

$85.863.00

Yes
21 Jul 2029
$64357.00

21 Jul 2027

B - Car above 1600ce or 97kW (130bhp]

10

$42.5564.00
$34,051.00
$98,448.00
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iyl iy b Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
r Faneal On Prnag Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 04/12/2019 13:44

FLEMTTED By Mubherrmsd Facal Bin

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1 Please neport ':""'I'."'I'.Ux the dolads of he acoidant 10 Speed up o CRIME procnes
2 This Farm muai b completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authonssd Dnves

3. Inforrnaficn provided must be as ruthlul and accurale as possible . Ay wilful misrepresantation or wilholdng of maieanl facls may allow MBuUrancs COMpares ko
repudiale policy |abdlty

4. Tha lssus and scoaptance of this Form by msurance companses is not bn admission of policy labdity on the part of ihe insurahce camparies

5 Any false repording may be refurred to the Police for investigation

& This repar] will be foewarded by the insurers of the GLA Recards Manageman| Captre sstablahed by the General Insurance Assaciation of Singapare (GLA) for
archiving and that copiss of thm report wil. for @ Tea be made availabls upon applicaton by misresind partios

T By tw lodgermanl al this repon 1o e segiess pou eereby consend Lo e arctisisg of e epon gl the centie and o copess of ihe repor bang made availabie

alarasaid
Date Of Report 30/11/2018 15:27

Date Of Accident 271172018 08:00

Exact Localion Of Accident TIONG BAHRU MARKET CARPARK
Country/State of Loss SINGAFORE

Vehicle Registration Number SMMas3TL

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE FTE LTD
Co Reg No 189803778Z

Email Address NORAZMAN ABDUL_AZIZ@DAIMLER.COM
Mobile Phone No

Altarnative Phona No OFFICE-BBTE207S

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer MERCEDES-BENZ

Model E300 AVG (R18 LED)

ﬁ.;anﬂgf:.lgsﬁ:.n:m which vehicle was baing usad al PRIVATE

Are you claiming under your own insurance palicy VES

for repair 1o your vehicle?

Il Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

MName of Insurance Company AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
Type OI Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleat Palicy YES

Policy Number 9689995730

Covar Note Mumber M.A

Driver

Mame of Drlver LO LEONG HAY

MRIC No S1656058H

Date OFf Birth 1110/1984

Occupation INDODOR

Date Of Driving Pass 04/04/1983

Driving Experiance 36 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS

Gender MALE

Mabile Numbar (LOCAL) +55-85116080

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address NOEMAIL

Pags 1 of 16



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured’s Company
Il No., Ralationship of tha Drivar with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Dnver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Condilions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
invalved In the accident

Was any body njured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any othar matarial or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown persanis)
saliciting/offenng accident claims assistance

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reportad 1o the police?

It Yag Please state which Pollce Station
Was notice of intended Frosacution given?
If Yes against wham?

Circumstances of Accident

MA

NO
OTHER - HIRER

COLLIDED INTO PROPERTY
CLEAR
DRY

NO

1
NO
NO
YES

NO

NO

NO

| 'was wurming right out of car park lot whan my car front nght side grazed across @ lamp pos| causing damages 1o my car driver
door and front right fender. No injuries were invalved

Attachment(s)
Are acciden! photos available for altachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was thera any audio recorded?

YES
ND
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Maka/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vahicle Categary

MName of Driver
NRIC/Passport Numbar
Contact Number

Address

Posicods

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damagn

Mo Of Passenger (Including Driver)

LAMPPOST
NA/UNKNOWN

Page 2 of 18
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Sketch Plan #3 Pg. 1

ACCIDENT STATEMENT (2000 characters)

| was turning right out of carpark lot when my car front right side grazed across a lamp
post causing damages 1o my car driver door and front right fender. No injuries were
involved.

Tam Youcher No

DECLARATION

"W declare mat the apove particutars & information provided abowe ang rud o evary axpect

VERIFIED BY AJAX MARS REPORTING OFFICER -
HASHIM BIN KAMARI
MARS Officor
Roglsinred Cwnire o0 Dimeen’s Sligrustum
Jab Complate DatedTimea [t Tirna
30 Movember 2018 &l 827 AM 30 Novernber 2018 al 027 AM

Page & of 14



UNDERTAKING

| L0 Lo HAY (NRIC No. S16560S5€H ) 1eraby
confirm that the Singapore Accident Statement lodged by me on 30/n/11
at I15°2F  hours pertaining to the accident Involving motor car Reg. No
CMMAS 3FL iy which | was the driver are true and accurate to the best of my
knowledge, information and beliel

| acknowledge that my insurers are not liable under the contract of insurance if there &
a breach of palicy terms and conditions.

in the event that an unrelated/unreported third party property or injury claim arises of
there is evidence emerges that there is a breach of policy terms and conditions, |
imevocably undertake to absolve my insurer from all liability under the contract of
insurance and | undertake to re-pay any sums paid by my insurers pursuant 10 the
contract of Insurance upon receipt of written demand by my insurers.

W

Signature
MName of Insured [ Driver W eV W
Nric No. s N
- - SlsepskH
a .
3/n/ 19
Signature : ﬂ = Q
‘.4\4. '!ll
Name of Policyholder : %”E',;L
Nric No. : .
TGP OREFTEt———
Date Lnteway Drive
BN
Singapore 608531
Phone, 5849 8113

DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE FTE.LID
1 Gateway Drive
#15-08 Westgate Tower
Singapore 508531
Phone: B840 8118
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TOR A IN FORM

NAME : L0 wEoNEr HEY
VEHICLE NUMBER SMMASIFL
DATE/ TIME OF ACCIDENT 22/11/11  09:60
PLACE OF ACCIDENT T Tov§g B U MAEKET (AR PARKE

THIRD PARTY VEHICLE [IF ANY)

FEEEEEEEEEET RS R RRRE R R R A R R R R R R EREEERREEE R FEAEEGEEEA SRS SRR REREREERRERRRREE

WHERE DID YOU START YOUR JOURNEY AND WHERE WAS THE INTENDED DESTINATION BEFORE THE ACCIDENT?

Leawn) Tiong Bahry Merkel (rpark vl Weacling home

DID YOU DRINK ANY ALCOHOLIC DRINKS BEFORE YOU DRIVE ON THE DAY OF THE ACCIDENT? |F YES, DID THE TRAFFIC
POLICE CONDUET ANY BREATHE-ANALYSER TEST ON YOU? IF YES, WHAT WAS THE RESULTS?

NO

WHAT |5 THE TYPE OF COLLISION AND THE EXTENSIVENESS OF THE DAMAGES TO ALL VEHICLES INVOLVED?

Cothiced 190 property , odamast to tar diwer dsor anal frovd right
fw..wy. LYE il;juul-:r{ tewluged |

WERE ¥OU OR YOUR PASSENGER/S INIURED? IF INIURED, WHICH HOSPITAL? WERE YOU TAKEN TO THE TRAFFIC POLICE
FOR INVESTIGATIONT?

SHE

NAME:

IVEN TO MY BEST KNO



WS : AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
78 SHENTON WAY #07-16
AlG BUILDING
SINGAPORE 079120
ATTN : MOTOR CLAIM DEPT
TEL : 6419 3000 FAX 84153723
YOUR REF NO
CLAIM TYPE OWN DAMAGE

ACCIDENT DATE : 27/M1/2018

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No : SMM3537L

ESTIMATE

NOD

DATE
POLICY NO

VEH

-

TONG LUCK AUTO PTE LTD
1680 SIN MING DRIVE #07-01/06 SIN MING AUTOCITY,. SINGAPORE 575722
Tel: 5250 0088 Fax 6250 5545
Email operation@tlauto.com. sg
GST No: 201700521W UEN No: 201700521W

PAGE: 1

: QUOT201811-000081{00)

REG NO

MAKEMODEL |

CHASSIS NO
ENGINE NO
REG. DATE

1 051212019
. B28885730

SMMS53TL

MERCEDES BENZ EJ00 AVG

(R1B LED)

: WDD2130832A576357
: 26482080003556
c 2019

Description Quantity Unit Price Amount
83 =1
PARTS
1 Front doar - RH Hf 1 1,150.00 1.150.00
2 Front door weatherstrip - RH Al o q 1 185.00 185.00
3 Front door hinges - RH ¥ (To F}K!Lrﬁw - ZIf 118.00 236.00
4 Front door vertical seal - RH M= = 1 40.00 40 00
5 Front door trimboard rivets - RH 11-‘-‘-‘ 7 20 6.50 130,00
8 Frontfender-RH h{ ~ 1 620.00 62000
7 Front side skirt chrome - RH (/™ 1 135.00 135.00
2.498.00
Add 10% 243 60
2.745.60
LABOUR
8 Totransfer RH front damaged door interior mechanism and glass 1 150.00 :ytﬁ?a
o new door
g To check and rectify wiring system 1 80.00 5?\3?:’%
10 To remove and refit rear bumper sensor 1 100.00 10000 X
11 To panel beat and repair RH front door pillar, RH front fender 1 1.000.00 1.?!{0!]5’- o
inner panel including replacement of parts and align where
necessary, 1o refit and adjust the same f ov
12 To spray paint on affected areas 1 1,000.00 1990700 b
2,330.00
TOTAL 5% 5,075.60
\o\ ADD GST @ 7% 355 29
g\'ﬂ' GRAND TOTAL S$ 5,430.89

SINGAPORE DOLLAR FIVE THOUSAND FOUR HUNORED

0% .;lﬁ FOR TON

wl

Dess SThA |

RTY AND CENTS EIGHTY-NINE ONLY
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) PTE LTD
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TONG LUCK AUTO PTELTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #07-01/06 SIN MING AUTOCITY, SINGAPORE 575722
Tel 6250 0088 Fax: 8250 5545
Emall operation@tlauto.com.sg
GST No: 201700521W UEN No: 201700521W

PAGE: 1
M/S - AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD. m
#5 SHIEN YR VU R 110 NO : QUOT201511-000081(00)
AlG BUILDING o
SINGAPORE 078120 DATE 0512120186
POLICY NO 909085730
ATTN = MOTOR CLAIM DEPT VEH REG NO | SMMB53ITL
TEL G418 3000 FAX B4153723 MAKEMODEL - MERCEDES BENZ E300 AVG
{R18 LED)
YOUR REF NO CHASSIS NO  : WDD2130832ABTE35T
CLAIM TYPE OWHN DAMAGE ENGINE NO : 26492080003556
ACCIDENT DATE & 271112019 REG DATE : 2018
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No : SMM8537L
Description Cuantity Unit Price Amount
1 s%
PARTS
1 Front door - RH Hf 1 1.150.00 1.160.00 <
2 Fromt door weaihorsing - RH A ‘f 1 185.00 185.00 -
3 Fromvdooehinges—an-T CTep)¥ / bbb =700 £p¢ o0 23606
4 Front door vertical seal - RH M= =~ | 40.00 40.00 .
5 Fronl door trimboard rivets - RH M - 20 6.560 130.00 ~
6 Front fender-RH &4 <~ & D, 26020 ! 520,00 620.00 ~
-~ E]
7 Frant side skin chrome - RH (/™ "’9/’ 13 400 1 135.00 135.00 ~
e — 2.486.00
T Add 10% 248 80
ugb- 00 S 4
S Ay 2.745.60
LABOUR
B Totranster RH front damaged door interior mechanism and glass 1 150.00 1‘.52{ do
to naw door
8 Tu check and rectily wiring syslem 1 80,00 gp‘tﬁ‘ﬁ:
10 To remove and iefil.rear bumper 6ens0F —— —A 100.00—100; ™
11 To panel beat and repair RH front door plllar, RH franl fender 1 1,000.00 1.99‘%5%0
inner panel including replacement of parts and align whare 6' o0
necessary, to refit and adjust the sama
12 To spray painl on affected areas 1 1.000.00 1 .E.Dﬂ
2,330.00 _IJ,U
TOTAL $§ 5,075.60
ADD GST@ 7% 35529
GRAND TOTAL 55 5.430.8%
e,
SINGAPORE DOLLAR FIVE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED THIRTY AND CENTS EIGHTY-NINE ONLY
'?asu.l_
g 2,706-00 rqmlmés.&'
Xs
‘.,r i c:ll'j' O-005 M
— — i1
B o .5' 0é-00
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Cose Nitified Est Submitted Ad) Assigned Ag) Apt Ad) Subrmidted Ins Auth'ed Status
for
oy |01 Dec 2019 DsDec 2018 lg5e3,708.00 |5$3,706.00 Purling Vor Survey
Edit Adj Rpt | N il J Concel Case I

| [Created by insurer]
DATMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE LTD, Co. Reyg No: 199803778Z, Tel +6585116080

| 3F1/2015 09:00 - -59
SMMO537L Date of Loss: |10 s nths and § Days From LTA Reg Gate (Man vr]]
Policy/Cower

Note No.: 895995730 (Comprahensive)

Excess: 5§1,200.00
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) 160 Sin Ming Drive, 807-01 Sin Ming AutoCity, 575722 Sin Ming - Tel: 6250 0088

AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) - Tel: 85-5415-3000 .. [Handled by Gan, Hunchung| Hunchung Ganaig com
LKK Auto Conmultants Pta Ltd (WQ) - Tel: 5256-3561 . [Handied by MOMD RASUL] .. [Final Rpt due 16/12/2019]
LO LEONG HAY [55 / Male) ,  NRIC: S1E56058M, Tel +65A5116080 Emall: NOEMAIL

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Insured
Wehicle Reg.
No.:

Claim Type:

OD / BOD13BB9175G

Repalirer:
Harudling
Insurer:
Adjuster:
Driver/Custo
dian:

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

« AIG_SG (06/12/2019): Alert = Adj Mandate Approved ($33835.80) - SMM953TL - Claim Handler: Gan, Hunchu...
» AIG_SG (06/12/2019): SMM9537L / OD / 27/11/2019 / Coverage & Excess update |

view Al | Compose case man |

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=

Due Date  Priority  Type
No results.

wiew Ml | Sesrch Tasks | Creste Hew Task | Complete |
Assigned By Completed On  Created On  Done?

Task Group Subject  Handler

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 17/1/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SMM9537L (BOD13889175G)
oD
Nov 27 2019 9:00AM

[DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE LTD]

Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Upioa Documents | Uplosd Photos | Compose Mew Letter | upioad vides | upmad ause | Viaw [View in Browser| =]
| Assessment Reports i1 ~| M
fo | Finalzed On LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmall | Print
1 |06/12/1811.57 | Adjuster Immediate Advice @ | Losa v
Photos/Images [Bperpmge [V W
Mo | Relabel/Recrder | LKN Auto Consultants Pre Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |06/12/19 10:57 | Accident Photo O worc | H
i |DBA12/1% 10157 Acridant Photo | war: | H
1 |DE/12/1% 10:57 | Accident Phote @ | ised ¥o
4 |DES12/19 10:57 Accidant Phote D | edws | A
5 |0612/18 10:37 | Accident Photo 0| waws | &
& |06/12/19 1057 Accident Photo g Loag G | B4
7 |oE/121910:57 | Accident Photo 0| wawe | B
8 |06/12/18 10/57 | Accident Phate Q| warc | &A
o |08/12/18 10:57 | Aceldent Phote Q| werc | A
10 |06/12/18 10:57 | Accident Photo 0| bars | @
11 |06/12/19 10:57 | Accident Photo Q| wors | A
12 |D6/12/1910:57 | Accident Photo Q| cwws | B
11 |0&/12/19 10:57 Accident Photo 0| leadrs |
14 |06/12/19 10:57 | Accidant Photo 0| erc || A
15 |06/12/19 10:57 | Accident Photo Q| v | A
16 |06/12/19 10:57 Accidant Photo Q| wers | F
17 |DB/12/19 10157 | Aecident Photo @ | 020 w6
18 |06/12/19 10:57 Accident Photo 0| edws | B4
{19 |o6/12/18 10:57 | Accident Phote 0| werc | A
20 |06/12/18 10:57 | Accident Photo Q| ers |
21 |06/12/19 10:57 | Accident Photo @ | wuaws | M
22 |06/12/19 10:57 | Accident Phote Q| woews | A
Documentation 1 per page «]| &
to | Relabal/Reorder | LKK Auto Consuftants Pre Ltd (HGQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |oE/12/19 1150 |GIA s Load POF
2 |06/12/1912:00 | Driver's Driving License Load POF
3 |06/12/1912:01 | Certificate of Insurance Load POF
4 |DE/12/19 12:02 | ESTIMATE ! Load PDF
5 |DE/12/1912:30 | UNDERTAXING Load POF
|6 |o82/1912:31  |INTERVIEW FORM Load POF
(7 [12/01720 15:15 | Parts Invelcn s Load POF
Linked Accident Report Documents
View [vimw in Browser] « |
Assessmuent Hoports 1 per I~} ¥
No | Finalized Cn Ajax Mars Pte Ltd {Bukit Merah) | Thumbnall | Print
1 |peanz/i2 1343 | Addendum Sheet [ BETTRCE
1 |p6/12/19 1943 | Accident Statement Losd HTM |
1 |D6/12/19 19:44 | Accident Statemant Laad HTM |
4 |DE/13/19 1948 | Accident Statement Load HTM
5 |D6/12/19 1946 | Accident Statement Lowg HTM
6 |DE/12/1919:46 | Accident Statermant Losd HTM |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 17/1/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

}Mﬂlﬂi Reports i >
(ko | Finalzed On Ajax Mars Pte Ltd [Bukit Merah) Thumbnail | Print
7 |06/12/19 19150 | Accident Statement Lopd HTM
B |D6/13/19 19:50 | Accident Statement Load HTM
O |D&/12/19% 19:50 | Accident Statement load HTH
Photos/Images 3 «|| &
o |Finatized On Ajax Mars Pte Ltd (Bukit Merah) Thumbnall | Print
1 |30/13/19 15:59 | Accident Photo D | adrs | A
2 |30/11/19 16:09 | Accident Photo g Lead 0G| B
31 |30/111916:09 | Accident Photo 0| weaws | B4
4 | 30/11/18 16:09 | Accidant Photo 0| edivc |
5 [30/1119 16:05 | Accldent Photo 0| wedws | F
i |30/11/19 16:09 | Accident Phota 0| weawrs | B
7 |30/11/19 16:09 | Accident Photo 0| waaws | A
B |30/11/19 16:08 | Accldent Photo | weawc | A
8 |30/11/19 16:09 Driving License 0| adiec | A
10 |30/11/19 16:08 | Driving License 0D Lwr: | A
Documentation _@ jv.|
Mo |Fihalsed On Ajax Mars Pte Ltd (Bukit Merah) Thumbnall | Print
1 |30/11/18 15:51 | Sketch Plan Q| oo
7 |3/11/1915:51 | Sketch Plan #2 0| wars | H
1 |30/11/19 15:51 | Sketch Plan #3 O oo
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | prime |

There are no document checklsts configured.

B el DA T
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 17/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico regno 1sssoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@Ikkauto.com.assignments@Ilkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

i:g ;ﬂ?ﬂ"'“ﬂfgg ';;ﬂ"mm Ple Lid > Our File No: CS/AIG18021482/R1YFIE2
wilding, nton Way #08-

Singapore 076120 Date: 17/01/2020

REFERENCE

DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE

Insured/Claimant: PTE LTD Policy No 8980905730
Date of Loss  27/11/2018 aaee®  op clam  g01383917SG
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMMO53TL
Make & Model, MERCEDES-BENZ E300, 3.0 (A) Engine No: 26492080003556
Reg Date 22/07/2019 (Man. Year 2019) Chassis No WDD2130832AB76357
Colour: Grey Cdometer 5158 km
Engine Capacity: 1991 cc
gﬂaﬂ;:n;at Value/Mew Car $$282 000.00
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Sleering (Serviceable) Yes Footbrake (Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 245/45 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 245/45 R18
Front Left Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Left Side: Pirelh 6§ mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm
Thar above vivues reprasent the remaring fyre reeds depth
/COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 2.745.60 2.486.00 259.60 946
Miscallaneous Hems D.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,330.00 1.220.00 1,110.00 47 54
Faintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 D.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 5,075.60 3,706.00 1,369.60 26.98
- Excess (S$) 1,200.00 1.200.00 0.00 D.00
(S5) 387560 2,506.00 1,369.60 3534
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S8§) 2729 175.42 8587 i534
Nett Amount (S§) 4,146.89 2,681.42 1,465.47 35.34
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 05122019
Date inspected: 05/12/2019 Inspecied Al: Tong Luck Auto Pte Lid (HQ)
160 Sin Ming Drive, #07-01 Sin Ming
AutoCity
Singapare 575722
Estimaled Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: YVONNE WONG YIN CHENG

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 17/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: This repart represents our findings at the ime snd place of inspection sfsled harem, Such inspection fas twen camad ouf ho the best of awr
imawiedge and ability Sul any other Nability under any offier Cireumstances in haraby axprossly axaluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 17/1/2020



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
i1 *FRONT DOOR - RH Bani 1,150.00F *1,150.00F
2 1 *FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP - RH Necessary 185.00F *185.00F
a 2 *FRONT DOOR HINGES - RH Serviceable 236.00F *F
4 1 *FRONT DOOR VERTICAL SEAL - RH Necessary 40.00F “40.00F
5 20 *FRONT DOOR TRIMBOARD RIVETS - RH Mecessary 130.00F *130.00F
8 1 *FRONT FENDER - RH Bent 620.00F *620.00F
T 1 *FRONT SIDE SKIRT CHROME - RH Cracked 135.00F *135.00F
F=Franchise pan

Sub Total (S§) 2,496.00 2,260.00
+ Margin on LN Items 10.00/10.00% [S$) 248 B0 226.00

Total Parts (S§) 2,T45.60 2,4B6.00

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm7fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 17/1/2020



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneoun ltema selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 TO TRANSFER RH FRONT DAMAGED DOOR INTERIOR MNew 150.00 80.00
MECHANISM AND GLASS TO NEW DOCR
2 TOCHECK AND RECTIFY WIRING SYSTEM New B0.0O 40.00
3  TOREMOVE AND REFIT REAR BUMPER SENSOR New 100.00 0,00
4  TOPANEL BEAT AND REPAIR RH FRONT DOOR PILLAR,  New 1.000.00 500.00
RH FRONT FENDER INNER PANEL INCLUDING
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS AND ALIGN WHERE
NECESSARY, TO REFIT AND ADJUST THE SAME
5  TO SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS MNew 1,000.00 600.00
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 2,330.00 1,220.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore. menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 17/1/2020



