Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 February, 2020 1:21 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Cc: MT _Claim_SG

Subject: RE' <SEEK MANDATE> SHD6481P - 19/19/19/VP05/022731 Lonpac - LKK REF

CC4/LPC19021430/ Qhb3 [E xternal Confidentiall

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Te (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

I

The all (8e%) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [maiIm'.vic:alpch@lkkaum.com]

Sent: Thursday, 13 February 2020 4:45 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com=

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com=; Admin A <admin-a@]lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: SHD6481P - 19/19/19/VP05/022731 Lonpac [External Confidential] -
LKK REF CC4/LPC19021430/Qhb3

Your Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022731
Our Ref: CC4/LPC19021430/Qhb3

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKK 6520M (OI) / SHD 6481P (TP) / OTHERS ON 30/11/2019

We refer to the subject matter and to the assignment dated 4™ December 2019 of Third-Party’s request to do
Direct Settlement with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It was reported that Insured vehicle was involved in a 3 vehicle chain collision and was the 2™ car and was
pushed forward from behind.

As such, in view of the MCF and BOLA scenario 28, we have to settle the claim from the TP vehicle.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “gMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD" as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER




Cost of Repair (w/gst) 59,037.40 55,073.96
Loss of Rental ($108.07 x 13 days) $1,404.91 $ 864.56 ($108.07 x & days)
Loss of Income ($60 x 13 days) S 780.00 $ 480.00 (360 x 8 days)
LTA Search Fee $ 7.00 $7.00

TOTAL | $11,229.31 $ 6,425.52

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 5 days

Weekends / Downtime 3 days
TOTAL | 8 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

L 74 T
Z.a%=% Wi sgye the Earth. Print only when necessary.

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient.
Use or distribution by an unintended recipient 1s prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe
that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the
e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-
mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December, 2019 10:56 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: 'MT _Claim_SG"; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SHD6481P - Lonpac [External Confidential]
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank you.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,



m .Smn?' SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
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Dear Sirs, - Rt U fl )=
¢ I‘. !I '-4 [ 7 RS b L
ACCIDENT INvoLViNG STLD W43l o SKK bodor]
b [ - : o i
ON ? W\ ALONG ne -I"“' el § Ll"ﬂ“jﬂ L Momdig Flaove) |
LETTER OF CLAIM
S b P

\We claim on behalf of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD, owner of motor taxi no._ :
Your insured’s negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has
suffered the following losses:-

1. Costof Repair ) 032. 96
2. Loss of Rental for J_}_ days @ S% [0 5ot iday $ | tot.4)
3. Lossof Incomefor |2  days @ S$00 7 - /day 5 :«J, 5 ..\I
4. Police Report/ SAS Report/ LTA Search Fee g T40:8
5. Survey Fee 3 409 .
G. Others

-

Total Claims : $7, 2 bsi¥

\We enclose the following documents:-

Repair Invoice Vehicle laid-up report
Police Report / SAS Report LTA Search result
Letter of Authorisation D Others :

1

D Investigation resulls
Pmoof of Loss of Use/Rentalincomes 2

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this
letter. Payment by chegue shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT TAXIS PTELTD.

Yours sincarely,
SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD

M~

Selena Tan

For Manager, Claims

Claims Department

Direct line: 6866 2653

Email address: tanselena@smrt.com.sg

FR-AS-CLM-02 REV 2



OMOTIVE

& SMRT

/1
Date: ‘ﬂ{. 1Y Fl \a
f

Cur Ref. No.:

| etter of Authorisation

L RO Y IM BLF (NRIC No.: S //../r)_‘,apfgﬂ/i ) the
+ — 1

registeradf’ﬁirer / relief driver / taxi share driver of SMRT taxi registration number

Sjﬂ?f_{&'_ __ hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

(“AutoSvs”) to deal with all matters arising out of the accider}t ?atween my taxi
i

and QF\ K 1{5 }f}m r%?ﬂ}ﬂ 3536}9 _happened on 30 25(')7' f}’fylp;:-’?.,

|
along PIF Tiwgror ohqwil [ THI vha FﬁYﬂ“'fJﬂj

(the “Accident”) on my behalf, including but not limited to instituting and any claims or
proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute
discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or

action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negofiate, resolve
and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited
to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my

behalf as may be required.

MEmE = M e T e e s AR Signature:

MEIGNE: ol Lol TRl S

v BITATT

Address ‘BJK /‘%’2 Ff?/l{, RQAD Iif?é#gé"&

FR-AS-CLM-03 REV 3



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

/'We, SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimant™) of 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 (§)757705 (address), owner of SHD 6431P (vehicle no.)
hereby authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™)

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use
(“claim™) for my vehicle no SHD 6481P that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on  30/11/2019 (date) along PIE_TOWARDS CHANGI
(THOMSON FLYOVER) (location) involving vehicle no/s SKK 6520M (“the

accident™).

I/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner
that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to
settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT

TAXIS PTE LTD.

I/'We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalfl
is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the
driverfownerfinsurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

VA H - |

Dated this ©_ '~ (day)of __ " {month) 2020 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



f, LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

IH%LE;}

CLAIM NO : 19/19/19/VP05/02273 |
DATE + 25 FEBRUARY 2020

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We. SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SKK 6520M the sum of Singapore Dollars
Six Thousand Four Hundred Twenty Only ($6.420.00) in full and final satisfaction,
liguidation and discharge of property claim competent to mefus upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by mefus
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from
an accident to my vehicle, SHD 6481P on 30 NOVEMBER 2019 along PIE
TOWARDS CHANGI (THOMSON FLYOVER).

[ /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (HARYATI BTE SINGIT /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S SMRT
TAXIS PTE LTD.

[/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice 1o all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

.............................................

MName of veliele owner/Date



SMRT SMRET Automotive Services Pte Ltd

AUTOMOTIVE 251 Morth Bridge Road Singapore 175102
Tel: 5 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice

customer Code: 32000063 GST Reg Ho. 1 MR-8300001-7

CEN : 1990042802
SMRT TAXIS ETE LTD Invoice No. o IVIS1200508

Date ¢ 26.12.,20189
Block Unit Vehiele No. +: SHDG4B1P

Yaur Bef No. @ TAX/11/19/2141
&0 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 Our Ref No. : 24104651
STHGAPORE 757705 Terms : 30 Days
Description Qty Unit hdd / {(Discount) Bmount

Cost % Amount

Parts
BUMPER REAR 1.00 5 458.580 (25700 ) 5 11465 = 343.95
BEUMEPER CLIES 10:00 3 L 2500 4 -] .25 5 B er
PIXEL STICKER 2.00 5 &0.00 0.00 g 0.00 5 120.00
BEUMPER REINFORCEMEMNT REAR 1.00 & 205.70 (2500 ) S (5Y. 4 g 154 .28
LRM SUB-ASS5Y. ER BUMPER BH 1.00 5 139.60 (25.00 ) 5 34.90 ] 104.70
ARM 'SUB-ASSY. ER BUMPER LH 100 & 139.860 (25.00 ) 3 34.90 =3 104.70
AMTEMNNA, ELECTRICAL LOWER REAR 0.00 % 157.40 .00 5 .00 5 0.00
SENSOR REVERSE 1.00 % 180.00 D.00 5 0.00 = 180.00
EUMPER SIDE RETAINER BR/LH 1.00 § 94.80 (25.00 ) 5 23.70 5 T1 .10
EUMPER SIDE RETAINER RR/RH i 1.00 § 94.80 (25,00 ) 5 23.70 5 e
BEUMPEER SEAL, ER LHE 0.00 5 88.9%0 Q.00 & 0.00 3 0.00
BEUMPER SEARL, RR RH 000 5 85T 0.00 8 (.00 2 0,00
BUMPER LIP COVER RRE/LH 0.00 5 7T2.210 0.00 5 0.00 g 0.00
BUMPER LIP COVER RR/RH G:00 & 11810 000 3 0.00 3 0.00
BUMPER LIP REAR .00 § 228..90 (25.040 ) & &T.822 5 171,68
UNDER COVER EBUB-ASSY, RR FLOGOR 0.00 % 514.50 0.00 5 0. 00 3 0.00
UNDER COVER RR SHIELD ’ 0.00 = £3.90 0.00 5 0.00 3 0.00
END PARNEL 1.00 5 602.10 (25.00 ) 5 150.52 5 451.58
SEALANT SIEAFLEX 100 5 37.00 Q.00 5 0,00 5 37,00
TATLGATE ASY 1.00 S$1007.80 (2500 % 251.97 5 T55.93
TAILGATE DOOR GLASS MOULDING, EH 1,00 5 292,40 {(25.00:) g o R 5 22.05
TAILGATE DOOR GLASS MOULDING, LH 1.00 5 29.40 [(25:00:) 3 A G 2205
SEALANT W/SCREEH 3.00 $ 37.00 0.00 5 0.00 § 11109
TAILGATE DOOR LOCK 1.00 5 444.10 (25.60 ) 5 111.02 5 333.08
NAME PLATE (HYBRID) 1.00: & 51.90 (ER.00 ) § 12.97 5 3B 93
TATL LAMP RH 0.00 5 557.40 0.00 g 0. 00 5 000

-

Buthorissd Signature
for SMRT Rutomotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1/7 E. & 0.E



@Smnr SMRT Automotive Services Pta Led

AUTDMDTlVE 251 Rorth B:idge Rﬂ‘ad Eingapnre 1749102
Tel:; 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000063 GST Reg Wo. : ME-B500001-7
CEN : 1990042802
SMRT TRXIS PTE LTD Invoice Wo. ¢ IVI9LZ200503
Date : 26.12.20198
Block Unit Vehicle No. : SHDG4B1P
Your Ref MNo. @ TAX/11/18/2141
&0 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL EARK E4 Our Ref Ho. ¢ 24104851
SINGRFORE 757705 Terms : 30 Days
Description Qty Unit Add / (Discount) Amount
Cost % Amount
BUMFER LIP COVER RR/LH 100 5 ¥2.20 (25,00 ) £ I1Id.05 ] 54.15
UMDER COVER SUB-AZSY, RR FLOCE 1.080 % 514,58 (25.00 ) 5 128.62 3 38588
TAILGATE DOOR: WEATHER STRIP L.00..5 354,440 125,00 ) g. . 8B8.35 ] 265.035
Sub=Total 5 3B13.96
Labour 5 :
T REPARIR REAR PORTICHN 1.00 5 4400.00 0.00 3 0.00 3 400.00
Others
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN 1.00 § 120.00 0.00 5 Q.00 3 120.00
™0 REMOVE AND INSTALL LUGGAGE 1.00 § &0.00 (.. 00 ] a.00 5 60,00
COMPARTMENT TRIM TD FACILITATE
REPATE.
TO TEST AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR 1.00 5 20,00 0...08 5 0.00 3 20.00
EYSTEM
TO TRANSFER REAR TAILGATE MECHANISHM 1.00 § 60.00 0.00 g 0.00 g &0.00
TO REPLACE SUMDRY PARTS 1.00 § 20.00 0.00 5 0,00 3 20.00
TO CHECK WIRING AMD SYSTEM FUNCTION 1.00 § 24.00 0.00 $ 0.00 B 20,00
T WASH AND VACUUM .00 5 &0.00 0.00 3 0.00 5 Q.00
TC RESPRAY REAER BUMPER 1.00 5 z200.00 Q.00 5 0.00 & 200,00
TO RESPREAY BUMPER BEAM 1.00 5 20.00 0,00 & 0.00 3 80.00
TO RESPREAY  REAR PENEL 1,00 § 80.00 e EM 0 1 g 0.00 3 80.00
TO RESPRAY TAIL GATE 100 § 200.00 0.00 5 0.00 5 200.00
GRAMD TOTAL ] 5,073,986

Remark

Make/Model : TOYOTA PRIUS
Accident Date : 30.11.2019%9

M.B. FPayment by cheque should be crossed and
made payable to 'SMRT Automotive Services Fte Ltd'.

Ho receipt will ba issved unless requested. W

Authorised Signature
for ESMRT Rutomotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 2/2 B & O.E



@Smm’

TAXIS

SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref: TAX/11/19/2141
From: SMRT Taxis Pre Ltd Date: 10/12/2019

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD6481P AND SKK6520M ON 30/1 1/2019
12:58 PM ALONG PIE TOWARDS CHANGI (THOMSON FLYOVER).

This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHD6481P is $108.07
per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
SMRT T&KIS PTELTD

K\

for Manager
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Enguire Transaction History

Lop Datef Time:
Aol Tyoe!
fgeat 10
Transatlan Type:
Llser iy

Cgarch Date [ Time:

insurance Compary:

00 Do 2019 7 DE144:53
Wehicle Trarsaction Amaunt:
SHKASTOM
1637 nsurance Ergury [GIRO Payment] Charingl,
ESASBARD - BALCISH BINTE ABDUL HALIL Business Transaction Referangs b
30 Mow 2015 12:58:00
e

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

tnfarmation dlsplayed I correct 45 5t 1he log date snd Hima,

Enquire Related Logs

Back to List
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