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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

—— E—
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 903 AM
To: Claims Dept; SUR
Cc nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)-DOA: 30/11 /2019

Dear Tony,

As spoken, limit repair Not exceeding $15K.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 8:58 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg; 'Claims Dept’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)-DOA: 30/11/2019

Dear Veron,
Noted on the repair approval. We propose limit repair S16k.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699

p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.COm.5g W. www.audi.com.s5g

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223



The all-new Audi.Q

welcome to the 8w Dimension.

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is canfidential and may also be privileged

i then delate this message from your system.

I§ you have recaved it in errof, please notify us immediately by

Please do not copy it or use i for-any purpose, OF disclose its contents or any attachmeant toany other person, Thank yau

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 4:26 PM

To: Claims Dept; SUR

Cc: {Mm@mmmmﬂ}

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)-DOA: 30/11/2019

Dear Tony,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKR 6678E Not Exceeding
Repair Cost $15,000/-, (Excess $0/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Note: Resurvey to be conducted for checked / hidden and supplementary items. Before paint for Rear
Floor Pan, End Panel, Bootlid and Rear Bumper require.
Mithoosingh@ai

AIG OI1C- Aashweenjeetkaur. .com

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 3:47 PM

To: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)




Dear all,
Any update on repair approval?
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Lid {Reg No 19990227 1W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408693

p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 676833 I

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapare 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

The all-new Audi QS _

Wwelcome to the g Dimension.

Erpail Disclalmer
This emall, including amy attachment, is coafi 2| and may also be privileged,

imimadiately by 1@ g then delete this message from your systam

If yau have receved it in errar, please noti
Plesea do not copy it or use [ for any purposs, or disclose its cont

any attachment Lo any ather person, Thank you

From: Claims Dept [mai tg:;jﬂimgﬁprgmiumaum@gj[
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 11:53 AM

To: 'Claims Dept'; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; 'SUR'; 'assignments’
Subject: RE: 0D CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)

Dear SUR,
Attached interview form for your kind reference.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg Mo 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699

p. +65 6366 2323, d.+65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg W-. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 781 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223



The all-new Audi

welcome to the g DimMension:

Email Disclaimer

Thig email, including any attachment, Is configentiz
If you have recehved it in error, please NOTITY us kT
Please do not copy 1L or use it far any purpose, or dis

| may also be privileged

ately by rep and then delete this message from your systam

liose iks conte w attachment to any other person Thank you

From: Claims Dept [mailto:c gims@g[gmmmaum.mm.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 9:29 AM

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; "SUR’; ‘assignments'

Cc: 'Claims’

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)

Dear Sur Team,
Attached GIA document for your kind reference.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699
p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

The all-new Audi Q8

wWelcome to the 8 Dimension.

Ernail Disclaimer
This email, ingluding any attachment, 15 confidantial and may alse be priv eged,

if wou have receives it in error, please notify us imr diately by reply ema vhen delete this message from your System

Please do not copy tof use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attac himent to any ather person. Thank you

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mail;g:admin—g@ml-_@utu,;om]
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 B:13 AM

To: 'Claims Dept'; 'SUR’; ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)




Dear Tony,

Moted with thanks.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-1972 | email: assignments@ Llkauto.com | fax: bes6-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

From: Claims Dept ![mailtu:clla'tms.@nremiumautn.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 8:10 AM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; ‘assignments’
<assignments@lkkauto.com=

Cec: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)

Dear LKK survey team,
Please arrange survey SKR 6678 E on today at 24 Benoi Sector.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automaobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699

p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911
e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra\Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 683

62223

The all-new Audi Q8%

VWelcome to the 8t Dimension.

Email Disclaimer
This emall, Including any attachment, is confidential and may aise be priviteged.

If you have receivad it in error, please notify us Immediately by reply er vail and then delete this massagd from your sysiem

Please do not copy it o use it far any purpese, or disclose its contents O amy attachment to any other parson. Thank you
4 T ¥



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
E————— #

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 4:26 M

To: Claims Dept; SUR

Cc: (nora_khai@premiumauto.cum.sg}

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)-DOA: 30/11/2019
Dear Tony.

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKR 6678E Not Exceeding
Repair Cost $15.000/-, (Excess $0/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Note: Resurvey to be conducted for checked / hidden and supplementary items. Before paint for Rear
Floor Pan, End Panel, Bootlid and Rear Bumper require.

AlIG OIC- Aashwceniectkaur.Miihuosingh{maig.mm

Best Regards,

weron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 3:47 PM

To: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)

Dear all,

Any update on repair approval?
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Tony Foong

Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)



55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699
p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg W. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836

auo

The all-new Audi

welcome to the Brh Dimension.

2223
AT

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment anfidential and may also be privileged.

W us immediately by rephy email and ther
) [

If woui hawve received It in arror, fmlete this message from your system

Please do not copy It or use It for any purpose, ar dis close its contents or any attachment to any other person Thank you

From: Claims Dept [mailto;claims@premiumauto.com.
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 11:53 AM

To: 'Claims Dept’: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'’; 'SUR'; 'assignments’
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)

Dear SUR,
Attached interview form for your kind reference.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapere 408699

p. +65 6366 2323, d. +B5 67689911
e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg W. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

The all-new Audi Q8%

wWelcome to the 8:h Dimension.

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, 15 C

en delete this message from your system

ment to any other person Thamk you



From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 9:29 AM
To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; 'SUR'; "assignments'
Cc: 'Claims'

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)

Dear Sur Team,
Attached GIA document for your kind reference.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699

p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67680911
e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

o

The all-new Audi Q8

Welcome to the 8th Dimension:

Email Disclaimar

This email, n-:Iucmg any attachimeant, is contidential and may also be privileged
IFyou have received it inerror, please notify us immediately by reply email and then detete this message from your system
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents ar any attachment to any other persan. Thank vou

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 8:13 AM

To: 'Claims Dept’; 'SUR'; 'assignments'

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)

Dear Tony,

Moted with thanks.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4915
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0z2-25 | 5{408033)



From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 8:10 AM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments'
<assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SKR 6678 E (AIG)

Dear LKK survey team,
Please arrange survey SKR 6678 E on today at 24 Benoi Sector.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699

p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911
e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

The all-new Audi Q83

Welcome to the 8th Dimension.

Email Disclaimear

This email, including any attachment, is
IF you have receved It
Flease do not copy it o use

1l and may alsa be privileged,
¢ by reply emall and then delele this message fram yaur system,
graon. Thank you

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software,
WWW.avg.com




12/5/2018 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with ;
*SKREGTBE (94410125675G)
oD
MNowv 30 2019 8:15PM

[TED YAT SENG]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

'-_Fleplv | _al} A:II -_hTa-rk as_unre_adJ Prin.t.M_Essage.] .i‘.'l;Iete H-esiaEI F.nrwan:i ] ) i

From AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_5G), sent on 05/12/2019 16:05 PM.
To LEK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$20235.00) - SKRE67SE - Claim Handler: Mithoo Singh, Aashweenjeet Kaur

supplementary items and upload in Merimen. Before paint for Rear Floor Pan, End Panel, Bootlid and Rear Bumper requ

Approved: 20235.00:Please upload CLEARER photo to prove damage on item no. 28. Resurvey to be conducted for checked / hidden and ‘
|

!

2

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY D } : I
There are ne documents.

tm 2L phb GGEL,70.7, 7473

httpa:#aingapnra.marlrneﬂ.mrmdatms!lnde:.chn?ﬂsabmzsvmaﬂ&fu seaction=dsp_view&made=1&iinboxid=1594351& Domainld=1 18i0pjid=12... 112



12/4/20189

https://singapore. mermen.comiclaims/in:

Rich Text Editor, SVCDOCrecontent

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreqno-19s60r108R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AlG Building

78 Shenton Way #08-16
Singapore 079120

Aftn:

Yehicle Mo

Make
Assignment Date
Date af Inspection
Inspection At

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages

From: LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

Date: 04 Dec 2019

Preliminary Advice
: SKRAESTBE Accident Date S 30/11/209
CAUDI AZ Palicy No. : 2100403929-04
:04/12/2019 Excess : 550.00
< 04/12/2019 Est. Duration of Repair  : 10.00

- PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBH)

55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

The vehicle sustained impact / damages rear portion and parts claimed are con sistent to the accident.

Repairar's Estimate {Gross) 85 29,368.00
Reviscd Amount 8% 17,870.00
Check ltems (Estimated) 5% 2,365.00
Total S5 20.235.00
Lump Sum Repair 5%
Total Loss Consideration
New jor Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value 8% £1,000.00
COE | PARF Rebate i 45,310.00
Salvage Value 55
Margin for Repair 5% 15,690.00

Remarks

(% )

The vehicle is repoirable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.

Kindly let us have your autharisation,

The vehicle is unccanomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

(%)

Other comments - Repairer able to repair Not exceeding $15,000/-

c_;:1:n?.fuseh{:-FMTRadjuster&fusea.u:hon=clsp_rp1;5&rptmnd&=2&cassid=ﬂﬂzsﬂﬂ&amd=32ﬂn9&adjcur...

i



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cwmner 10 Type:

Owener 102

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deragistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Calour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo,

Chassis No:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period|Yearsk

QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amaunt:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Dec 2019

Singapore NRIC
8227

SKR6ATEE

Na

04 Dec 2017

AUDI

AZSEDAN 1.4 TFSI AMBIENTE MY 15
Grey

2014

CZC209813
WAUZZZBVEF1042870
2.0 kW (123 bhp}
$27,192.00

27 Feb 20153

27 Feb 2015

o]

$15,069.00

Yes
26 Feb 2025
$11.301.00

26 Feb 2025

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$645,001.00

$34,009.00

%$45,310.00



©wCal™ 6211359

[7] Audi A3 Sportback 1.4A TFSI S- £61,000 £10,540 /yr 16-Jan-2015 1.395¢
tronic Ambiente

1 Owner Well Kept & Serviced With VAG, Genuine Miteage & Condition, Gorgeous Grey with Coifee Brown Sea
Consultants For &n Appointment Or Drop By Our Showroom To Yiew This Excellent A3 SporiBack, Another Pri:

Orchard Credit Ple Lid

[] Audi A3 Sedan 1.4A TFSI S-tronic  $85.000 511,210 fyt 19-Jan-2015 1385 ¢c
Ambiente

1 Owrer! AA Trust Certified Quality Pre-Cwned Vebicle! Genuine Low Milzage Done At 3BD00Km! Full Agent S
Audi Singapore Since Day One With 1 More Free Servicing To Gof New Baftery! Hew Number Plate! Tip Top Co

&4 Trust Autamotive

[7] Audi A3 Sedan 1.4ATFSI 560,800 $10,320 /y1 0-Jar-2015 1,395
~ Ambiente

53000 Drive-Away!Buy With A Peace Of Mind, New Gearbox With Extend Warranty, No Further Repairs Headed
Year Comprehensive Warranty! Low-interest Bank Rate From 2 28% Buy With A Peasce Of Mind From An 150 C

Hua Yang Credit Pte Lid

LTA Approved Supersprint Exhaust System
LTA Approved Supefsprint Exhaust

Morde info about this product

D Audi A3 Sedan 1.4A TFSI 561,800 510,270 fyr 17-Mar-2015 1395¢
Amblente

Graded By ST

1 Ownerl Full Agent Serviced Records! STA Certified Accident Free Quality Pre-Crned For Peace Of Mind. Higl
Financing Available! View Today!

D Audi A3 Sedan 1.4A TFSI §63,500 510,540 /'y 26-Mar-2015 1385 ¢
Amblente

*Free 1 Year Warranty* Agen Unill Newly Changed All Four Suspension! Mew Mechatronic! New Froat And Re
Miichelin P54 Tyres Fitted On Beautiful Original Audi 53 Sparts Rims! Car As Good As New! Receipts To Prove!

Eurn Peslommance Asiz Ple Lid

[7] Audi A3 Sportback 1.4A TFSI S- §39,998 $9.650 fyr 07-Apr-2015 1385 ¢
tronic Ambiente

Diive With Assurance! 1 Dwnet! Undar Warranty Till 4/2020! Genuine And Transparent Deall Flexible Bank/in b
Monthly Installment §1,077, All Our Quality Consignment Cars Are Selling At The Most Reasonable Price With

CarQuotz Singapore

E Audi A3 Sedan 1.4A TFS! S-tronke £64,800 S10,230 fyv 20-Apr-2015 1395 ¢
Ambiente

i Owner Only Cheapest In The Market! Low Mileage Done! Promation interest Of Only 2.28%! 100% Accident
Welcome! View To Believe! High And Flexible Loan Avallable! High Trade in For Your Used Car Call Us Mow To
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WEAT18158T12-1 | Premium Automoehbiles Pe Lad - US|
EMTRY DATE & TIME: 02/12/2018 14:21
SUBMITTED BY: Teew Foang Chin Fong

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the detais of the accidant 1o speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyhalder andior the Authorisad Driver.

4. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation ar witholding of material fa

cis may allow insurance companies o

repudiate policy liability.

4. The Issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is nal an agmission aof policy liability on the part of the insurance companes.

5. Any false re

ing may be referred to the Police for investigation.

. This report will be farwardad by the snsurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archeving and thal copies of this report will, for a fee, be made avallable upon appcation by interastad parties,

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centra and

aforesaid

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
MRIC Mo

Email Address

Mabile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken
Wehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Nale Number

Driver

Name of Drivar

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth

QOccupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Expenence

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Mumber

EMail Address

1o copies of the report being made availabhe

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
021212019 14:21
30/11/2019 20:15
ALONG PIE BEFORE BEDOK NORTH EXIT
SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SKREGBTBE

TEO YAT SENG

$2550822Z
vS_TEO_SG@YAHOO.COM.SG
(LOCAL) +65-88370772
OTHERS-64848182

AUDI
A3-1.4 TFSI AMBIENTE MY 15 (A}

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

2100403929-04

TEQ YAT SENG
525508222

01/10/1961

INDOOR

05/03/1990

29 YEARS AND 8 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-98370772

OTHERS-64848182
¥S_TEO_SG@YAHOO.COM.SG

Page 1ol 21



Address

Postcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo. Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

insurance Company of Oriver's Cwn Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicls involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle]
involved in the accident

VWas any body Injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown personis)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Passenger 1

Passenger 2

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?
If Yes, Please state which Police Station
Police Station Name

Palice Station Address

Police Station Contact

\Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

3 HUME AVENUE
#07-04

598719
NO
OWNER

CHAIN COLLISION
CLEAR
DRY

NO
3
YES
YES
YES
NO
3

: TEQ RONG HUI
: FEMALE

NAME:
GEMNDER:

MAME:
GEMDER:

: TEO RONG FANG
: FEMALE

YES

EUNDS NPP

ROAD: 528 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD #01-1620 , POSTCODE: 470629 ,
COUNTRY: SINGAPORE

TEL NO: - FAX NO:
NO

PLEASE REFER TO THE POLICE REPO RT NO:T/20191130/2181

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
\Was there any video caplured by Car Camera?
Was there any audio recorded?

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Detajls Of Properties
Wehicle Category

Mame of Driver

3JDa785U
HOMDA [ STREAM

PRIVATE CAR

MOHAMED DANIAL BIN MOHAMED
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MRIC/Passport Mumber 5973596806
Contact Mumber 08718554
Address
Postcode
Insurance Company NMame
Mature Of Damage
Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver}
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 2

Wehicle Registration Mumber SJGE5364L
Yehicle Make/Model/Colour HOMDA | JAZZ
Details Of Properties

Yehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Nurmber
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger {Including Dnver)
DETAILS OF INJURED PERSON 1

Name TEQ RONG FANG
Approximate Age

Injuries Sustain

Injured person in which vehicle?

Were seat belts worn?

Was this injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Address
Fostcode
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Police Report

SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

Police Sigbion Of Origin

Euros NPF

£2€ Bedok Resarvslr Rosd #01. 1620
SINGAPCRE 470623

Tel Mo 1800-4429505

REPDRT OF & TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

[ G MBHAD GAR

T8 1308

ia'a
Ampon Mo Tradild 3061

TVide Regot No.:
G.'zmwau-mm ”

“TatorTime Repor Msde
3128 221']5 :

. -

[ Gtation Ciary NO

I'hm af informant;
_TEO YAT SENGY 3 HUME AVENUE #07-04 SINGAPORE 568718 e
I wum Mo Canfact No.:
HRIC NG ! szsmz Fama Cffiea: Makile: GEs 70772
Nalionaley: , Emait:

MALAYSIAN ;
Sax, Fage: . |Dateof Bith. | Type of Infermant

_Male | 56" * - 111961 Orver R -
Rsce: : Language Inalilution / School Name:
Chinese = -t
Occupation: i Driving Licanca information

_PROCUREMENT MANAGER Class: 3 Db of Expiry

Alang Road 1 ’
PAN IELAND EXPRESSWAY
, w before Bocok hordhextt
Road Suface. Heag Spaed Limit
Diur e Dry = ___| 90 Kmh
Trattie Flow: i Traffic Conos Traffic Voiume
One Way - Mot Canerated | Heawy
[ Typs of Collison. - Aryane convayed by
Batwean Moving Vehicles - Head To Rear ambu'ance.
Led
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