Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 March 2020 9:28 AM

To: Ziting

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLR1815Y *Our Ref: CC4/11119021420/Apb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHB 4023C(lll) AND SLR 1815Y ON 30/11/2019]

Attachments: POLICE REPORT_SHB4023C.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our driver had lodged police report and adamant that his taxi was parked and hit by your
client. Kindly refer to the attached police report for your easy reference.

In view of this, we regret to inform your that we are unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ziting <ziting@n51.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 2:05 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SLR1815Y *Our Ref: CC4/11119021420/Apb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 4023C(l11) AND SLR
1815Y ON 30/11/2019]

Hi Hsiao Tong,



We do not have video footage for this case.
Kindly forward us the video footage.
Thank you

Regards,

Zi Ting

N-51 Automotive Pte Ltd
Office: 6842 0051

Fax: 6741 0510
www.nb1.com.sq

On Thu, Jan 2, 2020 at 9:47 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SLR1815Y Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/11119021420/Apb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 4023C(I11) AND SLR 1815Y ON 30/11/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy
reference.

As per lll instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 2020

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



