Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 3 July 2020 1:56 PM

To: Tee, Chee-Wah

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: AIG Ref: 5146924342SG / LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19021410/R1KB3Q2
Dear Mr. Tee,

We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below.

As instructed, we have uploaded the correspondence email with third party on Merimen and resurvey and after repair
photos.

According to our surveyor, third party vehicle repair limit is $5,000.00 and breakdown is as per below:

Market Value $28,000
LTA Rebate $22,580
Nett Value/ Economical Repair value $5,420

Kindly be informed that we will submit our report, invoice and close accordingly.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 3 July 2020 10:38 AM

To: Tee, Chee-Wah <Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG Ref: 5146924342SG / LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19021410/R1KB3Q2

Dear Mr. Tee,

We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below.
Will revert asap on this.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tee, Chee-Wah <Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 July 2020 9:38 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG Ref: 5146924342SG / LKK Ref: CC4/AIG19021410/R1KB3Q2

Dear Khanchna,
We refer to our email dated 29.06.2020.

We gathered that there is no estimate provided. Kindly provide us the market value and correspondence email with
third party repairer on urgent basis.

Thank you.

Tee Chee Wah

AlIG

Complex Claims Examiner
Claims Department

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #10-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1089

Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com | www.aig.sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. Click
here to find out more

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Tee, Chee-Wah

Sent: Monday, June 29, 2020 1:25 PM

To: khanchna@lkkauto.com

Cc: Admin A

Subject: AIG Ref: 5146924342SG / LKK Ref: CC4/A1G19021410/R1KB3Q2

Dear Khanchna,
Third party has changed repairer to ‘SINCERELEAD GARAGE PTE LTD’ and engaged solicitor for this matter.

Kindly let us have the survey report, market value and negotiation correspondence with previous repairer on urgent
basis.

Thank you.



Tee Chee Wah

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner
Claims Department

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #10-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1089

Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com | www.aig.sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. Click
here to find out more

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



