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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 12:59 pm

To: Azlan, Syazairdina; Sim, Priscilla-LK

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: FBJ 5873M /  OD / 6081741381SG 

Attachments: FBJ 5873M.pdf

Dear Priscilla / Syaza 
 
Further to my email below. 
 
An interview statement of the insured rider was recorded last Friday. Briefly, the insured rider informed me that 
he is currently working as a food delivery rider. Whenever he receives delivery orders, he will use the insured 
motorcycle to deliver. At the material time of accident, he informed me that he had completed his delivery and 
was on his way home. He was however unable to recall the location of the last delivery prior to the accident.  
 
I have attached in this email the signed statement, the police report pertaining to the loss of his driving licence 
and also the police investigation result for your further follow up. 
 
We will proceed to close this case and submit our survey report under total loss. 
 

Best Regards, 

Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2020 10:04 AM 

To: 'Azlan, Syazairdina' <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com> 

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FBJ 5873M / OD / 6081741381SG  

 

Dear Syaza 
 
Insured rider has not made any arrangement to meet me yet. 
 
Will call him later to check. 
 

Best Regards, 

Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2020 9:04 AM 

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FBJ 5873M / OD / 6081741381SG  

 

Dear Bryan, 

 

May I get an update on below. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Thanks and regards, 
  
Syaza Irdina Azlan  
AIG 
Express Claims Adjuster II, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations – Auto    
SG Claims Operations  | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
Tel:8001206556 | Ext:1012205 

  

Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com | www.aig.sg 

 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2019 3:53 PM 

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com> 

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: FBJ 5873M / OD / 6081741381SG  

 

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Priscilla 
 
For your information, I spoke to the rider this morning and he informed me that he will arrange a time for me to 
meet him. 
 
Will update you again when his statement is secured. 
 

Best Regards, 

Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>  

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2019 3:42 PM 

To: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com> 

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FBJ 5873M / OD / 6081741381SG  

 

+ Express Team 

 

Is this a total loss claim ? 

 

There is two issue, licence / policy coverage as per below e-mail. 

 

Please do not confirm coverage. 
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Priscilla Sim LK 

Senior Complex Claims Examiner 

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

 

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 

 

Tel +(65) 6419 1755 

priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg 

  

 
 

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK  
Sent: Monday, December 30, 2019 3:39 PM 

To: SUR 
Cc: Bryan Ang (bryanang@lkkauto.com) 

Subject: RE: FBJ 5873M / OD / 6081741381SG  

 

 

Hi Bryan 

 

Kindly also obtain driver renewed driving licence. 

 

Priscilla Sim LK 

Senior Complex Claims Examiner 

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

 

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 

 

Tel +(65) 6419 1755 

priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg 

  

 
 

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK  

Sent: Friday, December 27, 2019 3:42 PM 
To: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) 

Subject: FW: FBJ 5873M / OD / 6081741381SG  

 

 

Hi Bryan 

 

As per our Underwriter’s advice below. 

 

Kindly obtain statement pertaining the date of accident, whether leisure / food delivery. 

 

Priscilla Sim LK 
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Senior Complex Claims Examiner 

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

 

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 

 

Tel +(65) 6419 1755 

priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg 

  

 
 

From: Bucasan, HowardAndrew  

Sent: Friday, December 27, 2019 3:28 PM 
To: Sim, Priscilla-LK; AIG SGP, PL-UW Team 

Subject: RE: FBJ 5873M / OD / 6081741381SG  

 

Hi Priscilla, 

 

We do not cover Food Panda, Grab food, or similar delivery service on our motorcycle policies. 

 

Regards, 

 

Bucasan, Howard Andrew  
AIG 
Underwriting Executive 

Advance leave notification: NA 

 

 
 

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Win General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. 
Click here to find out more 

Renew your AIG Auto Insurance click here 
Get AIG Travel Insurance click here 

Get up to 15% OFF your AIG vehicle insurance premium and stand a chance to win amazing prizes when you download AIG On the Go now! 

 

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK  
Sent: Friday, December 27, 2019 2:45 PM 

To: AIG SGP, PL-UW Team 
Subject: FBJ 5873M / OD / 6081741381SG  

 

Hi  

 

The Motorcycle policy is only for private usage ? any special endorsement for Grab Food Service  i.e. Delivery ? 

 

 



5

 

 

 

 

 

 

Priscilla Sim LK 

Senior Complex Claims Examiner 

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

 

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 

 

Tel +(65) 6419 1755 

priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
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