Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Sent: Monday, 7 September 2020 4:03 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying; Subramanian Kasi

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SBS 3400K (OUR REF: CC4/EQI19021404/Ega3) *** ACCIDENT

INVOLVING GBF 6208Z & SBS 3400K ON 29/11/2019 ***

Dear Cecilia

We accept with your principal’s offer Global Sum of $9,000 all in.
Please forward us your DV soonest.

Thank You

Best Regards
Lynn Ahmad (Ms)

Senior Executive, Claims
Office +65 6248 0987 | Mobile +65 9199 0025
Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg

Working hours : Mon - Fri ® 9am — 6pm
Close on Sat, Sun & PH

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K
www.towertransit.sg

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 September, 2020 2:58 PM

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>; Subramanian Kasi <Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SBS 3400K (OUR REF: CC4/EQI19021404/Ega3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 6208Z & SBS
3400K ON 29/11/2019 ***

THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE - Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognise the sender/email.
If in doubt, please check with IT Support!

2"° REMINDER

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Lynn,



