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EMW Dealer

Performance Motors Limited

A Sime Darby Motors Company
Cc. Reg. No. 197401559W GST Reg. No M2-0020081-x
Toll-Free Number (1800-2255269

303, Alexandra Road
Sime Darby Performance Centre

Singapore 159941
Fax. 64747770

280, Kampong Arang Road
East Coast Centre
Singapore 438180

Fax. 63449773

GST REG. NO M2

ESTIMATE

315, Alexandra Road
Sime Darby Business Centre
Singapore 159944

Fax. 64796601
64796624

(hftersales)
(Motorrad)

- 0020081 - x

03 DEC 2019

( Estimate No. : bl 53656 Page No. 1l of 4 )
Date Estimated : 03/12/2019
| Prepared By ‘ Inthiran A/L Thurasamy J
[ - ESTIMATE REPATR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 40000
Tang Siew Choor Cash Sales - Service
65 Seletar Green Walk Singapore
| Singapore 805235 )
B
REGN. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SJc1218z WBA2E320705H46232 30/05/2017 216d G TOURER 0 )
r Ty
DESCRIPTION VALUE
To replace rear bumper and attachments. 9go 1 0
Painting rear bumper. a3 SC 1}2‘8./00
To check electrical wiring systems and lightings at the (Se 1}?6
rear section for proper function.
To remove old PDC assembly, replace damaged parts and / co yKO
reconnect to new bumper including conduct checks for
proper function.
Sundries. T g0.00
Total Labour 1: 2,747.00
DESCRIPTION 7 QTY PRIC VALUE
REAR BUMPER CARRIER " 1 460.40 460.40
SUPPORT 7 e 1 4555 4555
REAR BUMPER TRIM STRIP (CHROM) >¢# 1 110.55 110.55
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (LINES PDC C(»1¢/ 1 1,045.45 1,045.45
Total Parts 1,661.95
. Guapdy J
r o‘P/l 3,/, T @ 145V Labour 1 2,747.00
W Parts 1,661.95
:nf&% Labour 2 0.00
QU‘J ¢ Excess 0.00
Total GST @ 7% 308.63
2 W Grand Total 4,717.58

** THIS ESTIMATE ISVALID FOR A PEI;{IOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY**
** PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **

N

IO




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

——_‘__

From: Jaime Tay ~:jaime.tay@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 8:40 AM

To: PBSP; Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SJC1218Z & SJW5044B ON 26/11/2019.
EQI REF: DM19HO03177/4T

Attachments: SKM_558219120314140.pdf: IMG_1386.jpg; IMG_1390.jpg; IMG_1392.,jpg; IMG_
1397 jpg

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs

We refer to your email.

We are unable to comment on liability as our insured has not reported the accident.
We have written to them and will revert on your/ your client’s claim once we receive the SAS.

Dear Sirs,

Kindly assist on PRS on WP BASIS.
Thank you.

Regards,

Jaime Tay

EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel 133 82 | fax 65
’-.,\\
- K"‘h:’;\a j/ ¥ ,
¥ W, mber of Citveratea _~ ettty :—"-V’« y
Wy A Member of Citystate CERL e you've got a friend
Privileged/Confidential information may b » contained in thi / are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: 03 December 2019 17:33

To: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@eqinsurance.com.sg»

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - 5JC1218Z & SIW5044B ON 26/11/2019

Dear Sirs,

We are agreeable to use a common surveyor below :



6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256 3561
Fax: 6741 4108

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Pzint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: Jaime Tay <Me.tav@eqinsurance‘c;g;__;__;gg>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 5:31 PM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEM ENT -SJC1218Z & SJW5044B ON 26/11/2019

[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the or ganisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.

Without Prejudice

Save As To Costs

Dear Sir,

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend (o the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have
agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please specify one or more of
our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1)  AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2)  Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 0808 Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6849 9155 Fax: 6284 1539

Contact Person: Sophia

4)  Priority Services
Tel: 62934822

Fax: 62963283

Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866 Contact Person: Sharon

3)  LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd

L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fax: 6281 8748

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

5)  RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 6)  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 6741-4108

Tel: 67486076
Fax: 67480361

Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

7)  Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services

Fax: 67461148 Tel: 96623655

Contact Person: Kelvin Fax: 67655662

Contact Person; Mr Chee

2
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9)  JP Knights Pte Ltd o 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822

Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070

11) Infiniti Appraisal Service 12) Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd
Tel : 96684818/90099001 Tel: 65091788

Fi B4587432 Fax: 65096221

If you object to all the motor Surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors whom
you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you
return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Regards,

Jaime Tay

EQ Insurance Company Limited

did &5 2 tel ; 1 882 | fax 65 6;

ba p Q\ - ‘ =

oA N ber of Citystate ™ I Y ¥ £pni P
W (s, R you've got a friend
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in th U are net the intended recipient, please notify the serider immediately and delete all copies of

From: PBSP [mailto:pmf—pbsp@simedarby.u_::;1 sg]

Sent: 03 December 2019 15:30

To: EQI PRS <@JPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg>; Joel Goh <'@el.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - 5JC12187 & SIW5044B ON 26/11/2019

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

We have instructions from our client to seek fepair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct
Settlement.

Attached is the estimates and supporting docuiments for your consideration.

Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settlement.

If Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us 1 ve your offer for LOU / rental.

Thank you.



Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and [aint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient") and muy contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.
If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding
and/or printing the Message. Please noti [y the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
all copies of the Message. Sime Darby dis laims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions

expressed in the Message are solely thosc of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime
Darby's.”
lotal Control Panel Login
To: eqiprsiaeginsurance. com.se Remove simeda by.com.sg from my allow list

From: pml-pbs 1'(’i-sin1cde1rhv.com.:sg

You received this message because the domain simed.) Wocom.sg is on your allow list.



