
Our Ref: CC4/AIG19021314/Qhb3 

 

09 December, 2019 

 

SG Car Leasing Pte Ltd 

1 Bukit Batok Crescent 

#03-32 WCEGA Plaza 

Singapore 658064 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGF 8145Z AND SLP 6681T ON 01/12/2019 ALONG/ 

AT BOTANIC GARDEN DROP OFF POINT NEAR TRAFFIC LIGHT 

 

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your 

insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd (AIG) to settle a THIRD PARTY claim 

against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location. 

 

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this 

letter, giving the version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The 

GIA report can be lodged at any of AIG reporting centres. You may refer to your 

Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres. 

 

If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the 

undersigned within five days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & etc 

would be affected. 

 

  

Yours faithfully, 

 

 
Vic Alpeh Sanghilan 

Claims 

Tel : 6841 2096 

Fax: 6741 4108 

Email : vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

 c.c. Claims Manager  

 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 

 (Motor Claims Dept) 



Our Ref: CC4/AIG19021314/Qhb3               

 

 

31 JANUARY 2020        

 

SG CAR LEASING PTE LTD     By Post & By Email 

1 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT 

#03-32 WCEGA PLAZA 

SINGAPORE 658064 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGF 8145Z AND SLP 6681T ON 01/12/2019  

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte 

Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto 

Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner 

of SLP 6681T against your motor insurance policy. 

  

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down 

against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the 

Third Party. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 

settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 

 

 

Vic Alpeh  

DID: 6841 2096 

FAX: 6741 4108 

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  

            (Motor Claims Dept) 

 admin@sg-carleasing.com  

 (Email) 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 7 May 2021 9:00 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: FW: LOD/Invoice for SLP6681T - LKK REF CC4/AIG19021314/Qbb3 / REMINDER

Dear Sir/Madam 
Without Prejudice 
Both have done a private settlement therefore the case is closed 
Thanks & Best Regards 
S.T.Sim 
Manager  
Accident Reporting Center 
60 Jalan Lam Huat 
#04-35/36 Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 
H/P: 65- 69559351 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the  
Internet.

 
 
 
 
On Thu, May 6, 2021 at 11:26 AM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Any updates from below email?  

  

Kindly advise whether still pursuing the claim. 

  

Thanks  

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 
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Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 1 April 2021 9:08 AM 
To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Cc: Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: LOD/Invoice for SLP6681T - LKK REF CC4/AIG19021314/Qbb3 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Any updates from below email?  

  

Kindly advise whether still pursuing the claim. 

  

Thanks  

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 3 April 2020 3:17 PM 
To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
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Cc: Kelly Shi <kelly.shi@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD/Invoice for SLP6681T - LKK REF CC4/AIG19021314/Qhb3 

  

Without Prejudice 

 
Dear Sir, 

 
We refer to your below email and the contents were noted. 

  

We were in formed by our Insured that the passenger had settled privately with your client. 

  

Kindly check and confirm. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

  

  

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 9 March, 2020 4:57 PM 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 7 May 2021 9:08 AM
To: Lee, Ming-Yao
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Our Ref : 7094513407SG-003 | WP Report for SLP6681T DOA 01/12/2019 *** LKK 

REF: CC4/AIG19021314/Qbb3

Hi Ming Yao, 
 
TP wksp informed that both their client and our insured had privately settle the matter. 
 
We will proceed to close file and submit our survey bill. 
 
Thanks  
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 31 March 2021 6:15 PM 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref : 7094513407SG-003 | WP Report for SLP6681T DOA 01/12/2019 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/AIG19021314/Qbb3 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Jasper, 
 
Kindly assist. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 31 March, 2021 5:32 PM 
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To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Our Ref : 7094513407SG-003 | WP Report for SLP6681T DOA 01/12/2019 
 
Hi, 
 
If case idle > 12 months, please assist to close file. 
 
Regards, 
Lee Ming Yao, George 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 
Ming-Yao.Lee@AIG.com | www.AIG.sg 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
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