Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Friday, 19 February 2021 8:00 AM

claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Admin A; Margaret KKH

RE: SPAM-LOW: RE: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933J (AIG) on
01/12/2019 - O/REF: 190723/12

DV_SMN3599S.pdf

We confirm settlement at $4,286.05(all-in).

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg <claims@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 January 2021 9:51 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Margaret KKH <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SPAM-LOW: RE: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933J (AlG) on 01/12/2019 - O/REF:

190723/12

Dear Hsiao Tong

Reference to your email dated 27 Jan 2021.



We view that your offer for Loss of Revenue at $100 x 5 days is low for a Driving School. With the supporting
document that had sent to you earlier and to reach an amicable settlement, we are prepared to accept an offer
$4,286.05 (incl Loss of Revenue $120 x 5 days).

Look forward to your acceptance soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6452 7018

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, January 27, 2021 11:32 AM

To: claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: Admin A ; Margaret KKH

Subject: RE: SPAM-LOW: RE: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933] (AIG) on 01/12/2019 - O/REF:
190723/12

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,684.05
2. Loss of Revenue (5days x $100.00) S 500.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 2.00

Total | $ 4,186.05

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January 2021 3:26 PM

To: claims@kkimhin.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Margaret KKH <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SPAM-LOW: RE: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933J (AIG) on 01/12/2019 - O/REF:
190723/12

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Case reassign to HT.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi HT,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg <claims@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January, 2021 3:14 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Margaret KKH <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SPAM-LOW: RE: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933J (AlG) on 01/12/2019 - O/REF:
190723/12

Dear Khanchna
Our email of 29 Dec 2020 refers.

Please let us know if you have any updates on the abovementioned ?
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Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6452 7018

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, December 29, 2020 10:06 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A ; Margaret KKH ; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SPAM-LOW: RE: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933] (AIG) on 01/12/2019 - O/REF:
190723/12

Dear Khanchna

Reference to your email dated 29 Dec 2020.

Enclose is a list of what would have been BBDC estimated loss of revenue per day as computed.
Please review the case and let us have your offer for settlement soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6452 7018

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, December 29, 2020 9:09 AM

To: claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: Admin A ; Margaret KKH ; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: SPAM-LOW: RE: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933] (AIG) on 01/12/2019 - O/REF:
190723/12

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Carin,
Our principal wants the supporting documents on the loss of revenue. Kindly send us the relevant documents.

Thank you.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: mailto:Khanchna@Ikkauto.com%7CFax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg <claims@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: 24 November 2020 12:03 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Margaret KKH <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933J (AIG) on 01/12/2019 - O/REF: 190723/12

Dear Khanchna
Reference to our email dated 14 Oct 2020 and our reminder on 04 Nov 2020.

We are prepare to accept the offer at $4,336.05 (Loss of Revenue at $650/-).
Please let us hear from you.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6452 7018

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, November 04, 2020 2:44 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A ; Margaret KKH

Subject: Re: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933] (AIG) on 01/12/2019 - O/REF: 190723/12

Dear Khanchna

Reference to our email dated 14 Oct 2020.

Please advise any updates on the abovementioned ?
Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd



160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6452 7018

From: claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, October 14, 2020 1:59 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A ; Margaret KKH

Subject: Re: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933] (AIG) on 01/12/2019 - O/REF: 190723/12

Dear Khanchna
Reference to your email dated 14 Oct 2020.

We view that your offer for Loss of Revenue is extremely low for a Driving School. Driving Centre vehicle is
for professional instructors to provide excellent coaching to Learners with guidance, imparted with safety
driving knowledge and instilled with positive values to be a socially responsible driver on the road. The
loss is therefore one of Loss of Revenue instead of loss of rental/use that is usually accorded to a non hire
vehicle e.g. private passenger car.

Please revise your offer and look forward to your settlement soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Carin

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-20
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6452 7018

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, October 14, 2020 11:46 AM

To: claims@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Offer - Accident between SMN 3599S & SBV 9933] (AIG) on 01/12/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Carin,

We propose settlement for global $3,980.00(all in).
Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




