Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Friday, 6 December 2019 6:35 PM

Anthony Cheong

RE: Accident involving SLS4109C & SGL3103X on 28.11.2019

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your

client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate

settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Anthony Cheong <cheonganthony@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 10:27 AM



To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: Accident involving SLS4109C & SGL3103X on 28.11.2019

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Monday, December 2, 2019, 4:34 PM, Anthony Cheong <cheonganthony@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your ref : 7758793724SG003

Our ref:4109/2019

Dear Slr/Mdm,
We refer to your email dated 2 Dec 2019.

We are agreeable to the usage of Kenneth Kong from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the Single Joint
Expert to conduct the Pre-Repair Survey.

Kindly proceed to engage LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to perform the said Pre-Repair Survey in
accordance
to the NIMA Protocol.

Thank you.

Regards
Anthony Cheong
Claims

Lian Her Motors
H/p 91082728

————— Forwarded message -----

From: Anthony Cheong <cheonganthony@yahoo.com.sg>

To: aigsgp_claimssurvey@aig.com <aigsgp_claimssurvey@aig.com>
Sent: Monday, 2 December 2019, 10:44:15 am GMT+8

Subject: Accident involving SLS4109C & SGL3103X on 28.11.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref : SGL3103X
Our ref :4109/2019



Dear Sir/Mdm
We refer to the above matter.

Our client's vehicle SLS4109C was involved in the above accident with your insured's
vehicle no SGL3103X on 28 Nov 2019.

Kindly let us have your surveyor list for our attention.

Also, please let us know within 2 working days whether you would like to conduct the
pre repair survey of our client's vehicle.

The survey can be conducted at the following address
Blk 5038 #01-405 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Pk 2 Singapore 569541

If we do not hear from you within the next 2 working days excluding Saturday, Sunday or
holiday. We will commence repairs thereafter without further reference to you.

Enclosed herewith the GIA report of SLS4109C for your kind perusal.

In the meantime, if you have any queries, please do not hesitate to contact me at 91082728
and I'll be most happy to assist you.

Your kind attention to the above is much appreciated.

Best Regards
Anthony Cheong
Claims

Lian Her Motors



