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S1 UBIAVE 1 05-25 PAVA URT INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAORE 408933 TEL @ (5] 62563561 FAX : (065) A2880815

Your Ref: D19007618MFSH Date: 20 0
Our Ref: CS/FCI1902129 1/Avf3

The Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
Dear SirMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SMDI284R .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 03/12/2019 at the premises of M/s SIN HWEE MOTOR.PTE LTD. and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§ 4915.00
Revised Estimate Amount 188 363950
“Check” Items Amount S8 -

Market Value :S§ - .
LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 - -
Mett Value 1 S§% - :
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages

at the rear portion. - e
Yours faithfully

Adrian Ling

Licensed Appraiser



Yvonne Wnnﬂ (LKK Autnz

From: Yvonne Wang (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, January 20, 2020 2:36 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc SUR

Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007618MFSH/1
Attachments: SMD12B4R DOA 29112019 REVERT.pdf
Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMD1284R
Date of survey : 03/12/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKE Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6as6-3561 | emall: ywonnewong@Ilkkauto.com | fux: 62564315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indimstrinl Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong @ lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408033)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, December 04, 2019 5:23 PM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007618MFSH/1

Dear Sir,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SMD1284R on 03/12/2019.



We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6a56-1561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenuoe 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Maotor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 3 December, 2019 12:06 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKRAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; Jason Tea <lasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007618MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Warkflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Yvonne WunE (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wang (LEK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, December 04, 2019 5:23 PM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims’

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007618MFSH/1
Dear Sir,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SMD1284R on 03/12/20189.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Y vonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-1561 | email: yyonnewong@lkkauto.com | fx: 6256-4315
ik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #n2-25 | S(408q31]

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December, 2019 12:06 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTSELKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirsicapital.com.sg>; Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007618MFSH,/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited



‘MSs@FirstCapital

M5 Firn1 Capital Insurance Limited  Cotes e (9S000100C  CNY Neg s, S0 0OCTRTES
6 Rafties Quay 121 -00 Singapone D4B580
Ter (65) 6222 2311 Faor (B5) 6222 3547

Claima & Fnms Undsrmiing Cept 30 Rotmsan Bosd BLE-O1 Dty Hewse Sergapore DERATT
Tl (65) 6507 3548 Fax: |65) 6507 3840

W mafirsirapital com sg
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 02-12-2019 Our Ref No. D19007618MFSH
Accident Dale 29-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC22689T Third Party Vehicle. SMD1234R

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 #01-58
KHIM HP

67455783/ 57666672 Fax No. 67440582

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: NO ESTIMATE. WE CAN AGREE TO DS IF THERE IS
ESTIMATE AND VEHICLE TO BE SURVEYED A

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA, Fax No. 68418315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE Attention. NIL
LTD
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
JASON TEA CHEE KIAT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignmant and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer genarated latter, no signature required.

- B v s e s




SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE LTD

*** Main Workshop ***

ESTIMATE

: DATE 2122019 |
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-59 S(408717) | 1
*** Spray Paint Workshop @ Autobay *** VEHICLENO: | SMD 1284 ni
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-25 S(417883) .
REG NO: 201327079M | MAKE: MERCEDE |
'MODEL. cis0)
MR JASON CHUA PO TIONG - | i
TP 1> (e
o -} 1) - 3 i’
"Noral W "-"*‘““-F”f*f“k
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT | AMOUNT |
1 PC REAR BUMPER - NETT ¢ 04 1.780.00 /550178000
1PC REAR BUMER LOWER GARNISH - NETT ﬁ_u X 350.00 350,00 =
I PC LOWER GARNISH CHROME = NETT et 203,00 295,00 ~
| PC REINFORCEMENT - NETT  pbmsie (St 74500 §32 73500 v
1PCS REVERSE SENSOR - NETT | 2 2= P4 190,00 Wi S
| PE garpﬁ Low Eil Ef'-"{{ BT Hyq — wnE” 4~ y T o =
SUBTOTAL S 3.550.00
LESS 10% LESS 1% 5495 < -10.00% -353.00
= .'D ||" Q
: TO KNOCK INNER PANEL AND BRACKETS =2

TO REPLACE AND ALIGN ABOVE ITEMS

T REPLACE REVERSE SENSURS AND CARRY OUT MANAGEMENT SCAN
' RESET FALILT CODRES

TOSPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER AND INNER PANEL o 20

TOSUPPLY AND TUFF KOTE ON AFFECTED AREA.

LKK Ayto Consyltants hence notity
the Rapairer of the followng:

o To resurvey ETOnE WfmT SpTRy pRTETY
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St el gl
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y theemia | ol )
s Company

B suksiect 10 Niepd appreval ram .
Acknowiasysd by A

Signaturs

Dote:

750.00 ?;ME 2 8¢

250,00 z,s;wo‘ [
00 00 60060 20
120,00 12000 A

Tel: 6745 5783  Fax: 6744 9582
Email: sinhweemotor@gmail.com

Website: www.sinhweemotor.com

TOTAL

$4,915.00




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6258 4315
Reg. No: 189880T188R GST Reg. No. 15-8607T168-R

I & 74 74

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Rel CS/FCI18021291/Ayf3n2

36 ROBINSON ROAD Data: 21-01-2020

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPCRE 068877

|ART

Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 22887 Veh. Inspected SMD 1284R
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D12007T618MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From JASON TEA CHEE KIAT Assign Date 03272019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ C180 c.c 1585
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WDD2050402R3088154 Colour GREY
Odometer 21313 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. _ Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/50 R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/50 R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |22%/50 R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/11/2019 [Inspection Date 0312/2019
Survey held at SIN HWEE MOTOR PTELTD
BLK 3023-A UBI ROAD 1 #01-58 SINGAPORE 408717
Sa. Remarks
A)JDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




l/ ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uts Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusinal Park, Singapore 408933
TEL B256 3581 FAX: B258 4315
Reg. Mo 100E0T108R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMD 1284R

= K 2 = == =

REAR BUMPER (N}

REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH (M)
LOWER GARNISH CHROME (N}
REINFORCEMENT (N)

REVERSE SENSOR §@3$190.00 (N)
BUMPER LOWER BRACKET L/H (N)
LESS 10% DISCOUNT

LABOUR

TO KNOCK INNER PANEL AND BRACKETS TO REPLACE
AND ALIGN ABOVE ITEMS.

TO REPLACE REVERSE SENSORS AND CARRY OUT
MANAGEMENT SCAN/RESET FAULT CODES

TO SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER AND INNER PANEL.
TO SUPPLY AND TUFF KOTE ON AFFECTED AREA.

DEFORMED
DEFORMED
cuT

BENT
DAMAGED
CRACKED

NOT NECESSARY

1,780.00 1,580.00
350.00 350.00
295.00 205.00
T45.00 G682.00
380.00 380.00

58.00 58.00
-360.80 -335.50

3.247.20 3,019.50
750,00 250.00
250.00 120.00
600.00 250.00
120.00 -

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng. AMSOE.AMIRTE.AMSAE-A M MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMIER OF LLABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES - This Ruport i mades ssisly bor the uas and beraf of ihe Clant named on the irmm pege of his Repert




