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. MS‘Firstcapital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited oo fes s (950000060 C6T Mng e MI-0001GT6

6 Raffies Quay #2100 Sngapore D4BSE0
Tet [B5) G222 2311 Faxc (B 222 347

Clstoms | ten Lantmrarising Bvpet 36 RObImon Aoad #1501 Ciry House Singapore 0BEETT
Tel (65] 6507 3828 Fax (55) B507 3840

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

wherwr T REGHTal ComL g

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 02-12-2018 Our Ref No. D19007604MFSH
Accident Date 25-11-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHAOQ484L Third Party Vehicle. SLB5078B
Survey Location 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK C #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
Contact Person. SUKY| CHONG
Contact No. B7479241/0 Fax No, 67417276
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appoiiad LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Conlact Person MNA Fax No. 68418315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submil to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based an
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

NEW HOCK TECK
MOTOR PTE LTD Attention. NIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repon via CWS within 14 days lor survay assignment and 7 days lor re-inspection.

This is a compular genatated latter, no signature requirad.

nf m CRETL




Veron Chen {LKKAuta!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Manday, 3 February 2020 5.07 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; SUR

Cc: ‘Merina Chia'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12007604MFSH/1-SLB 50788
Attachments: SLB 5078B PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLB 50788
Date of survey: 3/12/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 6 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Cansultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{40B533)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 10:08 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007604MFSH/1-5LB 50788

Dear Sir'Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLB 5078B on 3/12/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 9:09 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>; SUR
<sur{@| m>

Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007604MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkmuto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December, 2019 9:01 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS®LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital. com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007604MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail,



Sl{irlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 January 2020 7:57 am

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; SUR

Ce: ‘Merina Chia’; assignments

Subject: RE: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D19007604MFSHACCIDENT INVOLVING

SHAD484L AND SLB50788 ON 29-11-2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Veron,

Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CS/FCI19021263/Avf3

« Wishing you 0 HOppY Gna Frosperous Lunar New Yooy +

Best Regands

G.NIVITHA

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | emnll: pssignments@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4915
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 24 January 2020 2:47 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims; Merina Chia

Subject: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D15007604MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHAO484L AND SLBS078B ON
29-11-2019

Dear Sir,
We received LOD from workshop/solicitor.

Please let us have the Survey Report including Vehicle Inspection Photos & Survey Fees Invoice asap.



Kipdlyupload the survey report through CWS from document management screen by selecting option Survey
report.

Thanks & Regards,

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

c rclaims ital.

.Auﬁ This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com



| Veron Chen gLKI{Autnl —

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 10:09 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; SUR

Cc ‘Merina Chia’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007604MFSH/1-5L8 50788
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLB 5078B on 3/12/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 9:09 AM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com:>

Ce: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007604MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@|kkauto.com | bx: 6256-4315

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS5S Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December, 2019 9:01 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia sfirstcapital.com.sp>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007604MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.



. Kindiy submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 2848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



PARFK

COE Rebae Enguins

* ® Asingapare Government Agency Website

Cos E’lagk'tu OneMotoring

Enqufri: PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owmer 1D Type

Croorenr 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No

Vehitle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date
Wehiche Make

Vehicle Model

Primary Colour:
Manutacturing Year:

Engine No.

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Oiriginal Registration Date
First Registration Date
Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Ellgibility:

PARF Elgibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Perlod(Years).

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Fareign identification Mumber
FOLX

SLBS07ER

Mo

30 Now 2019
TOYOTA

ESQUIRE HYBRID 18GI A
White

2015

2ZRa531021
ZWRBD0141345
100.0 kW (134 bhpl
$29.454.00

12 Apr 20146

12 Apr 2014

0

$1823400

Yes
11 Apr 2026
$13.677.00

11 Apt 2026

E - Open Categary
10

£45.007.00
£28.643.00
£42.320.00

The infarmation contalned herein is carrect as al 30 Mov 2019

lafl

OK

Bt orl o gov s vl action engquireRebate By PublicBetore.

JVTL2009, 11:09 an



IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the scoioent 1o speed up the claims sracess

7 This Farm smust be sompluted by the Polieyholder and/or the Authorised Driver
3. InformEtion provided must be a3 W Any withul mesrescpieatatine of weithbolding of materisl
facts may afizw (maurance comparees tn repudiate policy livbility.
4 The swue ard scceptancs of this Form by insurance companies is not 25 admission of policy Rabilty on the part of the Instirance
COMmpanes.
refer fan.
& The regort will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Masagement Centre stabiishes ty the Genessl Inturance

association of Singapore {GIA) for a1chiving and that coaies of thit repart will for a fee be made avaranle upon applisatian oy
nierested carles.

7. By the dgment of this repor te the inturert, you hereby cansent to the archiving of this report a1 the centre snd ta roples of
the rapert being rade available aforesaid.

8 Consent under the Pérsonal Datas Protection At (POPA)
funderstand, scanowledge, agres ang consent that:

fa] My Insurer, mvy wotkinop ard the General Insurance Association of Singapars (*GIA®] may/are permitted 1o colec, uss,
cleciose andfor process my perscnal dats/personal information set out in this |form) and any ather personal \nformation
provided by me or possessed by my insurer [collectively the “Personal Information” ] and disclose and trantfer such
Fersanal Information 1o 2| insuter(s) wha have Intured vehicies) involved in this accident [g/] ingureds] who have intured
vehiclels) Invalved I this accident shall be collectively referres to as the “Insarers™), the suren’ awyery/law firme, the
Mangtary Authority of Singapore and sry relevant government agency fautharlly (Lueh 35 the gelice), for the purpose(s)
af

fl} precessing. handling snd/or dealing with my dlaims including the seltlement of the clalms and sy neceLLary
investigations relating to the claims,

(W} Irwestigating the sccident and/fer my claims;
11} carnying out and/ar desling with my instructions ar responding 16 any enguiries by ma:

(v} administering my chaims (including the malling of correspondenes, tatements, invoices, Faports of notices 1o me,
which could involve disclosure of cerzain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same 21 well 83 on the
external cover of envelopet/mall packages); and/or

W) complying with applicable lw in sdminlstering. processing, handling andfor dealing witn my clgims. jcallectively the
“Purposes”)
fh] sl isurer{s) who have insured vehicie(s) invotved in this accidens and the Insurers [wwryersflaw tlrms, mayfare permitted
to collect, use, disclozo and/of process my Persanal Infarmatian foar ane or mote of the abevs Purposes; and

le]  my Persopal infermation may/can be disclosad by any of the Insurers and/or GIA 1o their third mirty service providers or
sgentslincluding thair lawyers/law firms), whith may bae 1ited outside of Singapore. for sne or mare of the sheus Purposes.

{¢]  my Personal Information will giso be collected and used ta comalle claims history for the purpese of fraud delsction,
investigation pnd matagement in present and sl future claims.

(g} theinfermation so collected under (2] above may be shared / disclosed:

(i) toall insurars 3rpd/oe any cther thicd parties that assist In evalusting, investigatng cantrofling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcemant and government sgerclas as reasonably required for the surposes stated, or

(H} ter complying with resulrements under any regulétions, laws or court order

4

Palicyhalder's Sigrature Crhuer’s Sigralure Axparting Centre Persanne™s Signature
Calw B Time (1 crives s net the policyholder) Narmpe
Oate & Timg: NRIC/FIN No

IR Thets [l
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

| NOL tOnewed ao  OTE (y) weRvt  wwoddfll vd txrd

vewge 0 MO e Ooned dorn ard  cpzed , | 2010wed
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DECLARATION
If'We declare the foregoing particalars e true in every respest

4 F=

Palicyholder's Hgnature Driwet's Signatiire

Date & Tims: |1 driwer it nat the polievhokder)
Cate & Time:

Reporting Centre Spraopnel s Signature
Name
NRIC/FIN Na
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NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Bik C #0143 Autobay@Kaki Bukit. Singappre 417883

Emall admini@nhtmotor.com

Website: www . nhtmotor.com

Tel. 6747 8241 Fax 6741 7276
UEN: 201718370K GST Reg No.. 201718370K

Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-43

Singapore 417883 N

Tp ri‘|'_rr.P

Varan

Accident date: 29/11/2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SLB5078R TOYOTA ESQUIRE HYBRID 1.8 A '16

30/11/2019

CHASSIS: ZWR800141365
S/n Qty Items U/price Amount
1 1  Rear Boot Lid Tkt 52,012.000 |72
2 2 Rear Boot Lid Hinge 2 Nt $138.00 $276.00 ~
3 2 Rear Boot Lid Shock Absorber | fite $333.00 5666.00
4 1 Rear Boot Lid Emblem Logo ot plee. $80.00 ¥
5 1 Rear Boot Lid Esquire Logo NeL $75.00
b 1 Rear Boot Lid Hybrid Synergy Drive Logo A $78.00-
7 1 Rear Boot Lid Center Moulding Assy »«f Ae $839.00
8 1 Rear Boot Lid Number Plate L, .7 $50.00 *
9 1 Rear Boot Lid Reverse Camera «~ f<r $850.00 ~
10 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Lock W ey & $452.00 ~
11 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Rubber .7 $375.00
12 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board " $570.00 ~
13 8 Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board Clip .. $6.50 $52.00 <0
14 1 Rear Boot Lid Windscreen Moulding » «_ $105.00 «
15 2 Rear Tail Lamp Yy, $625.00 51,250.00 4+
16 4 RearTaillampClip < Mz ) $8.00 $32.00 ~
17 2 Rear Tail Lamp Lower Cover Do 1o d $206.00 $412.00
18 1 RearBumper veioinea $645.00
19 10 Rear Bumper Clip Mt 56.50 56500 79
20 2 Rear Bumper Side Retainer /. $75.00 $150.00 <
21 2 Rear Bumper Side Reflector  +/=" raa $70.00 $140.00 ~
22 1 Rear Bumper Towing Cover vy | $25.00
23 1 Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor o d $380:00 /v )
24 1 Rear End Panel Deded $735.00 ~
25 1  Rear End Panel Top Garnish e ©yoc ) $182.00
26 2 Rear Fender Inner Trim Board ¢ Lio—o $582.00 $1,164.00 —
27 16 Rear Fender Inner Trim Board Clip “*~ 56.50 $104-00 50
28 1 $835.00

Rear Floor Panel ey



Sznz.unt/

29 1 Rear Floor Panel Top Cover il —d
30 1 Rear Floor Panel Inner Trim ! preer $934.00 >
31 1 Rear Floor Panel Sealant | $450.00 ~
32 1  Rear Exhaust T N $1,010.00~
33 2 Rear Exhaust Mounting | Méer $68.00 $136.00%
34 1 Rear Center Exhaust $3,555.00 1
2300 M. 2
P Subtotal :-  $18,886.00
SIS
Labour charges
To remove & refit cushion & trim board $28000 g0
To remove & refit reverse camera 513/0&'6 s
To remove & refit reverse sensor 519&6 g2
To remove & refit rear windscreen $120.00
Gum v $50.00
To remove & refit rear & center exhaust $380.00
To check wiring 519;;:0’ 30
Tuff kote Sw 6o
§ ik :J o (f D
Panel beating LKX Auto Consullants hence notly 51,199:05 o
the Reparsr of the follomng:
o To resurvey Eeicindaliat 3000y pRAtng 1
Spray painting o To dapiay damaged cark) &g PEHITEY $1,400,00 20
: i 1'1: E,d.l,j,:. F ; Fregution” baain
ohamgn BB B ENE Subtotal :- $4,160.00
Ashnoaleaged ty Regaret Tﬂtil:- sﬂ,m.m
Bagnalue:
L foted 7 45/ <p
ol

L/c

o&;m?s,
6k



' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6258 3561 FANX: 6258 43156

Raeg. Mo: 188607T188R GST Reg Mo, 19-B607188-R

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD T Rel  CS/FCI19021263/Avian2
36 ROBINSON ROAD . :
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 | TS | ‘Il"“llll“ll

Folicy Farticu = TRIRLU FAR .
Insured Veh, SHA 4841 Veh. Inspected SLB 50788
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D18007604MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  MERINA CHIA SAN SAN Assign Date 03122018

" [Make & Model TOYOTAESQUIREHYBRD lee 1797
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No,  ZWRB00141365 Colour WHITE
Odometer 62569 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

— I T —
Description of Damage:

VEHICLE SUSTAINED ATTHE .

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

29/11/2019
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

- . [ FETIET. .
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

CHN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR | WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

=E5iUma! I3

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubil Ava 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapare 408833
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. Mo 188607188R GST Reg Mo, 19-0807108-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLB 50788

2|REAR BOOT LID HINGE @8138.00 NOT NECESSARY 278.00
2|REAR BOOT LID SHOCK ABSORBER @%333.00 NOT NECESSARY 666.00
1|REAR BOOT LID EMBLEM LOGO NOT NECESSARY 80.00
1|REAR BOOT LID ESQUIRE LOGO NECESSARY 75.00
1|REAR BOOT LID HYBRID SYNERGY DRIVE LOGOD NECESSARY T8.00
1|REAR BOOT LID CENTER MOULDING ASSY NOT NECESSARY 839.00
1|REAR BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE NOT NECESSARY £0.00
1|REAR BOOT LID REVERSE CAMERA NOT NECESSARY 850.00
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER LOCK DAMAGED 452.00
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER RUBBER cuTt 375.00
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD CRACKED 570.00
B|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP @58 50 MNECESSARY 52.00
1|REAR BOOT LID WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 105.00
2|REAR TAIL LAMP @5§625.00 NOT NECESSARY 1.250.00
4|REAR TAIL LAMP CLIP @%8.00 NOT NECESSARY 32.00
Z|REAR TAIL LAMP LOWER COVER @3206.00 DEFORMED 412,00
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 845.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP @3%6.50 NECESSARY £5.00
Z|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @%75.00 NECESSARY 160.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR @$70.00 NOT NECESSARY 140.00
1|REAR BUMPER TOWING COVER DEFORMED 2500
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 735.00
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 1B2.00
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD @5582.00 DEFORMED 1,164.00
16|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BEOARD CLIP @$6.50 NECESSARY 104.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 835.00
LABOUR
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP COVER DEFORMED 202.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL INNER TRIM NOT NECESSARY 534.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL SEALANT NOT NECESSARY 450.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021263/Avi3n2

75.00
78.00

375.00
570,00

30.00
105.00

412.00
645.00

30.00
150.00

25.00
735.00
182.00

1,164.00




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 82568 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 198607198R GST Reg Mo 19-9607198-R

NOT NECESSARY :
2| REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING @$68.00 NOT NECESSARY 138.00 .
1|REAR CENTER EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 3,555.00 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -1.750.50
18,506.00 5,251.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (8N) DAMAGED 380.00 200.00
1|GUM (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
430.00 250.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT CUSHION & TRIM BOARD. 280.00 80.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE CAMERA, 180.00 50.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 &50.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN 120.00 120.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR & CENTER EXHAUST HNOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
TO CHECK WIRING. 100.00 40.00
TUFF KOTE. 150.00 60.00
PAMNEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,400.00 B00.00
FLOOR PANEL.
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,400.00 800.00
4,110.00 1,890,00
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