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Company Hegisiration Mo 1#MOT1IER

S1UHLAVE |, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 208850 TED o) 02563501 FAN @ 068 (15643] 5

Yourref: D19007399MFESH

Our ref; CS/FCII9021243/Avi3 Date - 3/2/2020

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir'Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SLJ 8939U
We thank you for your instruction on 2/12/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
2/12/2019  at the premises of M/s HOCK
and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount : §8§23,509.00

Revised Estimate Amount : §%5,500.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount . 5%

Market Value . 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 S8

Nent Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustnined damages at the
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithiully,

ADAIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI
Liconsed Appraisar



MS@FirstCapital

& Ratiies Quay #21-00 Singapore 048560
Tet (65) 6222 2311 Fax [65) 6222 3547

Llgmma & Huider Linnsress iy
Tel (65) 6507 3848 Fax (B5) €507 3845
v mEfrTianitel comoag

Date

Acclident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number.

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

02-12-2019 Our Ref No. D19007599MFSH
30-11-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCO0567X Third Party Vehicle. SLJ893gU

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK C #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SUKYI CHONG

67479241/ 0 Fax No. 67417276

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA
NA

Fax No. 68416315

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cec : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

NEW HOCK TECK
MOTOR PTE LTD Attention. NIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submilt the survey report via CWS within 14 days lor survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer generated letler, no signature required.

B ™ m i i

g - o LRI T

M5 Flest Capital Inyursnce Limited (s tey e (95001008 05T Beg ha M0 SOSTEMS

bayr: 36 Robinson Road #1601 City Mouse Singapors 0GEETT




" Veron Chen !I.KKAuto!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 5:37 PM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims'; SUR

Cc ‘Merina Chia’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007599MFSH/1-50) 8939U
Attachments: SL B939U PREL! ADVISED. pdf

Dear SirfMadam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLJ 8939U
Date of survey: 2/12/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 6 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phona: 5256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 10:56 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007599MFSH/1-50 B939U

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLJ 8939U on 2/12/2019

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <a -d{@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2019 5:18 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D190075589MF5H/1




Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phomnie: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@kkauto.com | fox: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 2 December, 2019 5:16 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007599MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CW5 within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen !LI{I{Autoz

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 10:56 AM

To: 'CWS Maotor Claims'; SUR

Co 'Merina Chia’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007599MF5H/1-5L) 8335V
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLJ 8939U on 2/12/2019

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto,com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2019 5:18 PM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<suri@lkkauto.com:

Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007599MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@kkauto.com | fax: b256-4515
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital com sg>

Sent: Monday, 2 December, 2019 5:16 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007599MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

1



Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Matar Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Aini Binte

Fr;:rrn: Merina Chia

Sent: Monday, January 20, 2020 4:10 PM

To: Aini Binte

Subject: FW: SLI8939U CLAIMING AGAINST SHC567X DOA20,11.19
Attachments: SLI8939U CLAIMING AGAINST SHCS67X DOA 30.11.19.pdt
Importance: High

Dear Aini,

New LOD,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ferina Chia (Ms})
Mataor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 35 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore O6BBT7 | Tel: 6507 2848 | DID : 6507 3836 | Fax Mo
5507 3848 | Emall: merinachia@msfirstcapital.com sg | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
& Member of BRI Insurance Group

Dato Praflecison 420 7018 POR

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 4:04 PM

To: Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cec: Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>
Subject: SLIB939U CLAIMING AGAINST SHCS567X DOA:30.11.19

Without Prejudice
Hi Motor Claims Department
Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference.
We will post out the original copy by today.
Hope to receive your offer soon for close case,thanks.
“** Please kindly take note this claim is under “"New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd" ***
- LTD is now GST-registered*

Best Regards,
Sukyi Chong



New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit 5{417883)
Tel : 67479241 Fax:67417276

& (] o




FARF COE Rebate Enguiry
’ A Singapore Government Agency Website

L

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owamier 1D Type
Ownier 1D

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Viehicle Make

Vehicle Model|

Prirmary Colour

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output

Open Market Value:

Ornginal Registration Date;

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility

PARF Ellgibility Expiry Date

PARF Robate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
CIOE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period| Years)
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NAIC
Fa48

SLIBRITU

MNe

30 Now 2019

MISSAN

QASHOAI 1.2 DIG-TCVT ARS
2WD SDR

Black

2016

HRAZIDBESZ5A
SINFEAI11U1720377
B50kW (113 bha)
§1B.485.00

29 Dec 2015

29 Dec 2016

[}

$13.689.00

Y
28 Dec 2025
$10.266.00

28 Dec 2026

& - Car up to 1600ce & §7hW
[130bhpl

10

£4975100

$35,20000

$454466.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Nov 201%

1ofl

OK

hitps: wrl ltogov g T vrl action enguireRebale By PublicBelfore

30/11/2019, 12:13 pn
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NEW HOCK TECK MCTOR FTE. LTD.

| Kaki 13kit Ave € Blk C #01-43 Aulobey@)Kak Bukit, 3ivgape e 417833

Ersell: admin @nhimotocom  Website: wvear himolar com

Tel 6747 9241  Fuoc 5781 727E
LEN: 201718370K GCST Feg No.: 201716370K

Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave b
#01-43

Singapore 417883

7 14 (ap

Vecan

Accident date: 30/11/202.9

Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: £LJB939U NISSAN QASHQAI 1.2 A '16

CHASSSIS: SINFEAJ11U1720377

30/11/2019

s/n Qty Items / Nett U/ orice Amount

1 1 Rear Boot Lid __ Pepor 52,936.80 x

2 2 Rear Boot Lid Hinge 2444 $65.30 $130.60 ¥

3 7 Rear Boot Lid Shock Absorber + »He €209.80 S419.60 <

4 1 Rear Boot Lid Emblern LOgo 7 plie- S66.40 <
5 1 Rear Boot Lid Qashgal Logo J 587.00 =
6 1 Rear Boot Lid Cantre Mouldirg ~— ~/ $436.00
7 6 Rear Boot Lid Cantre Mouldirg Cip | 56.50 539.00

8 1  Rear Boot Lid Number Pizte g 550.00 ~
9 2 Rear Boot Lid Side Reflector NI €388.60 $777.20~
10 1 Rear Boot Lid Irner Lack Nt $267.70 %
11 1 Rear Boot Lid Irner Rubber $158.70 ¥
12 1 Rear Boot Lid Irner Trim Board $416.507
13 2 Rear Tail Lamg $423.70 $847.40%
14 4 Rear Tail Lamg Clip N 58.00 532.00 ¥
15 1 Rear Bumper e f0rmed $817.00
16 10 Rear Bumper Clip  »lee 56.50 56580 30
17 2 Rear Bumper Side Retainer »oc €55.20 §110.40
18 2 Rear Bumper Side Reflector  N<? Al $63.30 $126.60 1
19 1 Rear Bumper Towing Covar s 1«4 528.10
20 1 Rear Bumper Inner Soonge  Cnociad - $183.80 _~
21 1 Rear Bumper Keinforcemant  Sot $519.20 «~
22 2 Rear Bumper Reinforcemant Brackel  Se.d $186.00 $372.00 -
23 1 Rear End Panel o) Mim 5726.40
24 1 Rear End Panel Top Garnish !\ $185.00 —~
25 1 Rear End Panel Lock Sensor  fly po $169.90 X
26 2 Rear Fender Inner Trm Boarg P $361.70 5723.40 -
27 16 Rear Fender Inrer Trm Board Clip < 7% 56.50 $104.00
28 1 Rear Spara Tyre Panel Bepic” 51,880.00-7

L



To remove & refit cushion & trim board
To remove & refit revarse sensor

To remove & refit revarse camera

To remove & refit rear & center exhaust
To remove & refit rear wirdscreen

Gum on

To check wiring
Tuff kote

Panel beating

Spray painting

29 1 Rear Soare Tyre Panel Toa Cover NP paq $484.70 X
30 1 Rear Spare Tyre Pane! Too Sponge A rf Mee §364.00 X
31 2 Rear Spare Tyre Side Fanal V' $397.00 §724.00 ¥
32 1 RearSpare Tyre Lock -t rr 567.404
33 1 RearToolBox . [ .d $378.00
34 2 Rear Exhzust IWounting  #-8re- $27.40 574.80 * -
35 1 Rear Exhzust Aluminium Cover [ nenple s ff‘SWQ b3
27L3-10 sl -
¢ g Subtotal : ___ $15,193.00

s/n Qty Items /Special Nett U/price Amount
36 1 Rear Boot Lid leverse Camera  *H* pur $580.00 & |
37 1 Rear Boot Lid Windscreen Seal ++7 ree” 560,00+ E
38 4 Rear Bumper Raversa Sensor & pides de d $294.00 Sl—.;IEWﬁ 52p-
39 1 Rear Soare Tyre Panel Zasulation Ted . T MNec $450:00-x 2 40 éN
a0 1 RearExheust  Towdid $330.00 < '
41 1 Rear Centre Exhaust pbd i $960.00 T

138D o u DEO Subtotal : 54,156.00

1
Labour charges

| ance nolly
¥ Aulg Congullanis el i
1[!?5 ﬁ:p;e of the followng: . 10000 5
» To resisrvty bEtoroanAT 1..1'--1.‘,1 &u:ﬂ.:,h
sy Tﬂ *I --1I :: J_-.:l.-::"?-:'.rvn 5180 00 =
e pus TR --:‘-'ﬂ‘i-.l-:lm.:ﬂl‘
» Thipe party BUr™y many u.l .,_;“1
il et Wri-l:". T:-.-I.‘;-‘-.T-r . "'.-‘Ei?:_ll'_ﬂ 339 aﬁ E"‘ O
b E;:i:.:':l:;ﬁ; ol -3;-,\;1'11.;' fpam InsurEnoe oy
Acknowiwoged ty Repses 2000 7
Qugrustune
- 5000
- 2 0Xp
§10000 2O
51594( 60
51.4900 Joo
E-1,4tw 55
Totadl 6420%
.5\ )

08 Dy
|



Subtotal = 54,1£0.00

Total:- $23,509.00




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

57 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ub| Industrial Park, Singapons 408833

TEL 6256 3581 FAX 6256 4315

Reg. No: 186607188R GST Reg. No. 15-8607196-R

Affiliated to Federation Intemnationale Des Exparts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Rel CS/FCIB02124AVIIN2

#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Pate s [e-na-20z0 ”III“WIII“M"I
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 567X Veh. Inspected SLJ8939u
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. D19007599MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MERINA CHIA SAN SAN Assign Date 02/12/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  NISSAN QASHQAI e 1107
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No.  SJNFEAJ11U1720377 Colour BLACK
Odometer 42867 Stesring IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R17 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/80 R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
LiH Rear Tyra |21580R17 GOODYEAR & mm
4. ' Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/11/2018 |inspection Date 02/12/2018
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD
1 KAK] BUKIT AVENUE & #01-43 AUTOBAY [@ KAK]I BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. CRE - - ~ Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

]ESHMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 6 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 7 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199B807198R GST Reg. Mo 19-9807188-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLJ 8939

1|REAR BOOT LID TO REPAIR SEE 2,936.80
LABOUR

2|REAR BOOT LID HINGE @5%65.30 NOT NECESSARY 130.60

2|REAR BOOT LID SHOCK ABSORBER @$§209.80 NOT NECESSARY 418.60 -

1|REAR BOOT LID EMBLEM LOGC NECESSARY 66.40 66.40

1|REAR BOOT LID QASHQAI LOGO NECESSARY B7.00 87.00

1|REAR BOOT LID CENTRE MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 436.00 -

6|REAR BOOT LID CENTRE MOULDING CLIP @36.50 NOT NECESSARY 398.00

1|REAR BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE NOT NECESSARY 50,00

2|REAR BOOT LID SIDE REFLECTOR ([@5388.60 NOT MECESSARY 777.20 -

1|REAR BOOT LID INNER LOCK NOT NECESSARY 267.70 -

1|REAR BOOT LID INNER RUBBER NOT NECESSARY 158.70

1|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD NOT NECESSARY 416.50

2|REAR TAIL LAMP @5423.70 WOT NECESSARY B4T 40

4|REAR TAIL LAMP CLIP @$8.00 NOT NECESSARY 32.00

1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 817.00 817.00
10{REAR BUMPER CLIP @56.50 MNECESSARY 65.00 30.00

2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @$55.20 NECESSARY 110.40 110,40

2|REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR {@$63.30 NOT NECESSARY 126.60 -

1|REAR BUMPER TOWING COVER DEFORMED 28.10 28.10

1|REAR BUMPER INNER SPONGE CRACKED 183.80 183.80

1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 619.20 61820

2|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET @$186.00 |BENT 372.00 372.00

1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 726.40 T26.40

1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 185.00 185.00

1|REAR END PANEL LOCK SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 169.80 -

2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD @5$361.70 NOT NECESSARY 72340 -
16|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP @%$6.50 NOT NECESSARY 104.00 -

1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1,880.00 .

LABOUR
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP COVER NOT NECESSARY 484 70

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19021243/Avf3n2




scription of Fans

Reg. Mo 18-8607198-R

et
Cor 1
W U IRRERE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ukl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapors 408833
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 256 4315
Reg No: 189607108R GST

REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP SPONGE NOT NECESSARY -
2|REAR SPARE TYRE SIDE PANEL @$387.00 TO REPAIR SEE -
LABOUR
1|REAR SPARE TYRE LOCK NOT NECESSARY 67.40 -
1|REAR TOOL BOX CRACKED 378.00 378.00
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING @837.40 NOT NECESSARY 74.80 #
1|REAR EXHAUST ALUMINIUM COVER CRUMPLED 244,40 146,80
4|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR @8§284.00 Igﬁtl:.;?:ED (2PCS 1.176.00 520,00
1|REAR EXHAUST DENTED 830,00 830,00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -510.01
17,189.00 4,580,089
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BOOT LID REVERSE CAMERA (SN} NOT NECESSARY 680.00 -
1|REAR BOOT LID WINDSCREEN SEAL [SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL INSULATION PAD (SN) NECESSARY 450.00 260.00
1{GUM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 .
1|REAR CENTRE EXHAUST (SN) NOT NECESSARY 860.00 =
2,200.00 250.00
LABOQUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT CUSHION & TRIM BOARD. 280.00 60.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 50.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE CAMERA. NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR & CENTER EXHALUST. 380.00 80.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN, NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO CHECK WIRING 100,00 30,00
TUFF KQTE 150.00 60.00
PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,400.00 500,00
BOOT LID REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL AND REAR SPARE
TYRE SIDE PANEL
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,400.00 850.00
4.110.00 2,030.00
GRAND TOTAL 23,509.00 6,870.09
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