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51 UBLAVE I, #01-23 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (45) 62563561 FAX ; (k651 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD1905596/GPL Date: 28 Feb 2020

Our Ref: CS/SMO19021229/Ayd3

The Motor Claims Department
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _XD4884.J .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 02/12/2019 at the premises of M/s RYDER AUTO PTE LTD and have the following
to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S8  36.547.13 .
Revised Estimate Amount :88 28.872.07
“Check” Items Amount : S8 -
Market Value 1 8% -

LTA Reimbursement Value 5% -

MNett Value e -

Description of Damage:

hearside
The vehicle sustained damages = e
at the front portion. L ' l ) |¢ e
e r— )
afltade

Yours faithfully

Adrian Ling
Licensed Appraiser



Yvonne Wuna (LKK Auto)

From: Yyonne Wong (LKK Autao)

Sent: Friday, February 28, 2020 3:56 PM

To: Gnoh, Pau Loong; SUR

Cc: Henry, Irene James; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; SUR; Han, Bernard

Subject: RE: Pls advise : RE: Pls advise estimate cost of repair for third party vehicle L XD4884) /
RYDER AUTO : RE: CMTD1905596/GPL - PRI(LKK)- XD3675C & XD4884) ACC On 30
MNovemnber 2019

Attachments: XD4884) PRELI ADVISE.pdf

Dear Pau Loong

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle XD4884)
Date of survey : 02/12/2019
Number of days : 14 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: ywonnewong@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Gnoh, Pau Loong [mailto:PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, January 02, 2020 9:01 AM

To: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) <yvonnewong@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@l|kkauto.com>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Han, Bernard <Bernard.han@sompo.com.sg=>
Subject: Pls advise ; RE: Pls advise estimate cost of repair for third party vehicle L XD4884) / RYDER AUTO ; RE:
CMTD1905596/GPL - PRI(LKK)- XD3675C & ¥XD4884] ACC On 30 November 2019

Importance: High

Dear Yvonne,

With reference above and email below, please advise for the third party cost of repair for XD4884J, thank you.

Best Regards

Gnoh Pau Loong

Claims Division

D: 63295217 | T: 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147



Yvonne Wang’ [lei_ﬂ.xto}

From: ‘Yvanne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, December 04, 2019 5:00 PM

To: Teo, Grace'

Coc ‘Gnoh, Pau Loong'; 'Henry, Irene James'; ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; SUR

Subject: CIATD1905596/GPL - PRI(LKK)- XD3675C & XD4884J ACC On 30 November 2013
Dear 5ir,

Please be informed th-: we have inspected the vehicle XD4884J on 02/12/20189.

‘We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
YC Wong (Ms) | Case Hondle
LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emuil ponnewony oo lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

31k 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi /ivenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, December 02, 2012 3:31 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Gnoh, Pau Loong' - “auloong. Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong
Kang Melvin' <melvin c@sompo rom.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD190Z 596/ GFL - P I{LKK)- XD3675C & XD4884) ACCOn 30 November 2019
Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment

Dest Regards

G.NIVITHA

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | ¢ signments( kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



Nivitha (LKK Auto)
e e = —— e e ———— =

From: Teo, Grace <graceteo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2019 2:22 PM

To: Ryder Auto workshop; ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com’; ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong; Henry, Irene James; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

Subject: CMTD1905596/GPL - PRI(LKK}- XD3675C & XD4884) ACC On 30 November 2019
Attachments: XD4884) PRS NOTICE.pdf

Our Reference : CMTD1905596/GPL
Your Reference: XD4884)

Without Prejudice
Date: 02/12/2019
OUR Email;

motorsuryeyEsompn.com.sg

Attention:
M/S RYDER AUTO PTE LTD

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD3675C & XD4884) ON 30.11.2019

Hi Orson,

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the email below and make the arrangement to survey for XD4884J on a without prejudice basis and
revert with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Mr. Pau Loong.

Thank you.
Eest Regards
Grace Teo

Claims Division
D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F; 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey({@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO A century of Trust



Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower. Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

£ Downboad on the

. GATmOn
Download now @ b App Store or L\ Google Play

LFor Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | ¥ For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Palicy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 2, 2019 2:10 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg=

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong <Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Ye,
Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @s0mpo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: CMTD1905596/GPL - PRI - XD3675C & XD4884) ACC On 30 November 2019

Dear Grace,

Kindly assist to assign anyone from LKK except Guo Qiang.
Thank you

Reds

Orson

Ryder......

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921
Tel : BT418277 Fax: 67468277

Byde rH"u’ Pte Ltd

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
Fax: 54815380

@ T |@ #&=| b (7> Mobil i

Bac S0ty
B S TR

B

On Mon, Dec 2, 2019 at 1:39 PM Teo, Grace <grace.teo(@sompo.com.sg> Wrote:

Our Reference : CMTD1905596/GPL



Your Reference: XD4884)

Without Prejudice
Date: 02/12/2019

OUR Email:

motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:

M/S RYDER AUTO PTE LTD

Dear June,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD3675C & XD4884) ON 30.11.2019

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 01/12/2019.

Please be informed that Mr. Gnoh Pau Loong is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295
217.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)

1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng




Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

.-F""‘h\
@ SOMPO A century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook com/SomposG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

Download now @ App Store or Google Play



1For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | @ For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message,

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Paolicy

From: Gnoh, Pau Loong <Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, December 2, 2019 12:46 PM

To: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Ye,
Yong Kang Melvin <melvin. OMpo.com.sg>

Subject: Sompo ref : CMTD1905596/GPL ; RE: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle XD3675C; Our Vehicle
XD4884J Accident involving XD4884) & XD3675C On 30 November 2019

Dear lune,

With reference to the above, please note that our insured driver of XD3675C has not yet e-file report and please
forward us your client’s e-file report, footage

and we will follow up with the agent concerned,

Please quote our ref : CMTD1905596 when replying, thank you.

Best Regards
Gnoh Fau Loong
Claims Division

D: 6329 5217 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

, SOMPO
@ A Century of Trust



Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www . facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase? via Sompo 5G

2 Download on the b, GETATON

E- » Google Play

LFor Travel, Parsonal Accident & Home Insurance | ¥ For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

@& App Store

Download now @ or

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy.

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, 1 December, 2019 5:22 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey @sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle XD3675C; Our Vehicle XD4884J Accident involving XD4884)
& XD3675C On 30 November 2019

Dear Sir,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly find attached PRS for your necessary action.

For Direct Settlement cases, we only use your in-house surveyor. Kindly arrange your in-house surveyor.



Thank you.

Best regards

June

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417521

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277

| 5Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
| Fax; 64815390



Ryder......

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-18/22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921
Email: ryderautowaorksho il
Tel: 67418277 Fax; 67468277

Our Ref: XD4884.) Date : 1 December 2019

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
50 Raffles Place #05-01/06
Singapore Land Tower

Singapore 048623

Dear Sir,
FPROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM

CLAIMANT ;5 & M GLOBAL LOGISTIC PTELTD

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : XD4884J & XD3675C AT 20 GUL WAY ON 30 NOV 2018

We act for S & M GLOBAL LOGISTIC PTE LTD, the owner of vehicle no. XD4884J, which

was involved in the aforesaid accident,

Kindly be notified that we are claiming against your insured motor vehicle no. XD3675C
for damages, costs and disbursements as a result of your insured driver’s negligence. Kindly
let us know if you wish to conduct a pre-repair inspection on our client's motor vehicle at our

workshop, 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19, Autchub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921.

Please arrange with the undersigned via mobile 80908277 Mr Orson or 97924673 Mr Chan.
Kindly reply within the next two (2) working days or we shall proceed with our own necessary

procedures and repairs.

This PRS is on a “Direct Settlement” basis, hence we shall be furnishing an estimate for your

surveyor to finalise as soon as possible,

Kindly reply either via email, fax or maobile.
Thank you.

Yours faithfully,

Ryder Auto Pte Ltd

vﬂ.L[gu

Chan San Choon

Director
DipEng, AAE MIMI, MSAE{Aust)

ST R 24 hr accident call

@g{w 51’% #8778 1999 Mobil I
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Used Cars Sell My Car Directary

THE MAZDA CX-3.
NOW FROM $89, 888

-3 5P variant is featured

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yoursed Advertise it at just

%58 until it's SOLD!

mitsubishi fps1 Ary

[] Mitsubishi Fuso Super Great $29,480
FPS1 (COE till 0772020)

Fuel Type: Diesel

[[] Mitsubishi Fuse Super Great £30,380
FP51 (COE till 09/2020)

Fuel Type: Diesal

[[] Mitsubishi Fuso Super Great $38,800
FP51 (COE till 0672023)

Fual Typa: Diased

Think Qne Automicbile & Trading

[7] Mitsubishi Fuso Super Great $75,800
FP51 (New 10-yr COE)

Fual Type: Diesel

Ball Auto Pte Lid

ERP Cash Card IU Shield
Universal Cash Card Cover [Mitsubishi)
More info abaut this preduct

[[] Mitsubishi Fuse Super Great $75,E00
FP51

Fuel Type: Diesel

Ary

§45,960 fyr

$39,040 fyr

510,850 fyr

2009 Mitsubishi FPS1 Prime Mover/Easy LoanyTrade-1n Waelcome.

$7.570 fyr

$19,120 fyr

Ay

25-Jul-2005

13-Sep-2005

Fap, iRl

D&-Jan-2009

03-Sep-2010

20-Nov-2013

Lagin | Signvp (I Q

Articles

CLICK HERE

Repubtic

Any

11,945

11,545 cc

12,882 cc

12,882 2

12,882 cc

ATy

Forum

-

vy

Truck

Truck

Truck

Truck

10 Years Mew COE, Superh Condition, Powerfiul And Strong Engine, Loan And Trade In Available. Call In Now For Test Drive And Viewing.

Truck

Manual Transmission Frice-Mover! Rare Unit! Frash Paintwork Dane. Trade-In All Welcomal Up To 100% Financing Available! Kindby
Conksct Our Friendly Sales Consultant For Viewina/Appointment Mow!

Car (5} Pte Ltd

[] Mitsubishi Fuso Super Great §75,800
FP51

Fuel Type: Dicsel

$16,820 fyr

05-Jun-2014

11,967 cc

Truck

Prime Mover Far Sale! Selling Cheap, Excellant Condition, New Pairtwork, Load Up To 48 Ton, 1 Owner Unit. Flesdble In House Loan. Call

reaw Far Viewing!
ABWIN [1994) Pte Lid

CERTIFIED PRE-OWHNED
Auto | MERCEDES BENZ

Avallable

Available

e o

Availabla

Availahle

Available

Avallable

TR

Available



E] Mitsubishi Fuso Super Great %99,800 415,380 fyr 30-May-2016 11,967 cc . Truck
FP51

Fuel Type: Diasal

Early Christrmas Sales! GVW 55 Tan Prime Mover, Chieapest In The Market. Superb Condition Maintained By The Previous Owner, New
Paint, No Other Repairs Required, Call Now For A Non Obligation Disoussion.

Exry-1 Pte Ltd
R T < s hi Fuse, 18 mitsuk %, M I LTt o, |
[] Mitsubishi Fuse Super Great 51149800 $16,210 fyr 24-Aar-2017 11,967 cc 135,560 km Truck
FP51

Fual Typa: [nesal

4u} Fuso Super Great Prime Mower GVW 55-Ton, Wery Low Mileage, New Paintwork With Cabin Guard, Excellent Conditian Wedl-
maintained By Presvious Owner, High Loan Avasiabde, Call For Viewing!

Bell Auto Ple Ltd

Save this seanch criteria, to get emad serts whenever a mateh is found, ﬁ Sawve Search

e (T - G- - O

Availahle

Lo |

Available

For old advertisemants, view Expired ads
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 547N
B e A L e e e e e
Vehicle Mo.: XD4884)
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 03 Dec 2019
Wehicle Make; MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Model: FP51IDR4RDEA
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2011
Engine Mo.: AMT0445625
Chassis Mo.: FPS1JDAODBS1
Maximum Power Qutput;
Open Market Value: $95,024.00
Crriginal Registration Date: 14 Apr 2011
First Registration Date: 14 Apr 2011
Transfer Count; 2
Actual ARF Paid: §4,752.00
e P R e e e e
PARF Eligibility: Mo
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Kl tended COE Rt D e e et o Lo i el
COE Expiry Date: 13Apr2021
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period({Years): 10
QP Paid: $28,18%.00
COE Rebate Amaount: $3834800
Total Rebate Amount: $3834.00

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 03 Dec 201%

OK



Ryder......

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19/22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921

Email: ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com
Tel: 67418277 Fax: 67468277

ESTIMATE OF REPAIR

Veh# XD4884J AP i Model: Mitsubishi FPS1IDR4RDEA
Accident Date 30/11/2019 | HHRERIY
Location 20 GUL WAY 3p; ¥D3675C (Sompo)
S/Mos. | Qty Description List$ S/Nett S| Netts
1 | 1pc |Frontbumper  Pabt—d 3,879.00| -~ -
2 1pc |Front bumper step fabric Y- —4& 796.00] ~— :
3 1pc |Front bumper ofs bracket  @tad 496.00| —~ 2
4 2 pcs |Front bumper ofs & n/s garnish cover d.h A—d 847.00] .- 3
5 1pc |Front bumper lower panel &g o - K 396.000 — - -
[ 1pc |Front bumper ofs head-lamp EML{J 2.967.00] «~ =
7 1pc |Front bumper ofs head-lamp garnish Smahd 496.00] -
B 1pc |Front bumper ofs head-lamp bracket B4 698.70] « -
4 1pc |Front bumper ofs fog lamp  gamd— 709.70| «~ -
10 1pc |Front bumper ofs fog lamp garnish cover te—Ll< 307.00 -~ -
11 1pc |Front bumper ofs fog lamp bracket S © 406.00] = - -
12 1pc |Front bumper ofs garnish (inner) o O 306.00| . -
13 1pc |Front cover weatherstrip M o— 306.00] -
18 | 1pc |Frontcover "3 of s 42 3,096.00] ~~ :
15 | 2pes |Front cover grille (upper & lower) L s 1,060.00| -
16 1pc [Front cover grille emblem s 82.00] —
17 1pc |Front cover ofs hinges Best 106.00] -
18 1pc |Front cover lock (inner) '}v—-w_.r_l' 206.00 - = =
19 1pc |Front cover inner structure {inner) e ¢ 3,060.00] & - -
20 1pe |Front cover ofs lock catch (inner) ?——-{d 106.00| — - .
721 | 1pc |Frontpanel  2enked 2,960.00| — :
22 1pc |Front panel ofs handle ﬂn-...,,c_cl . 406.00| — -
23 1pc |Front windscreen Shutted 3,060.00| ~~ -
24 1pe |Front windscreen weatherstrip  pAe 706.00] — .
25 2 pcs |Front windscreen ofs & n/s wiper GP- ed 306.00] ~ -
26 2 pcs |Front windscreen ofs & n/s wiper arm GIS- &m“ g2068t 3 | -
27 3 pes |Front windscreen wiper linkage Be-d ) 1,070.00) -
28 1pc [Front windscreen washer tank  “Pysi pd—d s09.70| & -
29 1pc |Front ofs door pillar garnish ’jg'L—‘i‘ 1,960.00| — l
30 | 1pc |Frontofs door pillar garnish lamp  Covd_se 206.00] «— :
31 1pc |Front ofs door pillar garnish seal (lower) M- 4 180.00] - - -
32 1pc |Front ofs door pillar garnish seal  s$dia o ot 160.00| - -
33 1pc |Front ofs doar pillar garnish bracket (lower) Btad” 396.00| .~ :
34 1pc |Front ofs door pillar garnish bracket {centre)  Rot 284.00 -"" 0
35 ipe [instrument panel At 3,967.40 *-*F" -
36 1pc |Front cabin ofs rubber bushes P - 86.00| -
37 1pc |Front cabin o/s rubber bushes bracket  Zed— 309.00) -
38 1pc |Front cabin ofs rubber absorber  whfl agas 490.00] &~ -

XD4884) ESTIMATEPgL




319 1c |Front wiring harness bracket  @ead 307.00] = .
40 1pc |Front cover advertisement  Ales- - 38600
Sub-Total:| 38,409.50 0.00 380.00
2150 e 25% 0% 0%
S 50 L9] After Less %:| 28,807.13 0.00] 380.00
Labour
1 To dismantle damaged parts, straighten & welding. 320000 2500
2 Tao spray painting. 220000 /FuUO
3 To remove and replace front windscreen, O {F _} 480.00 e
4 To remove & replace instrument panel. - § A 88008 fov
5 To check wiring. 300,00~y 5=
6 To re-seal anti-rust, jﬂﬂ-ﬂa“ 2o
Sub-Total: 7.360.00
Total: 36,547.13
After Less 20%: 29,237.70
(] o
Bl

Chan 5an Choon

Director
[MpEng, AAE
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4313

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo 10-8607 1868-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06

SOMPO INSURAMNCE SINGAPORE PL

Ref CS/ISMO18021228/Ayd3n2

Date : 08-03-2020

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Coda: SMO

[INAIRAA

1

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. XD 3675C Veh. Inspected XD 4884.
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1905596/GPL Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEQ Assign Date 021222018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI FUSO c.c 12882
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. FP51.JDADOBS1 Colour BLUE
Odometer 600255 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |295/80 R22.5 WEST LAKE S mm
L/H Front Tyre |295/B0 R22.5 WEST LAKE 9 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |295/80 R22.5 (D) WEST LAKE 99 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |285/80 R22.5 (D) WEST LAKE 8/9 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/11/2019 Inspection Date 02M12/2019
Survey held at RYDER AUTO WORKSHOP LLF
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2# 02-19 KAK] BUKIT AUTOHUB SINGAPCRE
417921
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
EJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

14 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg, No. 18-9607198-R Page No.1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. XD 4884
et Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts ‘Condition Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 3,879.00 3,879.00
1|FRONT BUMPER STEP FABRIC DEFORMED 796.00 796.00
1|FRONT BUMPER O/S BRACKET BENT 496,00 496.00
2| FRONT BUMPER O/S & N/S GARNISH COVER 0/S DAMAGED 847.00 423.50
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER PANEL BENT 396.00 396.00
1|FRONT BUMPER /S HEAD-LAMP SMASHED 2,967.00 2,967 00
1|FRONT BUMPER 0/S HEAD-LAMP GARNISH SMASHED 496.00 496.00
1|FRONT BUMPER 0/5 HEAD-LAMP BRACKET BENT £98.70 698.70
1|FRONT BUMPER 0/S FOG LAMP CRACKED 709.70 700.70
1|FRONT BUMPER O/S FOG LAMP GARNISH COVER CRACKED 307.00 307.00
1|FRONT BUMPER O/S FOG LAMP BRACKET BENT 406.00 406.00
1|FRONT BUMPER 0/S GARNISH (INNER) CRACKED 306.00 306.00
1|FRONT COVER WEATHERSTRIP NOT NECESSARY 306.00 "
1|FRONT COVER DISTORTED 3,096.00 3,096.00
2|FRONT COVER GRILLE (UPPER) & LOWER) CRACKED 1,060.00 1,060.00
1|FRONT COVER GRILLE EMBLEM NECESSARY B2.00 82,00
1|FRONT COVER O/S HINGES BENT 106.00 106.00
1|FRONT COVER LOCK (INNER} DAMAGED 206.00 206.00
1|FRONT COVER INNER STRUCTURE (INNER) TO REPAIR SEE 3,060.00 =
LABOUR

1|FRONT COVER O/S LOCK CATCH (INNER) DAMAGED 106.00 106.00
1|FRONT PANEL DENTED 2,960.00 2,960.00
1|FRONT PANEL O/S HANDLE CRACKED 406.00 406.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN SHATTERED 3,060.00 3,060.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN WEATHERSTRIP NECESSARY 706.00 706.00
2| FRONT WINDSCREEN O/S & N/S WIPER cut 306.00 306.00
2|FRONT WINDSCREEN O/S & N/S WIPER ARM 0/S BENT 620.00 310.00
3|FRONT WINDSCREEN WIPER LINKAGE BENT 1,070.00 1,070.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN WASHER TANK DISTORTED 609.70 609.70
1|FRONT OIS DOOR PILLAR GARNISH DEFORMED 1,960.00 1,960.00
1|FRONT 0O/S DOOR PILLAR GARNISH LAMP CRACKED 206.00 206.00

Report Ref No. CS/SMO19021229/Ayd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607158-R

Page Mo..2 of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | =St p?g“ S
1|FRONT O/S DOOR PILLAR GARMISH SEAL {LOWER) MOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
1|FRONT O/S DOOR PILLAR GARNISH SEAL CuT 160.00 160.00
1|FRONT O/S DOOR PILLAR GARMISH BRACKET (LOWER) [BENT 306.00 396.00
1|FRONT O/S DOOR PILLAR GARMNISH BRACKET (CENTRE) [BENT 284.00 284,00
1| INSTRUMENT PANEL NOT NECESSARY 3,867.40 -
1|FRONT CABIN O/S RUBBER BUSHES DEFORMED 86.00 86.00
1|FRONT CABIN O/S RUBBER BUSHES BRACKET BENT 309.00 309.00
1|FRONT CARIN O/S RUBBER ABSORBER NOT NECESSARY 490.00 -
1|FRONT WIRING HARMNESS BRACKET BENT 307.00 307.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -5,602.38 -7.418.15
28,807.12 22254 45
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT COVER ADVERTISEMENT (SN) MECESSARY 380.00 350.00
380.00 350.00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE DAMAGED PARTS STRAIGHTEN & 3,200.00 2,800.00
WELDING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT COVER
INNER STRUCTURE (INNER).
TO SPRAY PAINTING. 2,200.00 1,800.00
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT WINDSCREEMN. 4B80.00 480.00
TO REMOVE & REPLACE INSTRUMENT PANEL. B80.00 600.00
TO CHECK WIRING. 300.00 150.00
TO RE-SEAL ANTI-RUST. 300.00 120.00
7.360.00 5,950.00
GRAND TOTAL 36,547.12 28,554.45
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 22,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SM0O19021229/Ayd3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made solely for the use and benafit of the C
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