Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Monday, 24 February, 2020 3:01 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; 'claiml@clauto.com.sg'

Subject: FW: SJQ7602J _INVA1900713 [External Confidential]
Attachments: SJQ7602)_LOD_LONPAC.pdf

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,
For your necessary action.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Paul Antony Fernandez [mailto:claim1@clauto.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 24 February 2020 2:57 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: SJIQ7602) _ INVA1900713

Good Day Motor Claims Department,
Attached herewith are the documents pertaining to the above captioned subject matter.

Kindly revert back to us with your office Discharge Voucher, if any for our client to sign and revert back to your office
for payment to us.

Thank you very much

Best Regards,
Paul Antony Fernandez
Insurance Claims Assistant

CL Auto Pte Ltd

48 Toh Guan Road East
#02-125 Enterprise Hub,
Singapore 608586

Tel:(65) 67950960 (Line 3)
Fax:(65) 67950920

Email: claiml@clauto.com.sg



