




















Our Ref: CC4/AIG19021163/Kha3               
 

04 FEBRUARY 2020      

       

KOH SIONG QUN    

BLOCK 361 WOODLANDS AVENUE 5 

#10-426 

730361 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK 1938B AND SMA 6532H ON 04/11/2019  

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte 

Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto 

Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner 

of SMA 6532H against your motor insurance policy. 

  

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had 

amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as 

the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement 

with third party claimant. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 

settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 

 

 

 

Vic Alpeh  

DID: 6841 2096 

FAX: 6741 4108 

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

c.c.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  

             (Motor Claims Dept) 

  

 



4/29/2020 Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=70701795&CFTOKEN=92a179b6959d6203-B… 1/1

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMA6532H (2933895921SG)
[SMK1938B]

TP
ESTEEM LEASING PTE LTD

Nov 4 2019 6:00AM
[KOH SIONG QUN]

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

From   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 16/04/2020 14:38 PM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2069.07) - SMA6532H - Claim Handler: Goh, Jeremy-CX

Approved:2069.07:Subject to relevant documents submitted in order. COR: $1,745.59, LOR: $316.00 (4*$79),
GIA: $7.48
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>
Sent: May 8, 2020 5:09 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: LOD SMA6521H / Your Ref : SMK1938B (TP-AIG) - LKK REF CC4/AIG19021163/Kha3

Dear Jasper, 
 
We accept your offer at $2,069.07 to settle the property claim. 
 
Kindly let us have your DV asap. 
 
Thank you  
 
 
 

Right-click here to download pictures.  To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic 
download of this picture from the Internet.

 

Freundliche Grüße / Best Regards 

 

Carmen Lim 

Accident Claim Executive | Operation Division 

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd 

M: 8799 0066 
P: 6484 1221 
E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg 

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259 
(Head Office) 
385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre 
(Showroom) 

www.esteemperformance.com  
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On Fri, May 8, 2020 at 4:56 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Carmen,  
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We are prepare to improve our offer as below :  

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 1,745.59 
2. Loss of Rental  (4 days x $79.00 ) $    316.00 
3. LTA Search Fee $        7.48 

Total $ 2,069.07 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Carmen Lim [mailto:carmen@esteemperf.com.sg]  
Sent: May 2, 2020 2:44 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: LOD SMA6521H / Your Ref : SMK1938B (TP-AIG) - LKK REF CC4/AIG19021163/Kha3 
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Dear Jasper, 

  

We rejected your offer. 
 
We prepare to accept $2148.07 as per our LOD. 

  

Kindly review the above matter and let us hear from you favorably . 

  

Thank you  

 
 

  

 

   

Freundliche Grüße / Best Regards 

 

Carmen Lim 

Accident Claim Executive | Operation Division 

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd 

 

M: 8799 0066 
P: 6484 1221 
E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg 

 

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259 
(Head Office) 
385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre 
(Showroom) 

 

www.esteemperformance.com   

      

  

  

  

On Thu, Apr 30, 2020 at 10:45 AM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 


