Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Efficient Motor <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 May 2020 10:06 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: 'rizan’; Veron Chen (LKKAuto); ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; 'Jessie Ong'
Subject: RE: GBH 319R - Finalize

Dear Steve,
We are pleased to confirm your finalisation @ $1,664.34 (P/P, before GST). 3 repair days.

Thanks

Regards,

Jessie Ong

Accident Claim Supervisor

Tel: +65 8721 3003

Email: jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
56 Loyang Way, #06-07,Loyang Enterprise Building,Singapore 508775

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 20, 2020 8:44 AM

To: 'Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@ panpacificleasing.com.sg>

Cc: Efficient Motor <ppemclaims@gmail.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: GBH 319R - Finalize

Dear Jessie,
Kindly refer our finalize $1,664.34 (P/P, before GST). 3 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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