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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 April, 2020 6:18 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: LOD - Our Ref: SMP 272T and Your Ref: SMG 8228S (AIG) / DOA: 25-11-2019 - 

LKK REF CC4/AIG19021024/Bha3

Attachments: LOD -SMP272T. SMG8228S. 251119..pdf

Dear Vic, 

 

Without Prejudice 
 

Sincere apologies for the mix up my end. I had accidentally attached the wrong files for SMP 272T and 

another accident  SLA 5935Y.  Pls see attached the correct attachment for SMP 272T, correct attachments 

for SLA 5935Y already sent to Khanchna. 

 

WITHOUT  PREJUDICE 

Our Ref:   SMP 272T 
Your Ref: SMG 8228S 

Dear Vic, 

  

Accident Involving:     SMP 272T and SMG 8228S 

Date of Accident:        25 November 2019 

Location of Accident: Yishun Blk 880 Open Space Carpark 

  

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and hereby submit our claim as below, with the relevant documents attached.  

  

Cost of Repair as agreed  $             5,650.00   

Add Loss of Use  $                880.00  11 Days  
  **2 Days PRS + 1 Day Resurvey + 7 Repair Days Agreed + 1 Sunday 

Total  $             6,530.00   

Add LTA Search Fee   $                     7.45   

GRAND TOTAL  $             6,537.45   

  

Please feel free to contact us if you have any query otherwise kindly pay the Grand Total Amount to : 

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 
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160 Sin Ming Drive #02-12  
Sin Ming AutoCity   
Singapore 575722   

                                                                                                       

Thank you. 

--  
*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal 

injuries.* 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
Cheers, 

Adel  
Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6258 1955 
Fax: 6258 1956 
 

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

 

 

 

On Fri, Apr 3, 2020 at 1:41 PM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

We refer to your below email. 

  

We noted that the attached LOD is for a different vehicle number. 

  

Kindly check and resend the correct LOD. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

  

  

From: TeamAuto Pro [mailto:teamautoffice@gmail.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 16 January, 2020 5:07 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A 

Subject: LOD - Our Ref: SMP 272T and Your Ref: SMG 8228S (AIG) / DOA: 25-11-2019 

  

BY EMAIL  

WITHOUT  PREJUDICE 

Our Ref:   SMP 272T 
Your Ref: SMG 8228S 

Dear Vic, 

  

Accident Involving:     SMP 272T and SMG 8228S 

Date of Accident:        25 November 2019 

Location of Accident: Yishun Blk 880 Open Space Carpark 

  

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and hereby submit our claim as below, with the relevant documents attached.  
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Cost of Repair as agreed  $             5,650.00   

Add Loss of Use  $                880.00  11 Days  
  **2 Days PRS + 1 Day Resurvey + 7 Repair Days Agreed + 1 Sunday 

Total  $             6,530.00   

Add LTA Search Fee   $                     7.45   

GRAND TOTAL  $             6,537.45   

  

Please feel free to contact us if you have any query otherwise kindly pay the Grand Total Amount to : 

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-12  
Sin Ming AutoCity   
Singapore 575722   

                                                                                                       

Thank you. 

--  

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his 
personal injuries.* 

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 

Cheers, 

Adel  

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6258 1955 

Fax: 6258 1956 

  

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com> 

Date: Tue, Dec 10, 2019 at 5:23 PM 

Subject: Re: 2 Days Notice: SMP 272 T (Our Ref) and SMG 8228 S (Your Ref) Dated 25th November 

2019 

To: Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>, Chin, Lee-Ying <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>, Fong, Andy-

SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>, Kaur, Baljit <Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>, Lim, Sheng Yang 

<ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>, Supramaniam, 
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Darshene <Darshene.Supramaniam@aig.com>, Tan, Lily (AIG) <Lily.Tan@aig.com>, Vivian Yin Ru 

<yinrul.hor@aig.com> 

  

Dear Team, 

  

Good day. 

vehicle surveyed by LKK Auto 

First survey done on 06/12/2019 

Second survey done on 10/12/2019 

 

--  

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his 

personal injuries.* 

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 

Cheers, 

Peach 

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6258 1955 

Fax: 6258 1956 

  

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

  

  

  

On Wed, Nov 27, 2019 at 3:12 PM TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir/Madam,  

Road Traffic Accident Involving SMP 272 T (Our Ref) and SMG 8228 S (Your Ref) 

Dated 25th November 2019, Time around  1730HRS 
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@ YISHUN BLK 880 OPEN SPACE CARPARK 

  

We represent our client; ECHAN STUDIO, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving our client‘s 

vehicle registration number: SMP 272 T and your insured’s vehicle registration number: 

SKT 1272 P.  

  

Enclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your 
reference. 

  

For efficiency purpose, we are agreeable with the appointment of  Mr Lim -LKK   as 

the SJE for subject claim.   Please let us know within 2 working days from today your agreeing to the above otherwise 
kindly send us your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors, via email to the following personnel:- 

  

  

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999 

    

Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com 

Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14   Singapore 575722   
 

 

 

--  

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his 
personal injuries.* 

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 

Cheers, 

Peach 

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6258 1955 

Fax: 6258 1956 

  

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 
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