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ALFRED AUTO

Services & Supplies

Bk 5035 Ang Mo Ko Ave 3 # 01-351 Industrial Fark 2 Singapoie 569538
Tel: 463 <586 Fax: G983 4892 Reg. Mo, 391089/00-E
Email: alfredaidoillhatmall.com

Reference No: 221119

Date: 22.11.2019

Tan Boon Ann

Blk 74 Whampoa Drive #10-322

Singapore 320074

KIA Cerato K3

Estimated Repair Cost for Vehicle Reg. No: SJW 4477 S

REPLACEMENT OF DAMAGED PANELS / PARTS

1 Pc. Rear Bumper{ '\ 4 699.00 L

1 Pc. Rear Bumper Side Retainer syl ok o 52.00 &~ v
10 Pcs. Rear Bumper Clips 1, ¢ @ 5.00 50.00° 22|~ =i
1 Pc. Rear Bumper RH Dust Garnish k. 95.00 =

6 Pcs. Rear RH Garnish Clips =t 10 @ 6.00 36.00 / )

1 Pc. Rear RH Sport Rim (7 4 380.00 — =M
1 Pc. Rear Tyre ¢ N/B 295.00 A

Total (Panels / Parts): 1,607.00 (SGD)

LABOR CHARGES

To repair & refit wiring & refit parking sensor. 120000 4o
To remove & refit rear tyre & balancing. 60.00 -jj,i N
To knocking, straightening repair & renew all accident 486:000 257, ~

Damage parts.

To Respray painting on all accident affected damaged area. 500.00 %_--1-—

Total (Labor Charges): 1,160.00 (SGD)

bist A5 (00 SH Lo -vo
(06 b2-90 ri}\? (305-99

Lo T20-00
2 ﬂ\‘v{:'




ALFRED AUTO

Services & Suppnlies

Blk 5035 Ang Mo Kig Ave 3 £ 01-351 Industrisdl Park 2 Singapore 569538
lel: 6483 4586 Fax: 6483 4882 Reg. o, 39108%9/00-F
Emall: alfrasdagtodhatmall com

TOTAL COST SUMMARY
PANELS / PARTS 1,607.00
LABOR CHARGES 1,160.00

Grand Total: 2,767.00 (SGD)

We shall be glad if you can forward the payment at your early convenience.

Cheque should be crossed and make payable to 'Alfred Auto Services and Supplies’
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|
A NA - A A

.J.- ]lil"-lh b ‘\ j : L’

ALFRED AUTO SERVICES & SUPPLIES

'I\..Sf A ._.l

WK Ayto Consultants henca natify
the Repairer of the following:
ITH-M =" e AL TRy DaeThrg |I i L- .{Jli--'l.n _lL.
« To display damaged partis) durrs resurvey o~ s

« Parts prices are pubiect it confirmaton

* Thira paty Sirviy it O B "Without Prajudics” hasis o

Mo dlegal MOoACTION(] 14 Alewed

* Suppiernemary deTn) Ml De resurveyes pad

18 Jubyect o fnal approwal from Insurance Compam

Acnowiesged by Repsine
Sagrature;
Date:




1A9) r £
Nivitha (LKK Auto) \

From: Mator Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent; Wednesday, 27 November 2019 9:06 AM

To: Alfred Quah; ‘'sur@Ikkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Cc: C Meenachi - Il

Subject: RE: SJW 4477 S Estimate Repair

Attachments: SIW 4477 S - 221119 Estimate Repair.docx

4. 280m B 2%/ l‘M
Dear Sir / Mdm,
¢ Alhed
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle 54477 and let us have your report urgently, \
q: Notin
This claim will be handled by Ms Mesna,
"Kindly upload this survey request emall to merimen

Thank You

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

. ]Mt‘.ll.i.
P |rernaTIONAL
( InsurancE
Pl W OdapFPpDaN i
% Lerwrig S rug s smw | 9E"

B4 Cecll Strest; #05 - 108 Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext— 248

From: Alfred Quah [mailto:alfredauto@hotmail.com)
Sent: 26 November, 2019 7:27 PM

To: Motor Claim - 11l <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Subject: Re: SJW 4477 S Estimate Repair

thank you ....LKK survey pls fit a apointment with alfred quah @ 91454773

Alfred Quah
HP: 91454773

From: Motor Claim - Il emotorclaim@lii.com sg>
Sent: Tuesday, November 26, 2019 3:23 PM

To: Alfred Quah <aliredauto @hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: S/W 4477 S Estimate Repair

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email

We proprose using one of the following motar surveyors:



» LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
L ® Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections 1o the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

P InoIA
° @ INTERNATIONAL
INsuRANCE

LW G aF DRI
SerFunmg (R gt e [WEY

64 Cecll Street; #05 - 10B Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 5347 5100, Ext - 244

From: Alfred Quah [mailto:alfredauto @hotmail.com)
Sent: 26 November, 2019 12:22 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll emotorclaim@ili.com.sg>
Subject: Fw: SIW 4477 S Estimate Repair

Alfred Quah

HP: 91454773

From: Nicholas Lai <nicholas [ai@hotmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, November 23, 2019 8:56 PM
To: Alfred Quah <alfredauto@hotmail.com>
Subject: SIW 4477 S Estimate Repair

Please check,

NL

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed 10 have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us 10 ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same. kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

[nternet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this

2



message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

[t may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K
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Meriman a-Claims

Claim Audit
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Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 B:32 AM

To: Alfred Quah

Cc Admin A

Subject: Your Ref SJWa4477S *Our Ref: CC4/11119021003/Dpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH

A590(111) AND SIW 44775 ON 22/11/2019]

Your Ref: SIWa4775 Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/11119021003/Dpa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 459U(IlI) AND SJW 44775 ON 22/11/2015
We refer to the above matter.

please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned
case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Thank you.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basls with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues
of iiability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terma/settlement.”

“Wishing you & Hapyy and Prosperous New Year

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(g08933)



2202020 Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit
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22172020 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with ©

*SIW4477S (MFL2019D0001492)
(GBH450U]
]

TAN BOON ANN
Nov 22 2019 12:00AM

3!
Alfred Auto Services & Supplies

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Ill_SG), sent on 20/02/2020 19:22 PM.
To LKK_HO

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2053.40) - SJW44775S - Claim Handler: C. Meenachi

Approved:2053.40:WE ARE KEEN ON DIRECT SETTLEMENT

hupuﬁulmpma.mn.mrrﬁmhuﬂm.dm‘?fuumﬁﬁvl:mu!mmmm_PﬁMﬂFlD:ENTE&BG&ﬂFFOKEN—WhH1&24:-F2... 1




Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Alfred Quah <alfredautoss@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 22 February 2020 10:05 AM

To: Hsiaa Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SIW44T7S *Our Ref: CC4/11119021003/Dpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

GBH 459U(1I1) AND SJW 44775 ON 22/11/2019]

ok to your offter . take and go .
[WITHOUT PREJUDICE SAVE AS TO COSTS]

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Alfred QUAH (Mr)

Alfred Auto Services & Supplies

ACRA: 391089/00E

HP/WhatsApp: 9145-4773

Tel: 6483-4586

Fax: 6483-4882

Email: alfredautoss@gmail.com

Address: 5035 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2, #01-351,
Singapore 569538

On Sat, Feb 22, 2020 at 8:26 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.,

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair 5 1,805.90
2. Loss of Use (3days x $60.00) S 1B80.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 7.50

Total | $1,993.40




Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotlation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred fram this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 8:32 AM
To: Alfred Quah <alfredauto@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Your Ref: SIW44775 *Our Ref: CC4/11118021003/Dpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 459U(111) AND SIW

44775 ON 22/11/2019]

Your Ref: SIWa4775 Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/11119021003/Dpa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 459U(1I1) AND SJW 44775 ON 22/11/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability Is clear / under
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned
case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Wishing you & Happy and Prosperous New Year”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiemeant

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Nobfied Eot Sutmmitted | Ael) Assigned Rd) Apt Ad] Submitted _|ins Aathed Siatus
oy |28 Wov 201 ST hovI0I®  se180590 | 58180550 perrpda
Edlit A et Adi Aot | ecit Estimates | | view Ao Consi Ooon |

Claim Detsils

Main

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Ereated by sdjuster]

Tnsured: | PAN PACIFIC 'l"“_'.__m LEASING PTE LTD, Co Reg Noo: 2015116358
Main .
Clalimank: .'F.l.ﬂ BOON ANN, [D: S1425338H
Vehicle Reg. | 2271172019 00:00 - .59
Mo E”w"“ = Date of LOSE: |1 99 Manths and 20 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr]]
Cisim Type: | TP / MFL2019D0001492 m‘:"{i’"' DISMFLODOS 549
Vehicle Aeg
Policy No.
;Tnsur!dj; GRH459U {Clairnant): 09914547501
Eacss

. Alfred Auto Services & Supplies (HQ) Blk 5035, Ang Ma Kio Ave 3, #01-351, Ang Ma Kio Industrial Park 2, S63538 Ang Mo Kio -
PRIFEE. | Tel: BAS34586/91454773

mﬂfitlrw India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel; 63478100 ... [Handied by C. Meenachl - 6347 6073]

m":'“" NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Lid (HQ) - Tel:

Al juster: LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by BRYAM TANI] ... [Final Rpt due 06/12/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case man |

« T1I_5G (20/02/2020): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved [S$2053.40) - SIWA477S - Claim Handler; C. Mesnachi
o I_SG(17/01/2020): Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved (S$0.00) - SIW4477S - Claim Handler: C. Meenachi
o [11_SG (18/12/2019): Alert - Ad)] Mandate Approved (S$0.00) - SIW44775 - Clalm Handlar: C. Meenachi

ALL ASSDCIATED TASKS= wiew Ml | Search Tases | Create New Task | Compiste |

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handlar Aszigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo resulti.

https:/singapore. menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=d... 25/2/2020



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2
Claim Documents
*SIW44775 (MFL2019D0001492)
[GBH459U]
TP
TAN BOON ANN
Nov 22 2019 12:00AM
[PAN PACIFIC VAN & TRUCK LEASING PTE LTD]
Alfred Auto Services & Supplies

Video [iperpage V]| &8
Ne | Finalized On Indla International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ} Thumbnall | Print
P | 20/12/19 15:23 | Video - Accident @ | Load HPe
Photos/Images [3perpage [V &
He | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |11/02/20 13:44 | Rear View Right 0| eadies | A
2 |11/02/20 13144 | General View 0| esws | A
3 |11/03/70 13144 | General Viaw 0 | Lad s
A | 11/02720 L34a Genaral View _! Load PG 5'];
5 [11/02/20 13:44 | Genaral View 0| wurs | &
B |11/02/20 1344 Genaral View 0| cadir: | 4
7 |11/02/20 13:44 General View O | oedivc | A
8 [11/0/2013:44 | Senarsd View O | Lo | &
9 | 11/02/20 13:44 Ganaral View ' Load G | GF
10 |11/02/20 13:44 | General View @ | wavc | WA
11 |11/02/20 13:44 Ganaral View 0| icadirc | A
12 |1D2/20 1344 | General View 0| tosdwec | A
13 |11/02/20 1344 | Genarsl View 0| oaws | A
14 |11/02/20 13:44 | General View 0| v | A
15 [11/02/20 13:44 | Ganaral View | wdwe | A
16 |11/02/20 13:44 Genaral View 0| oadirc | A
17 |1D2/20 1344 | Ddometer Reading @ | oawc | A
10 | 11/02/20 13:44 Chassis Mumber D lodivg | B
19 |11/02/20 13:45 | Replscement Part Photo O | iaws | A
(20 [11/02/2013:45 | Replscemant Part Photo 0| wedirc | B
21 |11/02/20 13:45 feplacement Part Photo D | lcadiec | BA
22 |1D2/20 1345 | Replacement Part Photo D | teadivc | A
23 |13/02/20 13:45 | Replacement Part Photo 0| tsedies | A
74 |11/02/20 13:45 | After Repair Photo 0| wadirc | &
25 |11/02/20 13:45 | Afver Repair Photo 0| wars | A
25 |1U02/20 13:45 After Repair Photo 0| oadirc | M
Documentation |2 ﬁv 3|
No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |27/11/1915:36 | TP ESTIMATE % Load POF

2 (2911191536 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO IIT BD 27.11.19 Load POF

3 |11/01/20 10:28 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF

4 |11/01/20 10:28 | TP GIA REPORT. Load POF

5 |20/02/20 0B:55 | LOD Load POF

6 |20/02/I0 0B:55 | Authorisation to Act Load POF

7 |20/02/20 0855 | Workshop Invalcs Load POF

B 20/02,30 0B:55 LTA Search Fes Load POF

& |25/D2/20 11:43 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Loag FOF

No _|Finalized On Indin International Insurance Pte Ltd (HGQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |08/01/20 1000 |1V Singapore Accident Statement @ | Losaror
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Documents Checklist
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Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg no 1sseo71ssr)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6B844-8B05 Email: sun@ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/1118021003/DPA30Q2

Date: 25/02/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer- m"“ inlemational Insuranca Ple b, o D18MFLODD5548
Claimant Insured Vehicle
Vehicle No : SJWE477S No : GBH459U
Date of Loss:  22/11/2018 Nature of Claim: TP ﬁ';'“‘ MFL2018D0001492
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJW44TTS
Make & Model: KIA CERATO, 1.6 (A) Engine No: G4FGGHE41T04
Reg. Date: 02/05/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: KMNAFX411MH5T20678
Colour: Gray Odometer: 130618 km
Engine Capacity: 1681 cc
Market Valua/Mew Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
Ganeral Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification; No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size; 205/55 R16
Fronl Lefi Side Pirelli 5 mm Rear Laft Side: Pirelli 5 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli 5 mm Rear Right Side: Firelli 5§ mm
The above values represent [he remaining lyve reads dapih
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Parts 1.607.00 1.085.80 521.10 32.43
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,160.00 720.00 440.00 37.e3
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (S§) 2,767.00 1,805.90 961.10 34.73
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x $$60.00/day) (S$) 180.00
+ Doc/Search Fea (S§) 7.50
Nett Liability (S$) 1,993.40
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 27112019
Date Inspecied: 29/11/2019 Inspected Al Alfred Autlo Services & Supplies (HQ)
Blk 5035, Ang Mo Kio Ave 3, #01-351,
Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2
Singapore 569538
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
Adjuster: BRYAN TANI Manager: CHEW HSIAQ TONG

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 25/2/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the fime and place of mspection staled horein. Such inspection has been camied out [o the best of owr
knawledge and abiiity but any other ladilty undor any other circumetances (s hemby sxpressly escluded
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 11 Feb 2020)

Parts: 143 KlA CERATO 1.6 (A) (Catalogue:Menmen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code; iUnsuhrmhﬂd. no print-code for SJW44775)

Validity: These estimales are valid only if they contain the print code (abovae) on all eslimale pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Cut BO0.00F *686.00 FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER O/S Broken 52.00F *52.00 FL
3 10 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS MNecessary 50.00FS *30.00F5
4 1 *REAR BUMPER RH DUST GARNISH Mot Necessary 85.00F *-
5 B *REAR RH GARNISH CLIPS Mot Necessary 36.00F -
8 1 *REAR RH SPORT RIM Cut 3B0.00FS  ~3B0.00FS
7T 01 *REAR TYRE Serviceable 20500F *FL

FaFranchise part S=Spchett L=ListiemOisc
Sub Total (S5) 1.607.00 1.161.00
- List tem Discount on L ltems 0.00/10.00% (5%) 0.00 75.10

Total Parts (S§)  1,607.00 1,085.90

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

hitps://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 25/2/2020



Adjuster Repont

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REPAIR & REFIT WIRING & REFIT PARKING SENSOR New 120.00 40.00
2 TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR TYRE & BALANCING New 60.00 30.00
3 TO KNOCKING ,STRAIGHTENING REPAIR & RENEW ALL MNew 480.00 350.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGE PARTS
4 TORESPRAY PAINTING ON ALL ACCIDENT AFFECTED Mew 500.00 300.00
DAMAGED AREA
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,160.00 720.00

Repor was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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