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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 13 January 2020 8:33 AM
To: Adeline
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Your Ref: PC7285T *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19020992/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 

SLG 8997S(FWD) /PC 7285T/ OTHERS ON 26/11/2019]

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have appealed your matter to our principal for further review. However we regret to inform you that we are 
unable to proceed Direct Settlement as your client failed to stop in time and hit onto our insured vehicle. 
 
Thank you. 
 

“Wishing you a Happy and Prosperous New Year”  

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Adeline <karen@leebrothers.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 5:22 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: Your Ref: PC7285T *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19020992/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 8997S(FWD) /PC 
7285T/ OTHERS ON 26/11/2019] 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
The following file attachment is LOD for PC7285T for your settlement. 
 
Do have your reply soon to settle the case. 
 
Thanks & Best Regards 
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Adeline Seng 
Lee Brothers Automotive Pte Ltd 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
#02-47 Autobay 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6509 5521 
Fax: 6509 5523 
 

From: Adeline [mailto:karen@leebrothers.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 December, 2019 1:43 PM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: PC7285T *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19020992/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 8997S(FWD) /PC 
7285T/ OTHERS ON 26/11/2019] 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We had attached the video for your pursue. Your client had make an invalid / false report and it should not stand 
under BOLA act. 
 
My client had been travelling along the said location on lane one and your insured had hit onto the Toyota Altis on 
lane 3 subsequently swerve onto lane one and jam brake. Causing my client unable to avoid the accident and hit 
onto your client. We strongly deem that this case should be in our favour. 
 
Please kindly review this case and allow us to have the liability for this case. 
 
Thanks & Best Regards 
Jason Lee 
Lee Brothers Automotive Pte Ltd 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
#02-47 Autobay 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6509 5521 
Fax: 6509 5523 
 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 16 December, 2019 2:57 PM 
To: Adeline <karen@leebrothers.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: PC7285T *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19020992/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 8997S(FWD) /PC 
7285T/ OTHERS ON 26/11/2019] 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We have forwarded your scene photos to our principal for review. However we regret to inform you that under 
BOLA, we are not liable to your client’s claim. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 2020” 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Adeline <karen@leebrothers.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 5:22 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: PC7285T *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19020992/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 8997S(FWD) /PC 
7285T/ OTHERS ON 26/11/2019] 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Vehicle B (Your client’s vehicle: SLG8997S) have already hit onto Vehicle C (SLD3294K) while he was travelling on the 
3rd lane. He then swerved right across 2 lanes and into my lane (1st lane) and made an abrupt stop. That abrupt stop 
caused my client’s vehicle (PC7285T) which was travelling straight at that point of time, unable to stop in time and 
hit onto Vehicle B.  
 
Kindly see attached photo. Your client’s vehicle was on the 2nd lane while Vehicle C and my client’s vehicle were on 
their respective lanes. It’s not consistent if your client mentioned that my client’s vehicle hit onto him and resulted 
in him hitting onto Vehicle C. 
 
Do review the case and get back to us soon. 
 
Thanks & Best Regards 
 
Adeline Seng 
Lee Brothers Automotive Pte Ltd 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
#02-47 Autobay 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6509 5521 
Fax: 6509 5523 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 4 December, 2019 8:28 AM 
To: karen@leebrothers.com.sg 
Subject: Your Ref: PC7285T *Our Ref: CC4/FWD19020992/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 8997S(FWD) /PC 7285T/ 
OTHERS ON 26/11/2019] 
 
Your Ref: PC7285T                                             Without Prejudice 
Our Ref: CC4/FWD19020992/Upa3 
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Dear Sirs/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 8997S(FWD) /PC 7285T/ OTHERS ON 26/11/2019 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference. 
 
As per FWD instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our 
necessary action. 
 
Appreciate an early reply. 
 
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 


