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III Ref: MFL2019D0001409//LKK Ref: CC4/III19020908/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GBH 4356G AND SKD 2417S ON 10/11/2019]

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sun 20/6/2021 11:58 AM
To:  Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

1 attachments (466 KB)
Email to 3rd Party dd 220321.pdf;

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have offered third party at a 50% global sum of $1,900.00(all-in) 28/07/2020. Up to date, we did not
receive any response from Third Party.

In view of non-development from the third-party, we will proceed to temporarily close this outstanding claim
file and submit our survey report to your good office.

In future, if there are any new developments from the claimant, we will inform you for our further handling.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019 - CALL
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Mon 22/3/2021 11:38 AM
To:  Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to our email dated 28/07/2020.
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Sunday, 31 January 2021 11:52 AM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to our email dated 28/07/2020.
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

 

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 September 2020 12:50 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to our email dated 28/07/2020.
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

 
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Tuesday, 28 July 2020 4:40 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>


mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Our principal had reviewed the matter and for an amicable settlement, we are prepared to offer at a global
sum of $1,900.00(all-in).
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 11:55 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT
 

Your Ref: 

Our Ref : SKD 2417 S

 

4 March 2020

 

India International Insurance Pte Ltd                                            PROPERTY CLAIM

64 Cecil Street                                                                          (WITHOUT PREJUDICE


mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com


6/20/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%2BZo1sw… 4/9

#04-#05                                                                                   TO: Any Personal Injury

IOB Building                                                                                Claims)

Singapore 049711

 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,

Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

 

Attn: Claims Department

 

Dear Sir/Mdm,

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT

 

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SKD 2417 S, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert. We are
pleased to inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

 

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving
SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G on 10 November 2019.  We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle
for the amount as stated below:

 

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE)                    : $   3,400.00

Cost of Rental                                                                    :$ 1,020.00 

LTA Search                                                                   :  $       7.45

 

 

Total:                                                                          :  $ 4,427.45
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We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within
the next 7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury
claims), if required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

 

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SKD 2417 S, rental invoices and LTA search for
your easy reference.

 

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1st June 2019, we have shifted to and
are now operating from the following address:

 

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

 

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address
above.

 

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

 

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

 

6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

 
 

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 30, 2020 12:57 PM

To: Motor Claim - III <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019 - APPOINTMENT OF
LKK AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT
 

mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
mailto:motorclaim@iii.com.sg
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Your Ref:

Our Ref: SKD 2417 S

 

30 January 2020

 

India International Insurance Pte Ltd                                         PROPERTY CLAIM

64 Cecil Street                                                                        (WITHOUT PREJUDICE

#04-#05                                                                                TO: Any Personal Injury

IOB Building                                                                            Claims)

Singapore 049711

 

Attn: Claims Department                                                           Via Email

                                                                                        

Dear Sir/Mdm,

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019 - APPOINTMENT OF
LKK AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

 

Thank you so much for your reply dated 28 January 2020.  We can confirm that the vehicle is presently in our
workshop. We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to your selection of LKK as the Single Joint
Expert.

 

In compliance with the New State Courts Practice Directions, we shall await your kind office to
instruct LKK (as the Single Joint Expert) to attend to the pre-repair survey of our client's damaged vehicle at
our premise at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808.

 

We seek your assistance in arranging for the pre-repair survey by 3 February 2020 (Monday), 1300H so
that we can commence repair on our client's damaged vehicle as soon as possible and expedite the return of
the vehicle to our client.

 

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

 

 

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
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6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

 

*Please note that with effect from 1st June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating from the
following address:

 

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

Kindly update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above
please.

 
 

From: Motor Claim - III <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, January 28, 2020 5:20 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019
 
Dear Sirs,
 
We refer to the matter above.
 
We have received survey request from Volkswagen Centre Singapore. Kindly confirm that your client has
decided to change workshop and if you are agreeable to have LKK be the Single joint expert (SJE).
 
Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
 

64 Cecil  Street; #05 - IOB Building  
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext – 248
 
 
 
From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com] 

Sent: 28 January, 2020 4:27 PM

To: Motor Claim - III <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019
 

Your Ref:

Our Ref: SKD 2417 S

mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
mailto:motorclaim@iii.com.sg
mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
mailto:motorclaim@iii.com.sg
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28 Jan 2020

India International Insurance Pte Ltd                                         PROPERTY CLAIM

64 Cecil Street                                                                        (WITHOUT PREJUDICE

#04-#05                                                                                TO: Any Personal Injury

IOB Building                                                                            Claims)

Singapore 049711

 

Attn: Claims Department                                                           Via Email

 

Dear Sir/Mdm,

 

NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 2417 S & GBH 4356 G ON 10 NOVEMBER 2019

 

We are instructed to notify you of a road traffic accident on 10 November 2019 at
about 2055H at Geylang Road Towards Kallang Road LP57 involving our client's vehicle registration
number SKD 2417 S and vehicle registration number GBH 4356 G driven by your insured at the material
time.

 

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged.  Before our client/we proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice and your proposed
list of 10 recommended motor surveyors for our appointment.

 

Kindly note that if we do not hear from you by 30 January 2020 (Thursday), 1630H, we will be
forwarding our proposed list of 10 motor surveyors for your appointment, in accordance to the new
regulations.

 

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

 

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586
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6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

 
Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the
General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or
dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you
do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. 

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. 

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached 

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby 

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination 

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be 

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. 

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this 

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission 

or any modification. 

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment. 

India International Insurance Pte Ltd. 

Registration No. 198703792-K

mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

