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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 6:35 PM

To: Juliana Lee

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey by LKK (Vehicle No. SLS 6866L ; Your Ref: MT/1072594-002)

Attachments: Inspection Photographs.pdf; Photo of damaged parts.pdf; Photo After Spray.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf

Dear Juliana, 

 

Refer to your assignment on 26.11.2019 at 9.37am. 

 

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLS 6866L on 26.11.2019 at 12.15pm. 

 

At the time of inspection the repairer did not present their estimation to the damaged vehicle. 

 

Please find attached Pre-Repair photographs and invoice of SLS 6866L. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Hazalysa Binte Ibrahim <hazalysa.ibrahim@income.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2019 9:49 AM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Hazalysa Binte Ibrahim <hazalysa.ibrahim@income.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: TP CASES FARMED OUT TO LKK ON 26/11/2019 

 

Dear LKK, 

 

Re-send with details. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Warmest Regards  

 

Hazalysa Bte Ibrahim 

Admin Assistant 

Operations, Motor & Personal Lines (PL) 

www.income.com.sg 
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From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2019 10:40 AM 

To: Hazalysa Binte Ibrahim <hazalysa.ibrahim@income.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Susan Ting <susan.ting@income.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: TP CASES FARMED OUT TO LKK ON 26/11/2019 

 

Dear Hazalysa, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 
 

Best Regards  

 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

 

 

 

From: Hazalysa Binte Ibrahim [mailto:hazalysa.ibrahim@income.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2019 9:37 AM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Susan Ting <susan.ting@income.com.sg>; Hazalysa Binte Ibrahim <hazalysa.ibrahim@income.com.sg> 

Subject: TP CASES FARMED OUT TO LKK ON 26/11/2019 

 

Dear LKK, 

 

Please assist to survey the following vehicles as per Mr Teng’s instruction :- 

 

SN OIC Claim No. Vehicle 

WorkShop 

Name 

WorkShop 

Address 

WorkShop 

Contact 

Survey 

Time OI VEH DOA 

Additional 

Remarks 

1 

Fiona 

Shen 
MT/1072178-

002 SJV8136E 

CAR LIFE AUTO 

ENGINEERING 

SERVICES 

BLK 1002 BUKIT 

MERAH LANE 3 #01-

75 / 62733810    GBG182Y 20/11/19   

2 

Cyndiie 

Yong   
 MT/1072920-

002 SHB2379P 

DING 

AUTOMOTIVE 

PTE LTD 

31 CORPORATION 

ROAD SINGAPORE 

649825 

VADIVELAN 

MOHAN / 

62657130  / 

96891857    SJY9469Y 24/11/19   

3 

Cyndiie 

Yong 
 MT/1072650-

002 SHA9526R 

DING 

AUTOMOTIVE 

PTE LTD 

31 CORPORATION 

ROAD SINGAPORE 

649825 

VADIVELAN 

MOHAN / / 

62657130  / 

96891857   SKB9548L 22/11/19   

4 

Eng 

Huey 

Huey   
MT/1072027-

002 SCR784R 

HIN LUNG 

WORKSHOP 

BLK 1008 #01-20 

BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 

SINGAPORE 159722 

Anna / 6858 

3000  

10:00-

12:00  FZ4485A 18/11/19   

5 

Juliana 

Lee 
MT/1072062-

002 FX7628X 

LEONG SENG 

MOTOR PTE 

LTD 

BLK 1006 #01-08 

BUKIT MERAH LANE 2 

SINGAPORE 159762 

c s teo / 

62737469 

10:00-

12:00  SJY6501G 16/11/19 

will be on half day 

leave tomorrow 

afternoon** 

6 

Juliana 

Lee 
MT/1072594-

002 SLS6866L 

MILLION AUTO 

SERVICE 

4 PENJURU PLACE 

#01-12 2.8 PENJURU 

TECH HUB 

Ms Chong / 

82285020 / 

62649091    SMN787K 21/11/19   

7 

Chester 

Chong 
MT/1072243-

002 SKS711B 

TRANS 

EUROKARS PTE 

LTD 

27A TANJONG 

PERJURU SINGAPORE 

609042 

Jess Francis 

Carlos / 8128 

9802 

14:00-

16:00  SGM751P 19/11/19   

 

Please contact workshops. 
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Please revert to officer-in-charge after survey. 

 

 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Warmest Regards  

 

Hazalysa Bte Ibrahim 

Admin Assistant 

Motor Department  

T +65 6430 7902 

www.income.com.sg 

 

 

     

PLEASE CONSIDER OUR ENVIRONMENT BEFORE YOU PRINT THIS EMAIL... 

 

 

Disclaimer 

 

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) 

named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all 

copies of it. Thank you.  

 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 

Disclaimer 

 

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named 

above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank 

you.  


