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51 UBLAVE 1, 001-25 PAVA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408910 TEL : (D65) A2861841 FAX @ (B65) 62564312

Your Ref; D19007429MFSH Date: 29 Nov 2019
Our Ref: CS/FCI19020868/Kyi3

The Motor Claims Department
S Fi ital | ce
Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SHF504L .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 26/11/2019 at the premises of M/s HTRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES P/L. and have
the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :8
Revised Estimate Amount : S8 1.470.06
“Check” ltems Amount : S§ -
Market Value : S8 -
LTA Reimbursement Value :S§% -
Nett Value : 5% -
Description of Damage:
[he vehicle sustained damages

the Lo/s irror. - front
Yours faithfully
KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser
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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 25-11-2019 Our Ref No. D19007429MFSH
Accident Date 21-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHAD403X Third Party Vehicle. SHF504L
Survey Location NO. 2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63
Contact Person. CANDY KONG
Contact No. 62876666/ 0 Fax No. 52571330
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:
fippoinée LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax Mo. GB416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

TRANS-CAB AUTOD
Cc : Workshop SERVICES PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey essignment and 7 days for re-inspection,
This is @ computer generated letter, no signalure required




Yvonne Wong !LI{K Auto)

From: Ng Wal Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.comsg>

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2019 11:33 AM

To: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Cc: ‘Jasmine Tan'

Subject: FW: VEHICLE NO: SHF 504L DOA: 21/11/2019 - AAD1911-169
Attachments: SHF 504L ESTIMATE.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Yvonne
Amount confirmed § 1,150 (before GS5T).

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 B 308

*+* plegse be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) [mailto:yvonnewong@lkkauto.com)
Sent: Friday, 13 December, 2019 5:42 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <walyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Ce: 'lasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: VEHICLE NO: SHF 504L DOA: 21/ 11/2019

Hi Wal Yin

| check and confirm is L/S $1150.00 @ 1 days repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6256-1561 | email: yvonnewong@ | kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S(q08933)

1
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Yvonne Wuna (LKK Autu!

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, November 29, 2019 5:56 PM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims'; SUR

Cc: ‘Merina Chia’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12007429MFSH/1
Attachments: SHFS04L DOA 21112019 REVERT.pdf

Dear Sirf Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHFS04L
Date of survey : 26/11/2019
Number of days : 1 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(308933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, November 26, 2019 10:02 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007429MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auio Consullants Pte Lud

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

1



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 November, 2019 5:31 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTSE LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007429MFS5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This Is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



PAKF/LULE Kebate Enguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Fage | of |

Owreer |0 Type: Company

Owner ID: B7BK

Wehicle Details

Vehicle Mo SHFS04L

Vehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended Deregistration Date: 21 Nowv 2019

Vehicle Make: REMAULT

Wehicle Model: LATITUDE 20L DCI AUTOD/AB4DR
Primary Colour: Red

Manufacturing Year: 2014

Engine Mo.: MIRB[IPCO01487
Chassis No: VF1ABL15AUC27E211
Maximum Power Cutput: 127.0 kW (170 bhe)
Open Market Value: $19,998.00

Original Reglstration Date: 13 Jun 2014

First Registration Date: 13 Jun 2014

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $12498.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Ellgibility Expiry Date 12 Jun 2022

PARF Rebate Amount: $B.748.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 12 Jun 2022

COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97KW [130bhp)
COE Period(Years) 8

PQF Paid: $57.338.00

COE Rebate Amount: $18.349.00

Total Rebate Amount: $27.097.00

Message

Please nate that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
wehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (If applicable), whichever is earlier.
The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Nov 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lla/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput ’FUNCTION _[D=F03... 21/11/2019



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No. : 6287 6666  Fax No. : 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 2010196266

SHF 5041

Vehicle No.:

Chassis No..

Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:

Date of Accident :
Third Party Insurer :
Date of Registration:

PART

1 DOOR PANEL FRT RH
1 DOOR MIRROR ASSY RH
1 DOOR HARNESS WIRE RH
TOTAL
10%
Special Nett
1 FRONT DOOR STICKER 'Trans-Cab'
1 FRONT DOOR STICKER ‘Classic’
TOTAL
TOTAL PARTS

LABOUR
Panel beating, knocking and straightening the
necessary portion, remove and renewal of parts, adjust
and realign the same

To remove and refit interior fittings, trimings, gamnish,
fittings and other, to enable repair.

Putty and spray painting of the affected portion.

To transfer of front door fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test.

AAD1911-169

oy Zyrbsaniy

£ rp § 1752/

SHF 504L
VF1ABL15AUC278211
RENAULT
LATITUDE
21.11.19
FCIL
13-06-14
usT
5 T 284466 X
$ €/ 148340 —
§ L 267000 X
3 6,998.06
s 699.81
3 6,298.25
$ nn  80.00%
$ " 80,00 %
3 160.00
3 6,458.25
$ 3,00000 §or
$ A~ 38000 X
$ 300000 457
$ /Ao 17000 X



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1911-169
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel Mo. : 6287 6666 Fax No.: 6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHF 504L
To Check Electrical Lighting Concerned $ 17000 /34
To rust-proofing of the affected areas. 3 An 17000 X
TOTAL $ 6,890.00
Over All Total § 13,348.25
LUMP SUM (REPAIR DAY) _10-days

/a/..’-_?,



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
571 Ubi Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubi Induatnal Park, Singapone 408833
TEL: B258 3581 FAX: B258 4315
Reg. No: 18960T168R GST Reg No. 19-8607 198-R

CSIFCI18020868/Kyfan2

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Red
ﬁsﬁcﬂsg}f\? EORL?;EDSIHGAFGRE 068877 A deradne IHMII"‘HI"IHW
Coda : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 403X Veh. Inspected SHF 504L
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19007429MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MERINA CHIA SAN SAN Assign Date 2511172018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model RENAULT LATITUDE (A) c.c 1985
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. VF1ABL15AUCZTE211 Colour METALLIC WHITE /RED
Odometer BO6BO2 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. _Conditions of Tyres T
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 LING LONG 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 LING LONG 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 GIT B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S DOOR MIRROR.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. ' _General Information i =
Accident Date  21/11/2018 |[inspection Date 26/11/2018
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
ND.2 ANG MO KIO ST &3
SINGAPORE 568111
Sa, OV ~ Remarks = =
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
T DA Bl _ Estimate Days of Repair :

-lEST1MA'I'ED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 1 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: A258 4315

Reg. No: 189607188R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8607T188-R Page Na. -1 af 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHF 504L
ay | ~ Description of Parts. 3 w1 i il
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|DOOR PANEL FRT RH TO REPAIR SEE 2,844 66 -
LABOUR
1|DOCOR MIRROR ASSY RH CRACKED 1,483.40 1,483.40
1|DOOR HARNESS WIRE RH SERVICEABLE 2.670.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -69%9.81 -148.34
B,208.25 1,335.06
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER “TRANS-CAB" (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER "CLASSIC" (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
160.00 -
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 3,000.00 60,00
NECESSARY PORTION REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS,ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF DOOR PANEL FRT RH,
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
FITTINGS, TRIMINGS, GARNISH,
FITTINGS AND OTHER, TO ENABLE REPAIR.
PUTTY AND SFRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 3,000.00 60.00
PORTION
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT DOOR NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED. 170.00 15.00
TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
6,890.00 135.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,348.25 1,470.06
HEWIIH NDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS : | 115000
E-ACCIDENT C - MRE0| T

. 4ve

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licansed Appraiser

Report Rel No. CS/FCI119020868/Kyf3n2
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