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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 2:15 pm
To: jaime.tay@egqinsurance.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Advice on Market Value SLZ6933B
Dear Jaime,

The market value for SLZ 6933B is $ 57K (est) as at November 2019.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 10:02 am

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Advice on Market Value SLZ6933B

Hi
Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@eginsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 22 November, 2019 9:52 AM
Subject: Advice on Market Value SLZ6933B

Dear Sirs,
Please let us have your urgent advice of the market value with details as follow:

Date of Accident: 08/11/2019



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 10:02 am

To: SUR

Subject: FW: Advice on Market Value SLZ6933B
Attachments: PARF_COE Rebate Enquiry - SKZ6933B.PDF
Hi

Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@]lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 22 November, 2019 9:52 AM

Subject: Advice on Market Value SLZ6933B

Dear Sirs,

Please let us have your urgent advice of the market value with details as follow:

Date of Accident: 08/11/2019




> Back to OneMotoring

Enhquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Nov 2019

Singapore NRIC
215C

SKZ6933B

No

25 Nov 2019
HONDA

VEZEL 1.5X CVT
White

2015
L15B4029231
RU11109228
96.0 kW (128 bhp)
$19,282.00

29 Jan 2016

29 Jan 2016

0

$9,282.00

Yes
28 Jan 2026
$6,961.00

28 Jan 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$56,989.00

$35,189.00

$42,150.00
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