Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 9:10 AM

To: Sbk E; Naz (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: PAYMENT, Re: INV AND DV, Re: FBP 9759C-DOA: 21/11/2019 (AIG OD)
Dear Mr Kwan,

Submitted.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 9:02 AM

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@Ilkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@l|kkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PAYMENT, Re: INV AND DV, Re: FBP 9759C-DOA: 21/11/2019 (AIG OD)

Dear Veron,

Please kindly confirm if you have submitted the report? Thanks.
Regards,

Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Friday, December 27, 2019, 6:57:04 AM GMT+8, Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Veron,

Please kindly assist. Thanks.
Regards,

Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Tuesday, December 24, 2019, 11:47:50 AM GMT+8, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Mr Kwan,



Please forward invoice and discharge voucher for our closure.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 11:39 AM

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FBP 9759C-DOA: 21/11/2019 (AIG OD)

Dear All,

Merry Christmas too! | agree to the finalization. Thanks.
Regards,

Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Monday, December 23, 2019, 11:40:55 AM GMT+8, Naz (LKKAuto) <naz@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Mr Kwan,

Finalized Lump Sum Repair $1600.00 / 2 Repair Days subject to insurance approval.
Thank you.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Naz| Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 December 2019 7:40 AM

To: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FBP 9759C-DOA: 21/11/2019 (AIG OD)

Dear Naz,

Kindly assist finalize with repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Sunday, 22 December 2019 8:46 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FBP 9759C-DOA: 21/11/2019 (AIG OD)

Dear Veron,

Please assist to finalise FBP9759C. Thanks.
Regards,

Kwan S. H.

Director

Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Monday, December 9, 2019, 12:08:53 PM GMT+8, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Naz,

Kindly assist finalize.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 11:57 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FBP 9759C-DOA: 21/11/2019 (AIG OD)

Dear Veron,

Please kindly finalize. Thanks.
Regards,

Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Tuesday, December 3, 2019, 4:11:23 PM GMT+8, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
wrote:

Dear Mr Kwan,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair theinsured vehicle FBP 9759CNot
exceeding Lump Sum $1600/- ,(Excess $300/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment
Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance
company before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



