Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 June 2021 2:17 PM

To: Jerleen Tang

Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)
Attachments: DV_GBE1696K.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 June 2021 6:10 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Cfm. PIs forward dv.
Thanks

Get Outlook for Android

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 28 May 2021, 14:56

To: Jerleen

Subject: Re: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)




Without Prejudice
Hi Jerleen,

Our offer is on 50% basis, breakdown as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $18,190.00
2. Loss of Rental (15days x $100.00) S 1,500.00
$ 19,690.00

@50% | S 9,845.00

3. Towing Fee $ 150.00

Please confirm. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jerleen <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 May 2021 3:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please let me have your breakdown to derive at $9900
Thank you

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

f 8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #06-31

PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT S(415875)

T. 66619687 | F. 6661 9699 | W.huahong.com.sg




From: Jerleen <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 24 May 2021 10:23 AM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Hi Hsiao Tong
Any breakdown?
Thank you

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

f 8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #06-31

PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT S(415875)

T. 66619687 | F. 6661 9699 | W.huahong.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Saturday, 22 May 2021 2:30 PM

To: jerleen@huahong.com.sg

Subject: Re: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $9,900.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred

from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jerleen@huahong.com.sg <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 17 May 2021 11:51 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Hi Hsiao Tong
Any updates from III?
Thank you

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

f 8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #06-31

PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT S(415875)

T. 66619687 | F. 6661 9699 | W.huahong.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 29 April 2021 5:52 PM

To: jerleen@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Without Prejudice
Hi Jerleen,
As requested.

We will seek further instruction from Il and get back to you. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: jerleen@huahong.com.sg <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 April 2021 5:48 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Hsiao Tong, can forward me the police investigation results for record purpose
Btw, our landlines down. Anything u can call me @ 9729 8933 (9am to 6pm)

Thank you

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

f 8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #06-31

PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT S(415875)

T. 66619687 | F. 6661 9699 | W.huahong.com.sg

From: jerleen@huahong.com.sg <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 April 2021 5:32 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Hsiao Tong, any updates?

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 21 April 2021 10:56 AM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Without Prejudice
Hi Jerleen,
We are seeking mandate from our principal.

We will expedite the matter.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 19 April 2021 9:20 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)
Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong

Any updates? My boss chasing

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

f 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 66619688 | D. 6661 9694 | F. 6661 9699 |
W.huahong.com.sg

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 April 2021 6:03 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Hi Hsiao Tong
Any updates? My boss chasing

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department



HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 66619688 | D. 6661 9694 | F. 6661 9699 |
W.huahong.com.sg

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 April 2021 3:34 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Hi Hsiao Tong
Please see attached

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 66619688 | D. 6661 9694 | F. 6661 9699 |

W.huahong.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 March 2021 2:21 PM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Without Prejudice
Hi Jerleen,

Kindly let us have a copy of rental agreement. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 4:00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: LKK REF: CC4/11119020801/Qpa3 (GBE 1696 K)

Dear Hsiao Tong

| refer to the claim above. Please find attached our LOD
We looked forward to your favourable reply soon

Thank you

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 66619688 | D. 6661 9694 | F. 6661 9699 |

W.huahong.com.sg




