Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 February 2020 10:20 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc MT_Claim_5G; Admin A

Subject: RE: TP Claim for SLG1468Z against YPE618Z on 21/11/2019 Our Ref:

19/19/19/VCDD/022686 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Jia Le

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

# r. The all { ¥w ) lonpac.com.sg
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Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailtoJiale@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 9:40 AM

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com=

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP Claim for SLG1468Z against YP6618Z on 21/ 11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC00/022686 [External
General]

Lonpac Ref: 19/19/19/VC00/022686
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC190207%5/Kdadn2
Dear Sirs/Madam,

we refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 04/12/201% of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlemant with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.,

insured driver reversed and collided onto third party vehicle. Liability is not in our driver's favour,

summary o offer to third party repairer, “HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD" is as follows: -

Claimed Amounl Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,905.62 $ 1,924.00
2. Loss of Use (3days x $50.00) $ 150.00 % 150.00 (3days x $50.00]




3, LTA/ GIA Search Fee % 2.00 ] 2.00
Total | § 7.057.62 S 2,078.00

**D3days recommendation for repair

Relevant supperting claim decuments are atiached herewith for your perusal and reference,

The above is for your approval.

» Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeq, »

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email; Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 10:29 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: TP Claim for SLG1468Z against YP6618Z on 21/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC00/022686 [External
General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Jia Le

Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext, 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Yo

The all {¥&w ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: ONG LI LI

Sent: Tuesday, 7 January 2020 12:55 PM

To: 'lia Le [LKK Auto)’

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A

Subject: RE: TP Claim for SLG14682 against YP6618Z on 21/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC00/022686 [External
General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Jia Le

No, I have informed the driver to lodge report.
2



Will let you know again.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel_:iﬁS} 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax:

o

65) 6296 2706

The all (4% ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:liaLe@lkkauto.com|

Sent: Tuesday, 7 January 2020 12:52 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: TP Claim for SLG14682 against YP6618Z on 21/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC00/022686 [External
General]

Dear L1 Li,

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for
our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Wishing vou a Happiness and Prosperity New Year™

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(308933)

From: ONG LI LI [mallto:llong@lonpac.com|

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 4:41 PM

To: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: TP Claim for 5LG1468Z against YP6E1BZ on 21/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/ 19/19/VC00/022686 |External
General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Mei Kwan

Our Insured has not reported the accident yet.

Regards,
Ong Li Li



Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tf.-_l:_{ES) 250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax:

65) 6296 2706

The all { ¥ ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 11:56 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: TP Claim for SLG1468Z against YP6618Z on 21/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/ 19/VC00/022686 |External
General]

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 19/19/19/VC00/022686
LKK REF: CC4/LPC19020795/Kda3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SLG 1468Z
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
s TP estimated cost of repair
e Preliminary advice

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Our case handler in-charge is Jia Le and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank youw

Best Regards,

Med Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@]|kkauto.com | fux: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 S(408033)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November, 2019 12:04 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@l|kkauto.com=>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

<Jiale@|kkauto.com>
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HUI YANG MOTOR PTE. LTD.

Contact Add : SIN MING AUTOCARE BIk 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02 Singapore 575721
Tel: 64515752 (2 Lines) . Fax- 64514658
GST Reg No. 201629438M

Date: 02012019

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
Motor Claims Department
100 Beach Road

#19-00 Shaw Tower
Singapore 189702

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG14687 & ¥P66I8Z ON 2171172019
ALONG SHELL NEWTON/HOOPER ROAD

SETTLEMENT OF OUR CLAIM FOR SLG14687

Lump sum repair cost as recommended by surveyor ( TP08I2 ) § 1L926.00
03 Days Loss of Use (@ $50.00 per day 5 15000
TP Insurance Enguiry s 2.00
Total 5 207800
=—— 1

*The above claim applies only to vehicle damage and expressly exclude all persanal injuries
and other consequential loss.

Please let us have your reply soonest possible, thank vou.

Best Regards,

Marco Neo

HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD

DID: 64515752

Fax: 64514658

email: hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com



AUTHORIZATION LETTER

10 WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

I'We. Le Motor Car Rental Pte Ltd hereby declare and agree 1o use the address of Hui Yang

Motor Pte Lid, that is ut Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive, #04-02/09 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore

ST3721 ol my correspondences with anv pany in connection with my claim.

Ansing from an accident involving my motor vehicle registration number SLG 14682 and other

vehicles registration number Y P66 182 slong Shell Newton | Hooper Road on 217112019,

I'We, further grant authority to Messrs Hui Yang Motor Pte Litd or any of their
representatives 1o negotiate my/our claim on my/our hehalf and o execute, sign discharge
voucher / indemnity forms and all necessary documents in connection with and ansing of the

above accident ¢laim.

I'We wish to mform you that you could 1ssue the cheque payment in favour of my/our repairer

Messrs Hui Yang Motor Pte Lud.

Signature of registered owner and'or Company s stimp
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' LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 19/19/19/VC00/022686
DATE : 12 FEBRUARY 2020

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, LE MOTOR CAR RENTAL PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of YP 6618Z the sum of Singapore
Dollar Two Thousand Seventy Eight Only ($2,078.00) in full and final satisfaction,
liguidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, ansing either directly or indirectly from
an accident involving SLG 1468Z and YP 6618Z on 21 November 2019 along
SHELL NEWTON/HOOPER ROAD.

| /'We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ SURE CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD AND/OR HOSSAIN MD KAUSAR)
against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our
behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to HUI YANG
MOTOR PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

- l..-:i;.;-“"‘ﬂ E-.'Q?E:
RURUNL 7, SRR . | .-~

Signature of vehicle u*.;«rl‘.l;:rf.[.!ate

S fAoAor o ntas O Lol



HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD

Bill To: TAX INVOICE
Lonpac Insurance Bhd TP Claim Invoice No: TrPosiI2
Motor Claims Department Bill Dare:  02/01/2020
100 Beach Road

#19-00 Shaw Tower
Singapore 189702

Description Amount
Date of Accident - 21/11/2009
Chyner LE MOTOR CAR RENTAL PTE LTD
Vehicle No o NLGI4687
Make & Model - TOYOTA AXIO
Lump sum repair cost as recommended by survevor 5 1. 800,00

Sub-Toral -
Add 7% GST :

Total Amount SGD -

) 1.800.00
S 126.00
5 1,926.00

Reg No.:2016294 380\
GST No: 201 6204 38M

HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD

Authorised Signature

Hui Yang Motor Pte Lud

Sin Ming Awtocare Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive
W02 Singapore 575721

Email: hut_vang motori@hommail com

HIP: 98625891 Office: 64515752 Fax - 64514658




GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE rrone 656224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Our Ref No: GR-18-182237
Date of Request; 21111/2019 Your Ref No. Oriline Purchasa

Hul Yang Molor Pte Lid
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02

Sin Ming AutoCare
Singapore 575721

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 211172019

Enquiry By Bal Chew Shu Jing

TP Vehicle No. YP6618Z

Accident Date 212019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No, Insurer Peariod of Insurance Insurer Tel, Na.
YPEG18Z Lonpac Insurance Bhd 31/07/2018-28/06/2020 +B85 82507388
Thank You,

The images provided 1o you are laken from the onginal reparts forwarded o the centre by the members of the Genearal Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their sccuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
or in connection with the reports or their images

This is a compuler generated document and requires no signature.



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
|Nsmcs Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCLATION

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to S5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CO°' Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Rel Mo: GR-18-192237
Date of Request: 21/11/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Hul Yang Molor Pte Lid
178 Sin Ming Drive #04-02
Sin Ming AutoCare
Singapore 575721
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 21111/2019
Enqguiry By Bel Chew Shu Jing
TP Vehicla No, YP6618Z
Accident Date 211172018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount D.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You,

This is a computer generated documant and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[*¥] GIRD [ ] Cash [ ] Chegus




