Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 4:18 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Subramanian Kasi; Wu Tzu Ying

Subject: RE: SBS3420C D.O.A : 21/11/2019 AFTER PAINT PHOTOS & FINALISATION (hit &

run case claiming ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Hi Rasul
We accept your COR P/P $1,933.22 before GST with 3 working days of repair.

We will submit our LOD direct to ERGO.
Thank You

Best Regards
Lynn Ahmad (Ms)

Senior Executive, Claims

Office +65 6248 0987

Mobile +659199 0025

Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg
Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd

21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
Registration number 201419417K
www.towertransit.sg

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 9 December, 2019 3:51 PM

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Subject: RE: SBS3420C D.0O.A : 21/11/2019 AFTER PAINT PHOTOS & FINALISATION (hit & run case claiming ERGO

Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE - Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender/email.
If in doubt, please check with IT Support!

Hi Bazlin,

Refer to attachment
Finalised amount is $ 1,933.22 / 3 days of repair

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor



