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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 3:49 PM

To: ‘Tan Kah Leong'; 'assignments’

Cc: 'SUR!

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM190205601/WC2949L/TKL & YOUR REF: SKP86M (Pre-inspection)

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already private settled.
No survey was done for this case.,

we will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 11:55 AM

To: 'Tan Kah Leong'; assignments

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OQUR REF: SNM19D205601/WC2949L/TKL & YOUR REF: SKP86M (Pre-inspection)

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



View Sent Message

This mail is associated with :

*SKP86M (SNM190205501C02)
[WC2949L]
TP
GT DOLLAR PTE. LTD,
Nov 21 2019 3:00PM

Dynamic Autowork Pte, Ltd

Resend | _Vie\.;Fié_cipiiénts i Print Message] Delete Message | Forward l 7 - - -

From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 27/02/2020 15:50 PM.
To Kahl_eong.Tan@sg.r:ntaiping.com
Subject SKP86M

‘Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already private settled.

|No survey was done for this case,

{we will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
|Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY v - ]

Ll dd
| There are no documents,




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

1

i

Case Notified ‘ Est Submitted I Adj Asiigned ‘ .Ad_]. Rpt I Adj Sil;bmitled‘ ) Ins Auth'ed Statgi ) - ‘
‘ [ |

|22 Nov 2019 | | 25 Nov 2019 :
. | 11:47 | New Assignment
Main 1 [ : ‘ 1 | cancel Case |
| | Assign I | |

Reference Claim Details Documents

_Show e |

} [Cre-a{;;!_l;;i-;surer]

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

| Insured:
| MainClaimant:  GT DOLLARPTE.LTD., Co.Reg. No.: 201422822K
| | Vehicle Reg. No.: SKP86M - Date of Loss: B |21/11/2019 15:00 - :59
Claim Type: TP / SNM 1902%@&902 Policy_/Cover Note No.: | DMCVSN17522319022
| Vehicle Reg. No. (Insured):  WC2949L Policy No. ' |DMPCSN3077101900
| - |Excesst __Js_sz,ooo.on o 1
Dynamic Autowork Pte. Ltd (HQ) 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #08-09 Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 415875 Kaki Bukit -
Tel | 8
" China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111 ... [Handled by Tan Kah Leong - ||
63896193]

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Final Rpt due 04/12/2019]

| | ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED ‘View All | Compose Case Mail

| i“T-héFe_a.ré no mailr for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS view All I Search Tasks J Create New Task Complete ] 1

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
|| No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/clairns/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 25/11/2019




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 11:40 AM

To: Dynamic Autowork; assignments

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D205601/WC2949L/TKL & YOUR REF: SKP86M (Pre-inspection)
Attachments: 22112019171252.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Michelle,

We refer to your email dated 25.11.2019.

We will be assigning M/s LKK Auto Consultants to survey your client’s vehicle on a without prejudice basis.
Aside to LKK,

Please refer to the email below & proceed to survey the third party vehicle.

Thank you.
Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6193 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Dynamic Autowork [mailto:dynamicautowork@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, November 25, 2019 11:29 AM

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM19D205601/WC2949L/TKL & YOUR REF: SKP86M (Pre-inspection)

Dear Kah Leong,
Thanks for reply.

Please arrange ADRIAN LING to survey the above vehicle.
Please advise liability after your client lodge the GIA report.

Thank You.

Yours Sincerely,



Michelle
HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 6341 6778

On Mon, Nov 25, 2019 at 11:22 AM Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaipine.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Michelle,

We refer to your email below.

Please see attached and let us know if you agree with SJE.

Thank you.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 6389 6193 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.



From: Claims Dept of CTI
Sent: Monday, November 25, 2019 10:45 AM
To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; dynamicautowork@gmail.com

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D205601/WC2949L/TKL & YOUR REF: SKP86M (Pre-inspection)

Dear Kah Leong,

Please conduct PRS-SKP86M soonest possible. (Our Insured has not filed SAS Report)

File with officer-in-charge —Tan Kah Leong-DID: 6389 6193.

Regards

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Tel:: (65) 63896116 - F: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: & F¥## Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Dynamic Autowork [mailto:dynamicautowork@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, November 22, 2019 5:24 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTl; Chong Boon Sen; Ong Chin Kiat
Subject: SKP86M (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : WC2949L



Dear person in charge,

‘Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection.

Hope we can do Direct Settle and please provide the surveyor firm or surveyor name list to conduct the joint pre-repair
survey as a single joint expert

** PLEASE ADVISE LIABILITY **

Thank You.
Yours Sincerely,

Michelle

HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 6341 6778
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