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Denise Tay (.LKKAuto)

= —.
From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2019 4:53 PM
To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; assignments; SUR
Cc: Henry, Irene James; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; Autoexcel Engineering
Subject: RE: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR WC 9901C  Our ref : CMTD1905472/AGC
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED OF WC 9901C.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle WC 9901C
Number of days (estimated) : 3 days

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 11:05 AM

To: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>;
Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR WC 9901C Our ref : CMTD1905472/AGC

Dear LKK Auto,

Please make the arrangement to survey for WC9901C on a without prejudice basis and revert with your preliminary
report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Agnes.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Melvin Ye

Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG
1



F L7 -

- ww e Consultants
Sedl BA B Ple Lid

51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD1905472/AGC
Date:27/11/2019

Qur Ref: CS/SMO19020768/Ktf3

The Motor Claims Department
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE P

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, WC 9901C

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above-mentioned vehicle
on _26/11/2019 at the premises of M/s AE Auto __and have the following to
report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$§ 2941625

Revised Estimate Amount :S$  4.280.00

“Check™ Items Amount : S 0.00

Market Value : S§

LTA Reimbursement Value : S§ -

Nett Value : S§ -
Description of Damage: ——

The vehicle sustained damages

.
at the rear portion. e !@ front

Repair days: 3 b

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Kenneth
Automotive Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 11:05 AM

To: assignments; sur@lkkauto.com

(ar - Henry, Irene James; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; Autoexcel Engineering
Subject: RE: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR WC 9901C  Our ref : CMTD1905472/AGC

Dear LKK Auto,

Please make the arrangement to survey for WC9901C on a without prejudice basis and revert with your preliminary
report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Agnes.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Melvin Ye

Claims Division
D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

, SOMPO
@ sl . A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

£ Download on the B, GETITON

@ App Store d I'® Google Play

Download now @ o
'For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | ? For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail. including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcel @singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 November, 2019 10:54 AM

To: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR WC 9901C Our ref : CMTD1905472/AGC

Dear Sirs,



We wish to appoint LKK Auto Consultants - Kenneth Kong

Thank you

Best Regards
Ryan Soh
93825367

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, November 25, 2019 10:48 AM

To: Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR WC 9901C Our ref : CMTD1905472/AGC

Our Reference : CMTD1905472/AGC
Your Reference: WC9901C

Without Prejudice
Date: 25/11/2019

Attention:
AUTOEXCEL ENGINEERING
Dear Ryan,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING W(C9901C & YN4277Y ON 22.11.2019

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 25/11/2019.
Please be informed that Ms Agnes Chan is the handler of this case.

We regret to inform that we are unable to revert on liability for direct settlement as we have yet to receive our
insured’s accident report.

Kindly advise should you still require us to conduct survey on a “Without Prejudice” basis.

If you are agreeable to conduct survey on a “Without Prejudice” basis, we propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng




Kenneth Kong (North

2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)

3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffery Ong

4 | In House surveyor Teo See Ling

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Melvin Ye

Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www_facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG
P GETITON

Downlcad on the
>
Download now @ ' App Store l GOOQ'E Play

LFor Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance 1 ¢ For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments. is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 25 November, 2019 9:26 AM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR WC 9901C

Importance: High

Dear Officer,



‘Ple’ase help us arrange for pre repair survey.
Our vehicle - WC 9901C

Accident date —22/11/2019

Your insure — YN 4277Y

Location — AE AUTO PTE LTD

160 SIN MING DRIVE # 06-01
SIN MING AUTOCITY (S) 575722

Please also let us have the list of surveyor to appoint.

Thank you

Regards
Ryan Soh
93825367
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AE AUTO PTE LTD /ij?
A2 1.,

singapore 575722
el: 545135654, 54591630

Fax: 64591598
Sty
Date : 25/11/2019 QUOTATION -THIRD PARTY CLAIM
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
Attn; Motor Claim Department . Officer In Charge Claim : Third Party Claim
Veh. No : WC 9901 C
Accident on : 22/11/2019 Model ISUZU CYH52S
Insured Ins: CHINA TAIPING
QTY PARTICULARS AMOUNT [SURVEYOR
Your Insurer Vehicle No : YN 4277 Y
LIST PARTS
1|TAILLAMP RH $J. 58000 X
2| TAILLAMP SOCKET RH $ /.4 40000 ¢
1|REAR No.PLATE HOLDER $ 7 180.00| ¢
1|REAR No.PLATE LAMP $ /~ 38500 «
TOTAL PARTS: | § 1,545.00
LESS 15% $ 1,806.25
SPECIAL NETT
1|TAILAMP BRACKET $ 11 40000 X
1|REAR No.PLATE $ /e 5000] x
1|REAR GLUTTER GEAR & LEVER $ N 2850.00] «
1|RERA GLUTTER $A 220000 x
1|HYDRAULIC FLUID $ o~ 20000| <
1|REAR WHEELTOP ARCH ASSY RH $7C 480000 g«
1|REAR WHEELTOP ARCH MUDFLAP RH $ 7. 48000 A
1|REAR SAFETY BAR & |$ 550000 v ZSces~
2|REAR SAFETY BAR BRACKETS $ 4T 900.00| x
2|REAR SAFETY BAR BRACKET SUPPORTS $ ~ 220000 x
1|REAR LH TRAY  |s 185000 — J70F/~
1|REAR LH TRAY BRACKET vt $ 480.00 | —
TOTAL S/INETT $ 21,910.00
TOTALPARTS: |$ 23,716.25

Page 1




AE AUTO PTE LTD

<. '60,5in Ming Drive

InMing Auto Clity #06-01
Singapore 575722

Balance bif $ 23,716.25
LABOUR CHARGES FOR REAR
Labour charges dismantle whole rear damage area $ 2,000.00 ?W(
to do cutting welding on damage area
To do rear body chassis repair $ ¥ 800.00 X
To do spray painting on rear accident area $ 2,000.00 | Seef
To do anti rust, tuff coating . AR TS 20000 X
Checking on wiring system, for rear Mg § 200.00 %
To replace hydraulic parts & refill fluid assy e | § 500.00 X
LABOUR CHARGES $ 5,700.00
Grand Total Parts & Labour : $ 29,416.25
1043% 1%

Page 2




2211112019 PARFICOE Rebate Enquiry

. > Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 062D
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: WC9901C
Vehicle ta be Exported: Yes

Intended Deregistration Date: 22 Nov 2019
Vehicle Make: 1SUZU

Vehicle Model: CYH525
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No.: 6WG1426571
Chassis No.: JALCYHS525F7000216
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $115,744.00
Original Registration Date: 01Mar 2016
First Registration Date: 01 Mar 2016
Transfer Count: 0

Actual AKF Paid: $5,788.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

l'lﬂﬂl'l."?:fl-!l?h.- n-_

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 28 Feb 2026
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $45,036.00
COE Rebate Amount: $28,227.00
Total Rebate Amount: $28,227.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Nov 2019

OK

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/ltalvri/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F0304009TT



MVA218154770 / VAC - Sin Ming
“ENTRY DATE & TIME: 23/11/2018 12:43
< SUBMITTED BY: CHRISTINA ONG Mui Lan

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Pleasa repart corractly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as p

ible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withalding of material facts may allow insurance companies 1o

repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance comp.

Is not an admission of pelicy liability on the part of the insurance companies

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records M

it Centre lished by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for

archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available nrpnn application by interested parties
7 By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to coples of the report being made available

aforesaid.

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss
Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
LU ey INU

Email Address

Mabile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Palicy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

contact Number

EMail Address

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

23/11/2019 12:43
22/11/2019 14:30
ALONG HOLLAND ROAD
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE e

WCs801C

DYNAMIC CONSTRN ENGRG P L
£U13£1UnLy
ANDY.LEE@POS.SG

(LOCAL) +65-86523334
OFFICE-92366363

Isuzu
CYH 528

WORK PURPOSE

NO

THIRD PARTY
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

YES

B29130771MKF (COMP)

MAHALINGAM MURUGESAN
F7904257U

10/02/1974

OUTDOOR

03/03/2014

5 YEARS AND 8 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-86523334

OTHERS-86523334
NOEMAIL

Page 10f 16



- Address 1, SUNVIEW ROAD #06-32
Postcode 627615
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions RAINING
Road Surface WET

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

vvas any oner malenal or property gamagea YES

| have been approached by un_'lknuwn _parson(s) NO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 2

Passenger 1 NAME: : KUMAR

GENDER: : MALE
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO STATEMENT ATTACHED.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number YN427TY

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour ISUZU LORRY

Details Of Properties .
Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Name of Driver TANG ZHIJUN
NRIC/Passport Number G2682824X

Contact Number 65701880

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 16



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

PORT, C

1. Plawsz roport gorractiy the datalle of the accident to spead up the clalmg pnmuss.

Haalal

3. Wﬂmmhnprmcdmmbeumﬂulml_-mmmmnwwmu sraprasalitation or withbolding of
facts may alfow Insurance companles to repudiata pelley flablifty, y :
% Thelssue and occeptanca of this Form by companies ls not an sdmission of policy liabiliity on the part of the Insurance

6 Thempmwﬂlhehrmrdndbvlhamfmamnﬁmnmmmmmtmwum lished by the General Inurance
Astoclation ofﬂnmm (elA) ﬁmtthu Ind Hut mplu ul'thll rnporl wII I'nn l‘u bat mﬁ nnllllin upan application by
Wﬂl’h > a .

7. Ivthnbtlwlmdmkmttnthabmyuuhuub\rmummm;oﬂh&lnpmnthumlrnndtumplunt

the report belng mada avallabla sfareseld,

B Fanemot slae the Bavemmal fabe feobemton n»fnm-n

1understand, acknowledge, agree and cansent that: v S SR

{a) My Insurer, my warkshap mu-mmmmmumnrmrsmmmmmumw;
mmmmmmmhmawmm,mmmmmummm
pmlh:llwmwwmdhwmmmwkww!mwrmdﬁdmmdwm
MMM!HHMMMMMMMMWMMW*IWMM'
vahicla(s) Involved In this sccldent shall bo collectively referred (o bs the *Instiran?”), (he Instrers” Tawyars/law firms, the
Mandewmmmmmmmnumhummmmm

of!

(U] pmmhm-nmrhwmhmm h:hﬂiuﬂ-ntthuutaltlwdﬂmmdmrnmun
investigations relating to the cialms; i s

() Tewestigating the accident and/or my elalms; 1 ; i

(1) carvying out and/or dealing with my Instnicsions or fing to any enquiries by ine;

{Iv) administecing my clalms Endwdhlmam‘ofmﬂmu.mmmu, Inuolees, reports or notleos to me,
which could Involve disclosure of certain personal data lhoutmwbrlh.abnumnlmvd the seine as well as on the

eaternal cover of envelopes/mell peckages); andfor
{v) complying with applicabla law in administering, mﬂu handling snd/ar duill g with my clalms.{collactlvely the
“Putpases”]
()  allinsurer{s) who have i i vehicla(s} invalved in this sccident o..d the | s Imviyers/law llrms, may/ara permitted

tocallect, use, disslose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of tha abdve Purposes; and

{c) myPesonal Information may/can be disclased by any of th Insurers and/or GIA to thelr third porty service providers or
agents{including thelr lawyers/low firms), which mbndminum of Singapara, fo* one ar mare of the ubove Purposes.

{d] my Personal Information wiil also be coflected and used ta complie clalms hmory for tae purpose of fraud detectian,
Investigation ond monogement Inprmntwd all futura clalms, © © - )
(s} thelnfurmation so collectad under (d] above may huhmu‘ / disclosed:

() to all Insurers and/or any other third parties that wssistin wﬂuwm. lmlﬂuatlnu. cantroliing or managing fraud,
ragulators, law enforcament and government sgeneles as y required for *he f stated, or

(i} for complying with requiremaents under wreguhum laws or court orders,

Policyhalder’s Signature = Driver's Signature Reporthg Centrs Pamonnal’s Signature
Date & Thme: (11 drivar [s not the potieyholder) Nam:
Onta & Time: NRIC/Fii Nou:
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Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1
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[ H

Wby Jo s
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Polieyhokder's Sigratun Repor!Ing Centra Permantiel's Signature
Date & Time: Name: .
MRIC/ IN No.:
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/SM019020768/Ktf3e2

[N

50 RAFFLES PLACE

#05-01/06 Date: 18-12-2019
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YN 4277Y Veh. Inspected WC 9901C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1905472/AGC Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MELVIN YE YONG KANG Assign Date 25/11/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model ISUZU CYH52S c.c 15681
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JALCYH52SF7000216 Colour WHITE
Odometer 125154 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[295/80 R22.5 (D) HILO 212 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[295/80 R22.5 (D) HILO 22 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[295/80 R22.5 (D) WEST LAKE 3/3 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[295/80 R22.5 (D) WEST LAKE 3/3 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
o General Information
Accident Date  22/11/2019 Ilnspection Date 26/11/2019
Survey held at AEAUTO PTELTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #06-01
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. WC 9901C
' Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition W'orksh'ép-(sy)') et '(S‘;
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1| TAILLAMP RH SERVICEABLE 580.00
2| TAILLAMP SOCKET RH SERVICEABLE 400.00 -
1|REAR NO. PLATE HOLDER TO REPAIR SEE 180.00
LABOUR
1|REAR NO. PLATE LAMP SERVICEABLE 385.00
LESS 15% DISCOUNT -231.75
1,313.25 -
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|TAILLAMP BRACKET (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 400.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR NO. PLATE (SN) SERVICEABLE 50.00 -
1|REAR GLUTTER GEAR & LEVER (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 2,850.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR GLUTTER (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 2,200.00 -
LABOUR
1|HYDRAULIC FLUID (SN) NOT NECESSARY 200.00 .
1|REAR WHEELTOP ARCH ASSY RH (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 4,800.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR WHEELTOP ARCH MUDFLAP RH (SN) SERVICEABLE 480.00 -
1|REAR SAFETY BAR (SN) BENT 5,500.00 1,500.00
2|REAR SAFETY BAR BRACKETS (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 900.00 -
LABOUR
2|REAR SAFETY BAR BRACKET SUPPORTS (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 2,200.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR LH TRAY (SN) BENT 1,850.00 1,100.00
1|REAR LH TRAY BRACKET (SN) DISTORTED 480.00 480.00
21,910.00 3,080.00
LABOUR
TO DO REAR BODY CHASSIS REPAIR. NOT NECESSARY 800.00 -
TO DO SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR ACCIDENT AREA, 2,000.00 500.00
TO DO ANTI RUST, TUFF COATING. NOT NECESSARY 200.00 =
CHECKING ON WIRING SYSTEM, FOR REAR. NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/SMO19020768/Ktf3e2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
e Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition phiras
ay Bt Workshop (5)| ___(5)
TO REPLACE HYDRAULIC PARTS & REFILL FLUID ASSY. |[NOT NECESSARY 500.00 =
LABOUR CHARGES DISMANTLE WHOLE REAR DAMAGE 2,000.00 700.00
AREA TO DO CUTTING WELDING ON DAMAGE AREA.
INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR NO. PLATE
HOLDER, TAILLAMP BRACKET, REAR GLUTTER GEAR &
LEVER, REAR GLUTTER, REAR WHEELTOP ARCH ASSY
RH, REAR SAFETY BAR BRACKETS AND REAR SAFETY
BAR BRACKET SUPPORTS.
5,700.00 1,200.00
GRAND TOTAL 28,923.25 4,280.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,400.00

(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SM0O18020768/Ktf3e2

Az

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




