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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAute) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sert: Friday, 22 November 2019 4:28 PM

To: ‘Ben Tang'; assignments

Ce: ‘Claims Dept of CT1'; SUR; 'Chee So Chow!'

Subject: RE- OUR REF: SNM19D205514-YNT623L-BEN - Accident Involving YQ14908 with
¥YN7623L on 07/11/2018

Deusr Ben,

Please be informed that according to the repairer TP owner had private settle,
We will close this file without billing.

No survey was done for this vehicle.

Hest Regards

G.INIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@ikkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Bl 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{ao8g33)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981 @gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 3:17 PM

To: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg-cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow, chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin-D

<admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM19D205514-YN7623L-BEN - Accident Irivolving YQ 14908 with YN7623L on 07/11/2019

H: Ben Tang,

Please be informed that we will withdraw this claim because third party need private settlement with us.

*+ KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 1§ (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE
618892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You
Rogards

Pei Jin

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapare 638892

(Level 3 _Office)

(Level 5§ Workshop)



Nivitha (LKK Autu!

From; Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cotaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 11:12 AM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: FW. OUR REF: SNM19D205514-YN7623L-BEN - Accident Involving YQ14908 with
YN7623L an 07/11/2019

Dear Sirs

We refer to above matter.
Please assist to arrange for PRS survey of TP vehicle YQ 1490B.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Ben Tang
Ex=cutive

Clgims Department

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 078809
DI (65) 63896175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www sa.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook com/chinstaipinasa/ | WeChat: A3 Taiping SG

Orgadgirmsr; This gl and sny fies transrmilted with [ is irfanded orly for the hamed recipianis and may contain confidantial infoimstion, Any
urautharzed disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intendad reciplant, plaage
notify the sender immedistely. Flease defele the e-mal and any copies of § theraafter.

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinshengl981@gmail.com=>

Sent: Thursday, November 21, 2019 4:55 PM

To: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang(@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow

<sochow.chee(@sg. cntaiping.com=>

Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM19D205514-YN7623L-BEN - Accident Involving YQI490B with YN7623L
on 07/11/2019

Hi Ben Tang,

We are selected Mr. Adrian Ling.

“* KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You
Rezards

Pei Jin



Sin Sheng Enginecring Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9595

Fuax: 6863 6477

On Wed, 20 Nov 2019 at 17:09, Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@ise cataiping com> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Cear Sirs

We refer to your email of 20.11,19,

Ve would like to conduct pre-repair survey of the vehicle at the appointed workshop.

Ve propose the following list of surveyors to be nominated as the Single Joint Expert to conduct survey of the
ciaimant’s vehicle:-

1. ADRIAN LING 6. KENNETH KONG
2. Kelvin Ang 7. SIMON HO

3. SEE CHEW SENG 8. CHUA WEIIE

4. MOHD FADHILAH BIN OSMAN 9, MARCUS CHUA
5. XING QUO QIANG 10. HENRY NG

If we do not hear from you within two days of this letter, you shall have deemed to have agreed that the surveyor
appointed by us shall be Single Joint Expert for this matter.

As per the NIMA Protocol, the survey by our appointed surveyor would include survey of your vehicle pre-repair,
after it is dismantled, and post repairs. Hence, you need to provide us / our surveyors with the list of items that were
damaged and required to be replaced or repaired to facilitate an effective survey.

Without admission of liability, please provide our surveyor with repairestimates to facilitate direct settlement.

As stated above, please inform us and our surveyor after the claimant’s vehicle had been repaired so that our
surveyor can carry out post repair inspection before the vehicle is returned to your client. Please co-ordinate with
our surveyor immediately after the repair is completed.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang

Executive



Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
2 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 6389 6176 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www sg cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsal | WeChat: X ¥kl Taiping SG

Cisglaimar, This e-madl and any fies transmitted with 1 i intended only for the named recipents and may contain confidentie! information, Aty
uaulhorzed disclosure, use or dissemination of this message. either in whole or partial i prohibited, If you are not the intended recipien!, please
nalify the sender imirediately. Fleste delels the e-mail ard any copes of it themsafar,

From: Claims Dept of CTI
Sent: Wednesday, November 20, 2019 5:00 PM

To: Ben Tang {mw Chee So Chow _cntaiping.com>
sinsheng 198 co '

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D205514-YN7623L-BEN - Accident Involving YQ1490B with YN7623L on
07/11/2019

Cwear Ben,

Please conduct PRS for YQ14908,

Note : officer in charge- Ben Tang 63896175,

R=gards,

Claims Department



China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908

T°(65) 63896116 | F; (65) 62247175

W: www sg cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.comichinataipingsg! | WeChat: AT M¥f Taiping SG

Dusciaimer: This o-mail ahd any fes transimitted with il is intended only for the named reciprents and may cantain confidential informaton. Amy
urduthanieed disclosare, use or dissemination of this message, either in whols or pirtial, is prohibited If yau are nol the imtended recpent, pease
Helify thie sendar intnedisiely, Plrase delife the emall and any copas of 1 thereafter

From: sinsheng enginecringservices [mailto:sinsheng198 1 @gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 20 November, 2019 12:28 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdepti@sg.entaiping com>

Subject: Accident Involving YQ1490B with YN7623L on 07/11/2019

Dear Officer In chargs,

We are repairer of motor vehicle YQ1480B. Enclosed Accident Statement and LTA search fee for your attention please.
Kindly assist to arrange for the Pre-Repair Inspection to be conducted within two {2) workings days upon received this
email,

Kindly let us have your list of 10 nominated surveyors to conduct the Single-Joint Inspection.

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE

638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You
Regards

Pei Jin

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapare 638892

{Level 3_Office)

(Level 5 Workshap)

Tel: 6863 9595
Fax: 6863 6477
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