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Ms @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cofeg Mo 1950000060 G57 Reg ko HZ-0001676-9
5 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax: [65) 6222 3547

Clatrs & Molor Underwritieg Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 Clty House Singapore OBBETY
Tel (65) 6507 3846 Fax: [65) 6507 3844
wiww msfirstcapitaloom,sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location

Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

20-11-2019 Qur Ref No. D19007370MFSH
19-11-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC0861X Third Party Vehicle. PC7468H

50 BUKIT BATOK STREET 23 #01-06 MILDVIEW BUILDING
MA

63161131/ 0 Fax No. 63167050

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA, Fax No. 68416315
NA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cec : Workshop

Cc: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

WOON MENG MOTOR Abciian il
PTELTD )
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

A Membe




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2019 3:42 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: ‘Merina Chia’; SUR

Subject: RE- SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007370MFSH/1-PC 7468H
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle PC 7468H on 2/12/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 12:34 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007370MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: Besh-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 12:17 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM




Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@mosfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007370MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVE This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WWW.AVE.COMm



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg=
Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 4:55 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR; Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: Estimate of PC7468H

Dear Veron,

We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Kindly be informed that we confirm acceptance of Finalize amount $2501.90.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (655578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

Erom: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 3:24 PM

To: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: Estimate of PC7468H

Dear Ms Heng,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Finalize amount $2501.90 @ 3 working days.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng(@singnet.coim.sg>

sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 3:19 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto)
<Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Estimate of PC7468H

15

Best Regards,
Heng Sew Sow (Ms)
Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd



Tel: 6316 1131/51
Fax: 6316 7050

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 3:18 PM

To: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Estimate of PC7468H

Dear Ms Heng,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

70 km (SN)-$10

Finalize amount $2496.90 @ 3 working days.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 11:52 AM

To: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg=; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Estimate of PC7468H

Dear Ms Heng,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Finalize amount $2486.90 @ 3 working days.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

-----Original Message-----

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, 4 January 2020 4:58 PM

To: Rasul [LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Estimate of PC7468H

Dear Rasul



Attached.

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

‘ehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
WVehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE PeriodiYearsh:

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 06 Jan 2020

Limited Liability Partnership

183)

PC7468H
Mo
06 Jan 2020

MERCEDES BENZ

V220 CDI EXTRA-LONG AT

Black

2018
45195034831970
WDF44781523521035
$51,3%0.00

10 Dec 2018

10 Dec 2018

o

£2,570.00

Mo

$0.00

0% Dec 2028

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$27.509.00
£24,551.00

$24,551.00



Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

Office - 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-08 Midview Building, Singapore 65857 .
Workshop: 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-06 Midview Building, Singapere 65351
Tal: 8316 1131 HP: 9730 2017 Fax: 8316 T050
42, Sungei Kadut Ave, Singapore T29666 Tel : 63268523
{ Email Adress : woonmeng @singnat.com.sg )
Co Reg No. 2005036TEM GST Reg No. 20-08036T8M
Estimate
To : MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
Motor Claims Dept
Dear Sirs : Fax
RE : EST COST FOR MERCEDES BEN 0CDI - PC74
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC7468H & SHC861X ON 19/11/2019
ITEMS DESCRIPTION QTty
1 Rear bumper do ~ 1pe
2 Rear bumper bracket ns As~ < 1pc
3 Rear bumper reflector n/s . N¥ 1pc
4 220 Ase ipc
5 Emblem A~ = 1pc
6  TOKM (SH) Nnéc 1pe
Labo harge & Misc
To remove, repair, replace & install front 1
damaged parts. }

To R & R sensor wiring.
To putty & spray painting.

Total

All prices quoted are subjected to 7% GST

This is a computer generated document. Mo signature is required.

TP CLAIM

Date 01 Dec 2019

: 6507 3849
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PRICE
$ 150343/
$ 69.04
$ 27.21
$ 79.51
$ 155.69 |
$  1,834.88
$ 15.00
$
$ a/u(uﬁ £o
$
$ 3,029.88




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6266 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref . CS/FCI19020721/R1vd3n2

Date : 10-01-2020

[T

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC BB1X Veh. Inspected PC 7468H
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19007370MFSH Excess () 0.00
Assign From  MERINA CHIA Assign Date 22/11/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ V220 c.C 2143
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WDF44781523521035 Colour BLACK
Odometer 89285 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 ZR18 KUMHO & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45 ZR18 KUMHO & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45ZR18 KUMHO 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45ZR18 KUMHO 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/11/2019 [Inspection Date 02/12/2019
Survey held at 188 PANDAN LOOP
Repairer WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANGCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




o aas

VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-8607198-R Fage No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PC 7468H
timate By | Our Adjusted
Condition Es
Qty Description of Parts Workshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1,503.43 1,503.43
1|REAR BUMPER BERACKET N/S MECESSARY 69.04 69,04
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR N/S NOT NECESSARY 27.21 -
1|W220 NECESSARY 79.51 79.51
1|EMBLEM MECESSARY 155.69 155.69
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -180.77
1,834 88 1.626.90
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|70KM (SN) NECESSARY 15.00 15.00
15.00 15.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE REPAIR,REPLACE & INSTALL FRONT 400.00 300.00
DAMAGED PARTS.
TO R&R SENSOR WIRING. 80.00 B0.00
TOPUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 700,00 500.00
1,180.00 860.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,029.88 2,501.890
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I [ [ 2,501.90|

U

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119020721/R1vd3n2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Reped is mada solaly for the wse and benaflt of the Cllent named on the front page of this Roport.




