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£] URI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFORE 408933 TEL : (B65) 62563561 FAX 1 (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19007398MFSH Date: 25/11/2019
Our Ref: CS/FCI19020711/R1td3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _GBG 3440H

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
22/11/2019 at the premises of M/s Sin Sheng have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$ 4.133.30

Revised Estimate Amount : §% 2.361.38

“Check” Ttems Amount 1 5% 0.00

Market Value : S§% s

LTA Reimbursement Value 8%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage: rar ot
The vehicle sustained damages at the

o/s portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully

Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited ofeg Mo 1950001060 G5 Reg ko M7 00016759
& Ralfles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Faw [65) G222 3547

(laims & Mator Undeneriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #LE-01 City House Singapare 06BETT
Tel: (55) 6507 3848 Fax: (55) 6507 3645
whwl. msfirstcapital.comosg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

21-11-2018 Our Ref No. D19007398MFSH
18-09-2018 Claim Type, Third Party
SHDAsE1D Third Party Vehicle. GBG3440H

MO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 3)
PEI JIN

6863 9595/ 0 Fax No. GBG3 6477

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416215
WA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc: TP Saolicitor

Officer Incharge

SIN SHENG

ENGINEERING Attention. NIL
SERVICES

NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Denise Tal'. (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 2:17 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims’, assignments
Cc: '‘Merina Chia'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007398MFSH/
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED OF GBG 3440H.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBG 3440H
Number of days (estimated) : 4 days

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 12:33 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007398MFSH/1

Dear 5ir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz2-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS5 Motor Claims (mailto:cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com Se]

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 12:15 PM

To: ESIGNMENTS@LKKAUTD.CGM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007398MFSH/1




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981 @gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 3 January 2020 6:24 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Accident Involving GBG3440H & SHD8561D on 18/09/2019
Hi Mr. Rasul,

We are agreed your offer.

*# KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED ATNO & TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE 638892 WITH IMMEDIATE
EFFECT **

Thank You

Regards

Pei Jin

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singopore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9595
Faox: 6863 6477

On Fri, 3 Jan 2020 at 11:04, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Pei lin,

Refer to attachment

Finalised amount is $ 1,900 / 4 days lump sum

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owiner |0:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

‘ehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
“ehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output;
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Nov 201%

Company
196N

GBG3440H
Yes

31 Dec 2019
TOYOTA

' HIACE DX 3.0 AUTO

Silver

2017
1KD2708571
KOH2010222278

£33981.00
24 Jul 2017
24 Jul 2017
0
$1,700.00

Mo

£0.00

23 Jul 2027

C - Goods Yehicle & Bus

10

$32,682.00
$2471300
$24,713.00



SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

NO 8, TUAS AVE 18,

(Level 3), SINGAPORE 638892

Tel No. : 6863-9595 Fax No. : 6B63-6477
E-Mall : sinsheng1281@gmail.com

Buss. Reg. No. : 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD Estimate
59 SENOKO ROAD
SINGAPORE 758123 Date :
Vehicle Num.
Make/Model :

Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng? -

Contact ; 6861 0007 Fax No. : 6753 7780 Accident Date :
Claim No. :

Reference

Policy No. :

§/N  Quantity  Particular (W

: ESO03006

22111/2019

: GBG3440H

TOYOTA KDH 201
KDH 201-0222278
18/09/2019

D19007398MFSH

: SHDB561D

29131844

Unit Price Amount 55

LIST ITEMS : b / UL
1. SIDE PANEL, RH Qrotrodb 1,748.50
2. 1 SLIDING DOOR rrsz-'i’ H‘P 1,895.90
List Totalss : ({ ﬁfﬂ.y) 3,644.40
25.00% Discount S5 : 911.10
L{g 2,733.30
LABOUR : 13—’“ A €l¥s S0

TO PAMNEL BEAT AND REPAIR RICHT SIDE BODY

% 65000

TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED PARTS (RCL 4 [~
L] '-.- '|VF
TO SPRAY PAINTING j B Sovo ?pafu/ﬂ’

TO APPLY TUFF KOTE
LOSS OF USE : 5 DAYS @ 55120/DAY

Labour Total 55 :

A

SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

Total 55 : 4133.30



SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

NO 8, TUAS AVE 18,

{Level 3), SINGAPORE 638892

Tel No. : 6863-9595 Fax No, : 6863-6477
E-Mall : sinsheng1981 @gmail.com

Buss. Req. No. : 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD Estimate : ES003006
59 SENOKO ROAD
SINGAPORE 758123 Date : 22/11/201%

vehlcle Num. : GBG3440H
Make/Model : TOYOTA KDH 201
Chassis/Eng# : KDH 201-0222278
contact : 6861 0007 Fax No. : 6753 7780 Accident Date : 18/09/2019
Claim No. : D19007398MFEH
rReference : SHDB5E1D
Policy No. : 29131844

Attention : Motor Claim Department

S Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 55
LIST ITEMS L{ 7 Aol Ut 4
1.1 SIDE PANEL, RH qeo1rby 174850 't S0
2. 1 SLIDING DOOR fgpi’V’ ('FP 1,895.90% . ¢
..... m——— L LY
List Totalss : (f oﬁoty) 3.644.40 |2,
25.00% Discount 55 : 91110 __—
L{S 2,733.30
. 22 ufd CLES coo
LABOUR :
7O PANEL BEAT AND REPAIR RIGHT SIDE BODY Y 6000
TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED PARTS (gﬂ*-‘:) afler | o<V
' g
TO SPRAY PAINTING s Soo ?paﬁ
TO APPLY TUFF KOTE m_m%
LOSS OF USE : 5 DAYS @ S$120/DAY
Labour Total §5 : 1,400.00
Total 55 : 4,133.30

o - F'E & F = 8 3 & & B

! ﬁ]l 21
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SIN SHENG ﬁ((GLNEER'lNG SERVICES 17
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI12020711/R1td3n2
#1601 CITy HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Dewe: “10M-20e “W"]MII"”H l" m
Code: FCI2
15 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  SHD B561D Veh, Inspected GBG 3440H
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. D18007398MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MERINA CHIA Assign Date 22/11/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE DX 3.0 (A) c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. KDH2010222278 Colour RED
Odometer 82261 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195 R15C AUSTOMNE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15C AUSTOME & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195 R15C AUSTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195 R15C AUSTONE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/09/2019 |inspection Date 22/11/2019
Survey held at SIM SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES
3 TECH PARK CRESCENT TUAS TECK PARK SINGAPORE 638129
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page MNo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBG 3440H
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|SIDE PANEL,RH BENT 1,748.50 1,748.50
1|SLIDING DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 1,885.90 -
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 911,10 -437.13
2,733.30 1311.37
LABOUR
TO PANEL BEAT AND REPAIR RIGHT SIDE BODY.TO 650.00 500.00
DISMANTLE/REPLACE ABOVEMENTIONED
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF SLIDING DOOR.
TO SPRAY PAINTING. 700.00 500,00
TO APPLY TUFF KOTE, 50.00 50.00
1,400.00 1,050.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,133.30 2,361.37
'RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) '

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18020711/R1td3n2

i

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
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